CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

650 CANYON DEL REY RD. - DEL REY OAKS, CALIFORNIA 93940
PHONE (831) 394-8511 - FAX (831] 394-6421

AGENDA
JOINT MEETING OF THE CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY AND CITY COUNCIL
TUESDAY, DECEMBER 28, 2010 at 6:00 P.M.
CHARLIE BENSON MEMORIAL HALL, CITY HALL

6:00 P.M. - ROLL CALL - Council/Agency

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE

COMMUNICATIONS:

SWEAR IN MAYOR AND CITY COUNCIL MEMBER

PUBLIC COMMENTS:

Anyone wishing to address the City Council or Agency on matters not appearing on the
Agenda may do so now. The public may comment on any other matter listed on the
Agenda at the time the matter is being considered. There will be a time limit of not more
than three minutes for each speaker. No action will be taken on matters brought up under this
item and all comments will be referred to staff.

CONSENT AGENDA: Action Items
A, MINUTES:
1. November 16, 2010, Regular City Council Meeting
2. December 6, 2010, Special Joint Meeting RDA and City Council
B. MONTHLY REPORTS:
1. Claims, November 2010
Financials, November 2010
Fire Department Response Report, November 2010
Police Activity Report, November 2010

oW N

Page 10f 3



Del Rey Oaks Council Meeting — December 28, 2010

6.

10.

OLD BUSINESS: Action Items

OPEN PUBLIC HEARING

A. Consider Ordinance No. 271, An Ordinance Amending Chapter 15 of the Del Rey

Oaks Municipal Code which Adopts the City of Monterey Changes to the City of
Monterey Municipal Code:

AMENDING CHAPTERS 9 AND 13 OF THE MONTEREY CITY CODE ADOPTING
THE 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AND APPENDICESI AND J;

2010 CALIFORNIA HISTORIC BUILDING CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA ELECTRIC CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE;

2006 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

(Second Reading)

NEW BUSINESS: Action Items

A.

Introduce Ordinance No. 272, An Ordinance Amending Chapter 8.04 of the Del
Rey Oaks Municipal Code related to the adoption of the 2010 California Fire Code
with amendments thereto so as to be consistent with the City of Seaside:

2010 CALIFORNIA UNIFORM FIRE CODE

(First Reading)

Consider Resolution 2010-27, a Resolution of the City Council of the City of Del
Rey Oaks Approving Revised terms of reference for the Monterey County
Integrated Waste Management Task Force to enable reorganization of
membership and business practices to improve representation and
responsiveness.

STAFF REPORTS:

A. City Manager Report

MAYOR AND COUNCIL REPORT

CORRESPONDENCE:
A. Monterey Regional Waste Management District Board Meeting Highlights
B. Monterey Salinas Transit Board Meeting Highlights

Page 2 of 3



Del Rey Oaks Council Meeting — December 28, 2010

11. CLOSED SESSION: As permitted by Government Code Section 54956 et. seq. the
Council may adjourn to a Closed Session to consider specific matters dealing with
certain litigation, personnel, or labor/real property negotiations

A. Existing litigation pursuant to Government Code Section 54956.9(a), City of Del
Rey Oaks v. Federal/JER Associates, LLC et al., Monterey County Superior Court
Case No. M107509.

12.  SET NEXT MEETING DATE: Establish Tuesday, January 25, 2011, at 6:00 P.M. as the
date and time of the Council’s next regular meeting.

13. ADJOURNMENT in honor of former Deputy City Clerk, Kathy Bellum who worked
for Del Rey Oaks from January 1996 to July 2001. She passed away in June 2010.

Information distributed to the Council at the meeting becomes part of the public record. A copy of written
material, pictures, etc. must be provided to the secretary for this purpose.

All enclosures and materials regarding these agenda items are available for public review at the Del Rey Oaks
City Hall, 650 Canyon Del Rey Road, Del Rey Oaks.

Page 3 of 3



REGULAR MEETING OF THE CITY OF DEL REY OAKS CITY
COUNCIL CONVENED AT 600 PM. ON TUESDAY,
NOVEMBER 16, 2010 IN THE CHARLES BENSON MEMORIAL
HALL, CITY HALL

Present: Council Members Zuccaro, Cecilio, Allion, Vice Mayor Clark
Absent: Mayor Edelen

Also present: City Attomey Callihan, City Manager Dawson and Deputy City
Clerk Carvalho

Meeting came to order at 6:00 p.m. and roll call was taken.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
Council Member Cecilio led the Pledge of Allegiance

COMMUNICATIONS: None

PROCLAMATION:

Outstanding Public Service
City Manager Dawson: Presented a proclamation to Jim Clark, Kristin Clark
and Bob Ashton for assisting a fellow resident when they noted a fire in a garage
at 29 Los Encinos. They worked together to inform the resident, call emergency
services and put out the fire,

PRESENTATION:

Sydney Moe, Monterey Regional Storm Water Management Plan: She talked
about how Congress in 1972 amended the Federal Water Pollution Control Act.
The purpose of this act was to keep pollutants out of the oceans of the United
States by putting regulations in place to manage what goes into the storm water
runoff which ultimately runs into the ocean. She stated that Del Rey Oaks joined
the Monterey Regional Storm Water Management Program (MRSWMP). We
participate with many cities to meet the State and Federal requirements. These
are controlled by Best Management Practices (BMI’s). The City of Del Rey Oaks
has many practices in place, regular street sweeping, catch basins cleaned prior
to the rainy season, educating residents when they do construction what they
need to do to prevent material from going into the storm drains by giving them
leaflet’s on these practices. The City of Del Rey Oaks is represented by Sydney
Moe who is a Junior Engineer for the City of Seaside.

Council Member Allion: Asked who the committee reports to.



City Conneil Minntes of November 16, 2010 Continzed

City Manager Dawson: Explained that this committee has a very narrow scope
and is managed by the Regional Water Control District. He stated that Chief
Langford inspects businesses and enforces any illicit discharges. He stated that
the City of Del Rey Oaks is a catch basin because we get runoff from the Airport,
Monterey, Seaside and the County so we have to be diligent. Some of the
commercial areas have been test cases and our development will be impacted
down the road.

Public comment:

Kathi Buckley Smith, Del Rey Oaks: Has a recollection of catch basins under
the parking lot under Stone Creek and asked about the volunteers that help to
monitor the outfall.

Sydney Moe: Stated, yes there are volunteers that take water samples but Del
Rey Oaks’ is not truly affected because their outfall is near Canyon Del Rey and
Del Monte located in Seaside. Volunteers are recruited from the Monterey Bay
Marine Sanctuary; Alisa Emanuelson does the coordination of volunteers. More
information can be located at www.montereysea.org.

PUBLIC COMMENT:

Terry Adam, Del Rey Oaks: Thanked the City for the Dog Park. Thanked the
City of the improvements for the walkway from Portola to Work, thanked the
Police Officer that stopped her and gave her a warning rather than a ticket when
she was going to fast down Portola and thanked the Police Officer’s for how well
they handled Halloween with all the kids around.

Kathi Buckley Smith, Del Rey Oaks: Asked if the restrooms will be part of the
park grant, and asked for an update on what’s going on at the airport.

City Manager Dawson: Stated that he would answer those questions during his
report at the end of the meeting.

CONSENT AGENDA:
The Council considered the following items:
A. MINUTES:
1. October 26, 2010, Regular City Council Meeting
B. MONTLY REPORTS:
1. Claims, October 2010
2. Financials, October 2010
3. Fire Department Response Report, October 2010
4. Police Activity Report, October 2010
Motion by Council Member Zuccaro to approve, seconded by Council Member
Allion
There were no public comments received.
Motion passed 4-0

Page 2o0f 5



City Conncil Minutes of November 16, 2010 Continued

OLD BUSINESS: None

NEW BUSINESS:

The Council considered ITEM 9.A. Consider Resolution No. 2010-26, A
resolution of the City of Del Rey Oaks Canvassing the November 2, 2010 General
Municipal Election.

Vice Mayor Clark: Stated that this item will be continued because the votes
have not been certified by the elections department yet.

The Council considered ITEM 9.B. Consider Ordinance No. 271, An
Ordinance Amending Chapter 15 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code which
Adopts the City of Monterey Changes to the City of Monterey Municipal Code:
AMENDING CHAPTERS 9 AND 13 OF THE MONTEREY CITY CODE
ADOPTING THE 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AND APPENDICES I
AND J;

2010 CALINFORNIA HISTORIC BUILDING CODE;

2010 CALINFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA ELECTRIC CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE INCLUDING A-J; AND

2006 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

City Attorney Callihan: Each year the state comes out with changes to the
building code with local amendments to local ordinances being made. This is
just introducing this ordinance at this point and it will be noticed and be voted
on at the next meeting.

Council Member Zuccaro: Will we be adopting the green code also?

City Manager Dawson: Yes, or we would have to adopt the State codes.

City Attorney Callihan: These codes are set by the state and Monterey is only
amending this to make them more stringent.

City Manager Dawson: Stated he will have the Monterey building official do a
presentation at the next meeting.

Council Member Cecilio: Will this cost the resident’s more money?

City Attorney Callihan: Yes there is potential cost increase.

Vice Mayor Clark: Asked for a motion to introduce this ordinance.

Public Comment:

Kathi Buckley Smith, Del Rey Oaks: Asked for a brief presentation about how
this changes.

Page 30f 5



City Couneil Minutes of November 16, 2010 Continned

Motion by Council Member Allion to introduce Ordinance 271 and ask the
Monterey building official to do a presentation at the next meeting, motion was
seconded by Council Member Cecilio

There was no further public comment received

Motion passed 4-0

STAFF REPORT:

City Manager Dawson: Stated he attended a City Manager’s conference last
weekend put on by the California City Manager’s Foundation. He reported that
the Portola walkway dirt removal is done and within the next 2 weeks the
retaining wall will be finished. He stated that he would be meeting with
MuniServices tomorrow about how the fees and taxes have been collected from
the State and County. He attended the Airport workshop and learned about the
7 alternatives to extend the runway that are being required by the FAA. He was
very adamant about not closing the driveway to Tarpy’s and routing traffic
through Stone Creek which was one alternative. They are proposing to build a
retaining wall about 30 feet high with 600 feet of product to keep the planes from
going beyond the runway. There is a lot more work to be done on this and he
will update the council at the next meeting.

CITY COUNCIL REPORTS:

Council Member Allion: Stated he attended the MRWPCD meeting.

Council Member Cecilio: Stated he attended the Mosquito Abatement District
meeting.

Council Member Zuccaro: Stated he attended the opening ceremony of the
General Jim Moore Boulevard extension project.

Vice Mayor Clark: Stated she attended the MST meeting and stated they have a
new service, line 82 and 83 which connects Monterey with Paso Robles. She
announced that the new swipe cards will be going into effect and they will be
eliminating transfers having the fares more equitable by basing fares on mileage
and offering more miles when you buy a card in advance. She announced that
Angela Dawson (City Manager Dawson’s wife) was employee of the month and
there was a nice presentation a the MST Board Meeting. She announced the
annual Citizen’s Action Group Holiday Party is set for Saturday, December 5.

Correspondence: None

7:09 p.m.: Adjourned
7:13 p.m.: Reconvened into closed session

Page 40f 5



City Counrcil Minntes of November 16, 2010 Continsued

7:51 p.m.: Adjourned from closed session into open session and reported the
following;:

City Manager Dawson: Reported that information was given to the Council and
no action was taken.

7:52 p.m.: Meeting adjourned
Next meeting: Tuesday, December 28th, 2010, 6 p.m.

Approved:

Date:

Page 5of 5



SPECIAL JOINT MEETING OF THE CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
REDEVELOPMENT AGENCE AND CITY COUNCIL CONVENED
AT 6:00 PM. ON MONDAY, DECEMBER 6, 2010 IN THE
CHARLES BENSON MEMORIAL HALL, CITY HALL

Present: Agency/Council Members Zuccaro, Clark, Cecilio, Allion and
Agency Chair/Mayor Edelen
Absent: None

Also present: City Attorney Callihan, Agency Attorney Wellington, Executive
Director/City Manager Dawson and Agency Secretary/Deputy City Clerk
Carvalho

Meeting came to order at 6:00 p.m. and roll call was taken.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
Mayor Edelen led the Pledge of Allegiance

PUBLIC COMMENT: None

OLD BUSINESS:

The Council Considered ITEM 4.A. Consider Resolution No. 2010-26, A
Resolution of the City of Del Rey Oaks Canvassing the November 2, 2010 general
Municipal Election
City Manager Dawson: Congratulated Council Member’s Cecilio, Allion and
Mayor Edelen on their re-elections.

City Attorney Callihan: Stated the swearing in will take place at the next
Council meeting.

Motion by Council Member Clark to approve Resolution No. 1210-26, seconded
by Council Member Zuccaro

There was no public comment received.

Motion passed 5-0

6:07 p.m.: Adjourned. Council Member Cecilio and Mayor Edelen recused
themselves from closed session due to the proximity of their residences to the
project area to be discussed in closed session. They left the Council chambers
prior to the remainder of the Council reconvening into closed session.

6:09 p.m.: Reconvened into closed session

Page lof 2



7:03 p.m.: Adjourned from closed session into open session and reported the
following;:

City Manager Dawson: Reported that direction was given to Counsel to take
action.

7:04 p.m.: Meeting adjourned
Next meeting: Tuesday, December 28th, 2010, 6 p.m.

Approved:

Date:

Page 20f 2



Jo [ adeyg

GEOES — ] m [ H KTIZ8ND OH TYAEYD (2101
5e'9g$ INIWISHNGW TS SSINTIIM. | M ATMISAY 'OHTVASYD . SG/LL. l0LoZISLILL |
| | o ATHIFWIY o_._._<>mqo,
|
L R = | | P
68'006% W - N 11 HALYM NYOIEINY-VINYO4I YO 18101
68°007% o ] HIALYM NVOINIAY-VINGOAITYD  (6aZLLT 010208/l | | i
1 ” I HILVM NYIIHINY-YINHOAITYD'
| |
i | | ,
o/ 868 - ) S ~_ADOTONHOTL JLAS _.ﬂo%.
6/'¢6% _ SIIVa4N 3LISTIM ADOIONHO3L 3LA8]  89/LL ologroe/tl o L[
m _ [ ADOTONHD3IL ILAS
| i
| N . ]
[0°£47$ _ ) L T ~ ONI'sTTEINmoyE Elell
L0°LLes m SIELS MOINDAHAAYOT GF3JSHASY T ANY LHDIN TWOLLDY. __ CONI'STIINMOYE| lzoz11_jotozognt | | ‘
| “ONI ‘ST1aNMOYSE
| |
wgols | ] - - _ ) I A A I | 334LaNnoa B0l
£6'801% . SIAQTO XT14-OHIN, | . H_E.o.z.:om, 99LLL| |olozioe/ll _ | I S
| , 334l aNnog.
| |
0£'9vZ% ) I R | Nﬁz D LBLY ImoL
og'otes Ll _oloz .Emm m_zoI W I ) m 13N é.o qu. _|S9LLL o‘Eme:ﬁ )
: | Z 13N w2 131y
| W ,
zosies - I B [ B 7 is%hx30,8.7.%@4 1oL
20°8LES L ) SHD0T ad OL VA _ | ) A3X B 4007 YOIy iﬁt_ loweeny |
| P W o “A3M 2 MD0T NVORAWY
| | 7
BEGE2'2S ] A | o T | su3NIvINGD F9vMoLS Q3T (el
8E°562'2$  3AIHOMY] SHINIVINOD FOWHOLS 03| €971 L |0L0Z/0E/LL , _
_ INTFNNDOT 301704 ANY TIVH ALID H04 H3INIVINOD FDVHOLS! o - Ll 1] ] S
| _ SUINIVINOD IDVHOLS 3TV
_ _

o i oo o R S | e
0goegs R ] I A ll..T...- _ OV _Eot
09'992% ﬂw o mmmmmm >Z_ u_ma mmmoEE.w. mE:_EEn: | . AR T th:_ ,o@m\mm\t e | R |

| o _ h o<._h_£
| N |
oooges T S I . S N AN B N bt SVIOH _gﬁ
00°092% g ) g2 dg AM JuswAediano punisy | - mm& Svrod! i, m\m..“: o_om__.vo?.ﬁ 1 W o
m | | | 6g# - mq_.o”__
I B o | o ] f m - |
00°99% e - - ﬁ L - T N | £2# - NOSNHOM EE
ooses 1| aseds AN Jequiadaq 1) punay; H - o £2# - NOSNHOr | oweemont L [
_ [ N _ L ;mu.zOmz:o:
! f N ||
JUnowy owa allieN T WnN | ajeq T

0L0Z 1°eqU2nON
yoday swie|n

SMVO A3 1734 40 ALID




LJo 7 aideq

oz v2L$ — , . - ] W QU043 [SV00 SSTUAD 18101
9z vZL$ 20% TONYNILNIYA ONY HIVdTd I10HIA, QY04 LSYOD SSTUAD,  |8LLLL, 0102/08/1L |
| i Q404 1SVOD SSIHAAD
| |
E7AT S . o ) - R I S B SIM3INYLND 18101
£S48 ‘ o . SLVH ad| ) o SITIEINELNO|  LLLLL [OLOZ/OE/LL L o
| | | | ' s0113dnyLlnd
| | |
| ! |
6L601% m ) o ) - T n |_ 100 ¥ALYM SONIIDS WLSAYD e10L]
6L'601% H3LVYM/BS2950 10OV 00 YILYM SONIMAS ,_ﬁw\,mof-_'@ﬁ._.  lotozosrir ] |
, i "0 ¥ILVM SONIHAS TVLSAND
00orE B P ! 1| AL 40 WLISOH ALINNWWOD oL’
00'ovd ] 0L/91’801/6-334 MVAQ TOHODTY ooo._m . o ALIN 30 T¥LISOH ﬁ_z:_.\,._%.o lseiil jologoertt | Lo
! W ALW 40 TYLIdSOH ALINNIWIWOD'
LO'BELS L i o - B - T ﬁzﬁ%g Q33dS HOIH LSYONOD BloL|
8e LS _ ” 100 LANYIINL * LINY3INI 033dS HOH wm.qws_oo_ PLLLL| OLOZ/OE/LL _ -f R
£9'99% Lo L3S LINGAUNE L3INYALNI Q33dS HOIH LSYOWOD: | #PALL] 0L02/WO/LL | -
_ LANYALNI G33dS HDIH LSYIINOD
SR o o R R | _if ‘ ST, .
8L YE0'YS ! - b S o [ I 7 | ¥3MOL09D BjoL
60°L10'¢S W )  ANWEYE TVIN3A Vi13dolo3a, | - ¥amod-0o| jeutL _osmamE L
60°410'2% i ) WNINZYE TYINTA VL1300l AON] | o ¥3MOJ-03| _ |eveLl; [oloEmorLL \+ |1 o
i W 7] _ H3IMO0d-02
¥7'Sv0° LS I - e - ] mmb_%‘um ASNHOLLY qu_.&W 40 ALID [et0L
rr'ap0’ LS | 866/22 IDIOANI | SI0IAYIS AFNSOLLY ‘SYNITYS 40 ALID|  2LL : l0102/0erLL ! f
B | -SIDIAYES AINHOLLY ALID 0102 “L43S 40 JONYIVE ANV 100 | ) L % Ll
| | muu_>mmm AGNHOLLY ‘SYNITYS 40 ALID’
| |
| ! | |
00'007% L 11 - T >m_wm‘mmw_@_ﬁ ONY F34L 1SY0D TYHINIO | 12101
000074 " “OM SINEIA ONY GCOM TV AVMY TNYH ‘Qoy! AYTS YIGWIL ONY I3-L 1SVOD TvEINID.  LZ4LL]  [0L0Z/0S/LL | _
- LOOH QN S NI mmE:.v..wm_E.xqo 3AOWT * ¥I0L40d B OISO| |- o R . o
m AH3S HIFINIL NV 33HL 1SV0D .EEzmoi
0O051$ | 1 . - L [ L3NN383NILSTTIO EE
ooosts ! NOILYAYISIN QI TTZONYD AN Yavd ONN=3d| L3NNZE 3NILSTTIO| Coweeornt L1
i h i " [3NN3E 3NILSTTE0.

) | o | N SR U T T S R
00°00£$ — - R - __ONILYNINSZLXT HINSYD ol
00°008$ i oL/0 :g | ONILYNINGFLX3 mmzm<o_ ozt loloziertt i |

R DINDI ALID ZHOA38-Muvd IHL 1 TOMINGD LIHIVE MOTISA! _ o S B T +\ I
| | ONILYNINEILIX3 muzm,qu
N | e

unowy : RIETT ; alieN Twny aeq R I

0L0Z 412quanoN

poday swie|n
SMVO A3Yd 71340 40 ALID




JJo ¢aduy

££'87% ] il : , "~ ONIA1JdNS OLNY AZJILNOW BloL ]
£2'87$ S3744NS OLNY. ONI ATddNS QLAY ATYIINOW  S8/LL,  OLOZOE/LL | !
, _ "ONI A1ddNS OLNY ASHILNOW |
| : {
91'£9% ) - BN Lo T NIHVH IWYNIA [ 101
9L'€3% JUSLWISINGLUISY SSBUI9M| 1 NERTA R INVNIW, - ZGZLL 10log/al/LL | o o ,
W _ | | 7 NIUYM TAYNIA
. | N | ‘ S ] | | ”

EL'GES _ N ] - o e = Pl ONE 00 INIVd ROOW- AT | _Eob

£1'se$ | . s3ANddns, | ONI'OD INIV] FHOOW-ATTIM (68211, 0102/08/1L [

m , m ONI'02 LNIVd JHOON- .S,_mx_

_ _ | !

i g . ! : o R , [ — B
00'00$ ‘ L - o RN MIvHO =a SAWvr E0L
00°00£$ _ _aleg Ld3si o _ MIWHO 3QS3WWF|  splL ool L) -

| _ ! ” i | MIVHO 30 SAWvr|
! _ ! i _
00°52Z$ “ - - ) % - - T | 1T T - ._..mzo_::Om ENER-T
00°622% = IHOdTY ATHLNOW SSNSIA OL NV aNY WIN; SNOILMT0S 3| Eh:_ 7 0L0Z/08/L L % 7
| HLM LI3W ONILINSNOD SHOOS MOIND 0102 L43$90L 101 AN - ok * [t |
m _ SNOILN10S 3
1

| i |
26928 N ) o ] B o = - ...m.ﬂ_.mJ¢moJo _Eﬁ
25'9¢% o , m_zo.ln_ m:._mhqm ,Am‘: mgm._«..mol_w 1EBLLL _oﬁom_.om\ 1L | _ o

| | VSN ¥viSTVEo1o
| _
| | i

|

— ! S P N PR R O TR R S TEY. 11 s i A el
EI'L. | o L e = o e ! o _ m@&q@%lm.umzo;(z 1sdidieror
28'0LLE P o _$334 WNvS, _ FDMYHO MNVE TYNOILYN ISl | Ld43| olozEonL

[ O I 30uVHD YNV TYNOILYN LSHid

| | L
L6781 ! L - - .|." T - 1 \, ~ $301AY3S F0I0HD LSHId aaﬁ% *
157148 _ o mEm@mW@@ pue 294001 . S301AH3S 30I0HD kwm_m_ _128L1LL ,o loziog/iL | L
WwELLS | ~ sjusllipuod pue ssyon| o S30IAYES IOI0HD LSl aw/LL] etogwoLy Lo

_ ] ] S3DIAHES IDIOHD LSHI4

| | _ |
7£'802% N e 1 - - g SNOILNTOS ILYLST Tv3d NYOIE3WY LSYld jjeol
LUV0LS P 0102 100-B0IAM3S SSTAAY NYOS OuIIN| | SNOILTIOS 3LY1S3 Twad NVORIWY LSuId| [ 18LLL[  OL0ZIOE/LL | — sl
AESIES N 0102 143S-30IAYIS SSTHAAY -NYOS OFLaN| | SNOILNIOS 31VIS3 W3 NVOIHINY LSHI4 ._.mwh. LU ‘olozmoit 4 P

P T SNOILNTOS 31V1iS3 ,_ﬁ,_m NYDIHIWY hmm_.‘:

| i

i ]

. ! _ e | S i (. I ORI
00'6/% | | A - [ | NOLLYHOSHOD LOISUALNS _EE
00'6.$ | 0102 1d38-301AN3S INITNO F0I10d/96198% I010ANI] | I zo_Emomw_bm\Bumezu._ .-,.mmm_: 0l0Z/CE/LL | R

| | W , NOILYHOdHO0D Bmmmmpzu_
| | . _
2 _ S _ I e S S £ ey
¥E £0ES T o L 4_ * - [ S R U S o s NIACY zE@szm EE_
vE'LOES 7 ! : STDOVE JWVYN.: NI-083E900. >z_ | OO NINOYNNVANIING,  6LLLL o_o&@: 7 [ !
| W , | _ "00 NIAOH-NNYWNILNI

_ m

| i \

unowy _ GITET alleN . wnN ajeq N

0L0Z 49quanoN
yoday swie[n

SMVO A3d 134 40 ALID



LJo paduyg

HLTVaH-"S'd'3'd
ggyees . L Pl mmu.?ﬁw JONYNIS LNIWINDS 301440 [2101
8avEES 0L "AON-YIIE00 HOS INFWAYL ISYaT. SIDIAYAS JONVNIS LNTWGINDT J0I440 96411, OLOZ/OE/LL L
| muo:&mm 3ONVNI4 LNIWJIND3 301440
12 £863 ” ) ] ‘ R L | 10430 301440 E10L !
le'esss _ SHIANIS/SNIA TV /NS DOTUATIS WaLSH, | 10430 301440, S64LL 10L0Z/0E/LL f I _
_ | i | Lod3d uu_to“
| i ol .
LORATAIEY ” B S ‘ I ) C | 39000 ¥31SAMHO 4337 AN BIOL
voelets L STV HIVAEY ONY LOTHSNI ONY "D'/E9# HivdBa i 35000 YTTSAHHO S33r AW| [ 76LLL|  OLOZIOE/LL AN
i _ b _ 39000 Y3 TSAHHD d33r AN’
! | _
1 . - i . - | _
00'6ELS _‘ L o - __ .d.u:m_m_ 1usLwebeuRy 215eM [BUOIBSY AN _m_ﬁ
006513 L vS0dsIa m;wq._e) N<I_ o E_:w_a EmEmmm:ms_ 21SEM _mco,mmm..@ﬁ_ mmD Ll Jotoziog/t L i L
_ “Jouys1q Juawabeuepy aysep (euoiBay EHE
‘ L . : A ‘ |
5/°196% - L - 1] || S10NQOHd 301440 AVE AYLA _th
G/ 1S6% IOVSN Y3120 S10N30Hd 321440 Avd \rW_._.____,__ Nmn:m 0loefesLL _ | i
| 0U/6/6:01/01/9 €04 FOVHIAQ LOVHINGD FDINYIS 22628 AN | N u - Ll
| , ,ﬁ ! S1ONA0Yd 301440 AVE AULW
! |
L i _ - I } . B S SEST— |
£E°92$ W L ] S . R b | vodmuw el
LE'928 J 1 owemouuel | 8%&2 (16CLL: |0L0Z/0E/LL L ]
| 1 7 7 | _f _ vOdMYIN!
sgozius 1 T T . | _|...|..| E—— # | 2H13HS AINNQO ATUIINOW 15101
88°0¢L'L$ L OL/0E/9-0L/LE DNITNIE SIFDY \ﬂmuE%o N 44143HS ALNNOD AZWIINOW _ |06/1 __ joLozog/LL | o
i _1 7 44143HS
| _ , | ,ﬁ
00°5$ T ! - R I 1 vd ALNNOD ASHIINON 12101
00°LS 0L/Z216 ¥O3S YNNOYT LY ONvY 374iM 40 TWINTH| | SV ALNNOD AZSIINOW 68411 010Z/0g/lL | o
_ | _ | SHYHVd ALNNOD ATHILNOW
| 1
| L ~L, R _ : S
jcoost e el o —— mo_u_mo‘mvﬁm_w_\o\ﬁzgoo ATHILNOW €101 |
00°05$ _  0lOU/ILL VDO (SIuYH-DYIE.Z-(143808) NOILIWIX3 40 IOILON W 301440 SHITT0 ALNNOD h#_Hzoz SLLL _E@%\ Lt _ _
- ‘ S L ) I _ _ _
m , ﬁ ! | 301410 SY¥I1D ALNNOD ATHILINOW
pod , [
, _
e Ll L ST I I o
506793 % o LT - || SJD0TONHOAL AVE AYIINOW oL
50'679% | WMINTH NOILDILOM SOMIAMINIVLZY, A ~ S3D0TONHIZL AVE, ﬁmm;zog_ /88LLL; |0L0Z/0E/LL [
W L i S3ID0TONHO3L AvE m_x“.:.zoE
, ” ? i
00°01$ . o o - I - I <NoYD SHIDVNYIN VIUY AVE ASHALNOW [210L ]
0001% ; - L1-0L0Z SINA TYONNY! | dNOHD SHIDVNYIN YIMY AvE AWIINOW! /81l olozoentl | | | .
7 dNOYD SHIDYNYIN VIUY AVE Emmhzos_
unowy N oLBY e alwey “wnN aeg -
0L0Z 19qWSA0N

uoday swie[n
SMVYO A3d 13d 40 ALID




jo

g aseg

poday swie|)

SMVO A3d 130 40 ALID

26'629'08% . | 3IAIBG [|0UAR SHOOEHIIND 810

88'0/8'0E% 0102/t2/ | | U0 221898 ([04Ae4 Ag pajeal)) 20IAI8g lloiked wxoomxu_zo oﬁowxmmzﬂ

162183 0102172/ | uo 20Inlag |[ciAed Ag paieald) B2IAIBS ||0iABd SHOOGHOIND | 0l0z/mBEiLL

AT ARES 0102/72/1 L Uo 831AI9S [[0i4ed AQ pajesiD’ BIIAIRG ||01A2d SHOOSHOIND) | oLozse/LL _

06'€/5% ] olozmvelll uo 30IAIBG 8._.6& Aq paiesi] ” ERILVElS olhed mxoomv_u_zo_ 0L02/6e/LL |

08'€LG% | 0102172/ L U0 821nes ||oiAed Aq pajesl] | 2010185 [[01A2 SHOOFHIMD oLoesee/LL

00'856'% , 0102Z/72/11 U0 B2IAIBS || lolked Ag pejeasn | INBS Jloikeg miwmm_w_u_:c | . Oloereestl

0521% : yoea gz'1$ ' Amz_mo\n_\mmﬁfﬁ vl dojsed | mo_zmm [l0JAd oIy | H 0l0g/ez/LL _

00'vL$ : pled (s)eako[dwa | 1o mmu_, | ) . Q0IAIBS [l0ifeg syoogyaIny | | ologrezill |

55'86% I 010272/ 11 Uo 8a1Mas |joifed Ag umuwm.@ h 9IRS (|0IARS SHOOGHIND| | . olozieaill |

LL9Les I 0102/v2/LL Uo 30IAISS |j01Aed \.a|@mm_o, ﬁ S 30IAIBS |01hd SHOOEHIIND| _ ., oloz/eg/lL -

84°6% ) | 0L0Z/F2/ 1L Uo 23InI9g |j0ifed Ag uﬁmmku, mu,im.wl,._m;mn_ mv_oomv_u‘aﬁ | .oloefme/lL P .

90°6$ L 0L0Z/72/LL Uo 92M8S [[0ihed Ag pajesis| 2ajnia5 [j0shed SHOOBRIND | | jolozreerLL A ! |

90'6% | 0L0Z/pe/| L uo 213G [[ohed Aq u&mmé, L oINS |01hed SHoOgIND || _o_om_.mm:_, | , _

8z’ 1% uoeo Gz' 1S Je (s)ysodap 10841 | Jo} 20| A0IAIRS [|0JAR SYoOEHOIND ' 1 ] _Eom.a.w:ﬁ | _

00'6s pled (s)sakojdwia g ioj @24 | 20iAi8S [j01Aed SHOOEHIIND _ | joLogreeLL | |

Lrgas'ls | 0L0Z/SL/L L UO 90IAI9g [[0MAed Aq poresry | BOIAIDG [CIAR SHOOGHIIND . | | otoEsiiil

LE0es 0l0Z/SL/LL U adlnag ,_o&mn_\@‘mw‘wmm‘.._o. o mo_amm l1oihed SHOOEHOIND): :oEmﬁmE L | .

£0'8% _ 0l0Z/GL/LL uo aoineg (joifed Aq pajeasn | B0IAISS [|0IKBd SHO0GHIIND) | | 10L0Z/SLLL

LL'92S 0L0Z/GL/L1 U0 82IAI8g ||0Aed Aq pajeasy | ~ 90IAIBS [|0IARd SHOOEMAIND 1 |otoessil B

L% 0L0Z/GL/L1 U0 828 |j0iAed Aq pajesl]: | ) 80IMIS ||0iAey SHOOEHIN _lotozssirt P

oo'9g$ | 0L02/GL/L1 UC 821n18S |j0ked Aq pateaid] ) | 2uIMBg [loMfRd SHOOGMINDI | | (0L02/SLLL |

s | Yoes Ge'1$ je (S)usodap 1084 | o) 834! Sk = olog/sULL v !

00'L$ _ pled (s)eakoldia | 1o} 834, | 2InBS [[0AEd SH00BHOIND 0L0e/SL/Ll

PLGZE €S o 0102/01/1| U0 92IAIS |[DMed Ag pajesi). o _aolAleg Jjoifeg syoogeind| | joloz/el/iL

Se'vzeEs | ] 010Z/0L/L1L U 2IAISS ||olhed Ag pajess)y |  9Inag (joifed SHoogHaIMD | oLog/eL/LL

gce09'ls 0L0Z/0L/L | Lo 20IA9g [[oufed Ag pajeat). | acinag |joihed syooaind! | lolog/euLL i

6£ €858 ; 0102/01/1L1 U0 20IMBS llodAed Aq pereerd| _ .. @oinag joifed SY00gpIND. i i0Logfel/LL

6£'285% | QL0Z/0L/LL Uo ad1mag |jolhed Aq peljeai)| | 20IMIBS __ota@&oom_xu_:.o.. | | lolozrelitl

00°2EL'v$ - 0L0Z/0L/1L U0 8In8S [joiked Aq ptesi) | | _ Boeg |[0ed SHOOSHIND| | 0L0Z/2l/LL Lt ]

09'L1$ | yoea G¢' 1§ 1 (s)usodsp 1284p 171 10} mmu_, - mu_Emgm:.Amn_ sHoogxIND| | ESN\N..E | B il

00°GL$ W _.. Prd(s)estodun ) Joj883 | __ 013G [[oiked $H009XAIND] | lowgrutl |
o M 0102 12QUSAON 10} ¥D 40} 93] 212)S ON . MRS |loMed sfoogppInDl | oloerbLL |

00'69% ! 010z 12aWaAoN 10} 83} Buissasoid Alyjuciy 20IM9G |joiAed sHoogMIND: | | ologrL/LL ﬁ | o

| W ou_..cwm l10iked 300G _30

| | | ! |
62 Eves | o _r - .” i H3MO ISYHOENG. mu@@m&\mztn_ _EE
62'cres 0S0E9YE000060008 " LOOY mo&moa 4* . _ 43IMOd 3SVHOHN S3MOS ANLId 4._89 otoz/ogrll | _ . _

, | YIMOd ISVHOHN SIMOE AINLId.

_ | i !

i - I o S [ : T —
ceccies - | - N I ] 504 0L
EE'ELL'TS b 01/72/6-0L/71/8 D373 01/SL/6-0LIPL/8 SYD u L o m,w@.m_._l L86LLL | ol |

- ! | | _ | 3%9d’

R ” ] L
EraVANAES N T T ) - e | T Sy3d E10L;
GL'L37'8% | zo-aloz-oLloded. Lo . S¥3d| g6l zioe/Ll | _
££7259'8% L 10-0102-01 [Icihed o ~ sY3dl "mﬁ: _ _.o._om\g\: 4” | I
| i Lo | _ syad
| | |
- ml\_‘\\‘ | ! " i ! _ ) e -
52'852'52% L i - - _F: - 1 T HLWIH SY'Td BeL
28'909Is | ! 0102030 WNIWTHd HLTY3H! | B ~ HLWEW .m.mw.m._. [L6L11L 0102/0E/LL P
£ 159'21E 0102 AON WNINTHd H1TY3H: HLIV3H-SH3d E E | |
junowy Oway | aeN fwnN | ajeq :
0102 19qWanonN




Jugadey

uoday swie|)
SMVO A3d 734 40 ALID

ELEGLE . ] ] ' SIDINGS ZLIS QALINM B1oL]
erests MIEO NV1IGYD 1TTI0L IgvIHod, | SIDIAHIS LIS ILINN, 808LL  CLOC/OE/LL [ |
| S3ADIAYIS JLIS G3LINN
00°55% | . o I ) i 1] _ XINIAYAL 1B10L
00°6G% 0102/8-FONYNIINIYN ANV TOHINOD 1S3d. XINIWE3L  £08L1] ioawam\: - i)
, _ b XININYZFL
| |
00'001$ | o | M o - _ YITIOHINOD WINSO4IT¥D 40 3LVLS el |
00°001% | 0Log- moow OH_ZA ._.qu mm_jomhzoo vl szu:.?.o 40 m_._.q.rm i L Nﬁ: 0Log/Lo/LL ; |
, _ ¥ITIOHLNOD-VINHOAITYD 40 3LVLS
|
W o | L R |
00°'08$ REE EN IR © | L-G3gHs 1m0l
00°05% IDIAYIS ONIGATUHS, | ) LI-Q3uHS|  908LL; |0102/08/1L [ 11 1
, “ _ ” LI-a3dHs
, | | _
p0 1ves | B i L - ) o V N >z<n_s_oo U0 TIIHS (@10l
vO'Lyes W 0L 10O ¥04 13N4-£69-950-620 100v] _ ANVGINGD 110 TT3HS, | S08LL| j0102/08/L1 |
, ] | ,>z<n_s_ou 0 T13HS
(X | . . 1] g
AR ! o | S o RN ~ 3YOLS AYMI4VS [e0L]
e ! 00z S30VE. NS a3y, | e | 3MOLS Avm3dvs [postl] olozoent | | | R
m | 3dols ><>>m,._<w
i i 1 |
H | 1 | | _
651618 ] o B o Sat@ i .m.mwk.z_mn_ HONVY NVAY 12101
65 161% i © S3J0TIANT MOONIM! ﬁ ___ SHEINR HONVY NvAY| eogil lowozioeril N .
_ _ | | | SHIALNIMd HONVY NVAH ]
i . , |
| ] 1
= o » A
ooty ! S R 1T 1d3Q s34re3HS 3aISY3AR (B0l
C0£913 (122130 Ag pasinquiiay) Ug|INDA AL 40) BSIN0Yy S _un_mo S.4443HS QOmmZE BGLLL, [0L0B/SL/LL % o /
, i | i 1430 ’S.44183HS JAISHIAI
‘ W N _ ‘ W
veois R Ly o 1 | __ SIOHS DNIM O @il
veoLes 0102 NOSNHOT ‘SLO0S a0 HIVei3d ONY SLOOS >>uz _ o . _ SIOHS ONIM Q3! Now: Somam\.:.. _ (I |
m _ , | SIOHS DNIM a3y
| m | | L |
gz0es ] - - L - - LT T AY3S I3NHIING LAIHS a3 1BloL
Tl or4Y i 0Lz 1O0 LIANYILINI, o AY3IS LINGIINI L4IHS n_m_m_ 5| omm: ohom._g._: o _
| i | a AY3S 1INYILNI LAIHS a3y |
It = ! |
. - - g SIS ! H s <o
joooss | ] ! . o - _ | ONITAHY eyl
00085 0102/SIOIAYTS Hvavy Od aFak3oad. | . ONITAHNL _om: 010z/08/11 Ll !
7 _ "ONI “4'HH
| | i
Junowy RIET] alieN “Tlny a1eq ] ]
DL0Z J9quanon




Jo g sy

LE'0E6'PVLS | _ | ] _ Tvlol
| | | f |
ySopis - B N N A O | . 1LY "ONNOA [&10L
75'0vL$ | SMOANIM "Q'd HO4 TYINILYIW DNINYSES HO4 SLSOD W3y | g LLVIN "ONNOA;  (2SLLL 0L02/v0/LL [ I L
i _ ” W | _ 7 L11VIN ‘ONNOA
i W ,
| | i | ]
ZE LEES . e o oo L dsAmeL
99'891% ! 0102 "ACN NvTd NOISIA, _ __ dSA. [0l8LL  OLOZ/OE/LL _ | |
99'891$ ! . 0102 120 NYId NOISIA| ) dSA| 1611, 'Olo2mOrlL m
_ || T “ ? | dSA'
. | |
_ o — L | 0 T U B0 B
£E6LLS e I e .. | 4NO3N3QHYD ' MYS ATTTYA [EI0L]
EEBLLS. — SASSYIO ALTAYS ONY NIvHD! | . h\i@mzuomw.o.w.ﬁm..@.,_q\/_‘Lmom:. : Wo_omam\ S |
| b | dIND3 NIAHYD 8 MYS AFTIVA,
| 3 , m
, | - . _
wnowy i RITET i aweN Lwny ! ayeqg !

010Z 42qWan0N
poday swie|)

SMVYO A3d 134 40 ALID




CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

FISCAL YEAR 2010/2011 BUDGET VS. ACTUAL

July through November 2010

T - B " Actual Total for FY 2010-2011 % of Annual
' 2010-2011 Budget Budget
| ) REVENUE' o ) I
300 - Operating Revenues N - N
3100 - PROPERTY TAXES AR B ) T
‘3105 - P/T-SECURED - I $2,075.93 ~ $353,304.00 0.59%
13107 - P/T-UNITARY TAX - o T $5,533.00 .
3110 - P/T-UNSECURED - - $61.26 | §14,452.00 0.42%
| 3120 - P/T-SB813 - R N @5@;@ '
3130 - P/T-PRIOR SECURED - $2,450.94 §21,742.00 11.27%
'3132 - PRIOR UNSECURED B 1 ) ~$84.00 N
13135 - PROPERTY TAX - VLF R ~$121,084.00 o
13140 - P/T-INT/PENAL - ) 0 B 1 $328.00
'3145 - P/T - ADMINISTRATIVE FEE ] (3907.05) T (§7,500.000 ©12.09%
‘Total 3100 - PROPERTY TAXES - ~ $3,681.08  §511,689.00 0.72%
'3200 - OTHER TAXES B - j R '
'3202 - MANDATED COSTS o T $4,000.00 ,
3205 - SALES TAX -  $95,718.50 §255,000.00 37.54%
13206 - SALES TAXINLIEU - 3-FLIP_ ] L] $77,000.00 '
3208 - Sales Tax-AddOn - B ~ $162,688.88 | © $388,000.00 41.93%
13209 - COP MONIES - - ~ $30,506.10  §100,000.00 30.51%
‘3210 - PROPERTY TRANSFER TAX - - R ~ $5,000.00; a
13220 - GAS FRANCHISES - - 1 $7,000.00 ,
13225 - ELECTRIC FRANCHISES ] $15,500.00 | -
3235 - GARBAGE FRANCHISES ] $18,006.39 $40,000.00 45.02%
'3240 - CABLE TV FRANCHISES ~ §12,056.07 '$25,000.00 48.22%
"~ 3245 - WATER FRANCHISES ; ] j ~$9,000.00 -
.3851 - SEWER IMPACT ) i $8,500.00
‘Total 3200 - OTHERTAXES $318,975.94 ~$934,000.00 34.15%
13300 - LICENSES & PERMITS - ) - ; 1] _
3301 - BUSINESS LICENSES o ~ $163,390.31 $190,000.00 | 86.00%
13305 - BUILDING PERMITS - I $3,365.40 '§15,000.00 | 22.44%
13310 - PLAN CHECK FEES - i $2,002.81 ! $7,500.00 _ 26.70%
'3315 - STREET OPENING PERMITS FEES i $500.00 | | $2,500.00 - 20.00%
3325 - PLUMBING PERMITS i o ~§1,180.00 : | $1,000.00 . 118.00%
13330 - ELECTRICAL PERMITS - $200.00 ~ $1,000.00 _20.00%
13340 - ENVIRON ASSESS FEES/PERMIT - . $1,000.00
""3342 - DEVELOPER PYMT FEES/PERMITS 1 §500.00 ,
'3345 - OTHER LICENSES/PERMITS o $214.80 $500.00 42.96%
‘Total 3300 - LICENSES & PERMITS O §170,853.32 $219,000.00 78.02%
'3400 - FINES & FORFEITURES il - I
3401 - VEHICLE CODE FINES B $8,266.63 | $15,000.00 55.11%
'3415 - OTHER COURT FINES $1,000.00
‘Total 3400 - FINES & FORFEITURES ~ $8,266.63 $16,000.00 51.67%
'3501 - INTEREST EARNED i 1 $888.73 ~ $12,000.00 | 7.41%
13600 - OTHER AGENCY REVENUE R - o
3602 - MOTOR VEHICLE LICENSE FEE(MVLF) ] ~ $2,566.12 1$3,000.00 85.54%
3603 - OFF HIGHWAY - L - | - $100.00
3604 - HOPTR o N - S '$1,200.00 7
3605 - VEHICLE LICENSE COLLECTION - o $1,000.00 | -
3620 - PROP 172 - ] i . ~ $8,000.00,
3648 - GRANTS - o $25,000.00
'3649 - TRAFFIC CONGESTION RELIEF-AB438 _$4,129.61 $10,000.00 41.30%

Page 1 of 4



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

FISCAL YEAR 2010/2011 BUDGET VS. ACTUAL
July through November 2010

- - o Actual Total for ! FY 2010-2011 % of Annual
2010-2011 Budget Budget
3655 - POLICE GRANTS OTHER AGENCIES n RN $1,000.00
13600 - OTHER AGENCY REVENUE - Other B - $5.00 |
‘Total 3600 - OTHER AGENCY REVENUE —__ $6,700.73  $49,300.00 13.59%
'3700 - CURRENT SERVICES - _w ] e 1 _ )
3703 - USE PERMITS - ] ~ $2,485.00 | $3,000.00 82.83%
3704 - MAPS/PUBLICATIONS i | R $100.00
13706 - RENTAL INCOME i [ $4,252.50 ~ $9,600.00 44.30%
3707 - POLICE REPORTS ] $425.00 $1,400.00 . 30.36%
‘3709 - PROPERTY INSPECTIONS $600.00 $1,300.00 46.15%
3710 - POLICE SERVICES - o ~ $4,600.00 ~ §10,000.00 ; B 46.00%
‘3711 - PUBLIC EVENTS L - §32,400.00 $80,000. QQ L 40.50%
'3712 - MISCELLANEOUS SERVICES $3,539.60 $1,000.00 353.96%
'~ 3715 - PD DONATIONS B I ~ $609.24  §1,500.00 40.62%
‘3700 - CURRENT SERVICES - Other ! $300.00 - o
‘Total 3700 - CURRENT SERVICES B B T $4921134 $107,900.00 45.61%
13800 - PARKS/RECREATION o | ) B -
‘3801 - PARK RENTAL B | $1,400.00 | $10,000.00 14.00%
3802 - RV RENTAL PARKS © $11,200.00 . $26,000.00 43.08%
‘Total 3800 - PARKS/RECREATION $12,600.00 $36,000.00 "35.00%
3900 - OTHER o . L _ I
2103 - GAS TAX 2103 _ | $1,504.44 I
3610 - GAS TAX 2107 - ' $4,636.98 $13,500.00 34.35%
13612 - GAS TAX 2106 ) ! $3,939.57  $9,000.00 - 43.77%
~ 3614 - GAS TAX 2107.5 . i ~ §1,000.00 ~ $900.00 | 111.11%
13616 - GAS TAX 2105 | $4,494.09 $9,000.00 © _ 49.93%
3900 - OTHER - Other ' (54,678.08) !
‘Total 3900 - OTHER - $10,897.00 | $32,400.00 33.63%
[Tt T - TOTAL REVENUE | $582,074.77 | | $1,918,289.00 30.34%

Page 2 of 4



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

FISCAL YEAR 2010/2011 BUDGET VS, ACTUAL
July through November 2010

- R o Actual Total for FY 2010-2011 % of Annual
2010-2011 Budget Budget
B EXPENDITURES
10 - Operating Expenses - - -
10000 - Payroll & Benefits o R T T
;10009 - OVERTIME - $17,402.07 ' $25,000.00 69.61%
10010 - PAYROLL o [ $407,400.09 ~ §826,000.00 49.32%
71100101 - COUNCIL MEMBER STIPEND 1 52,597.45] $6,000.00 43.29%
100103 - RESERVES PAYROLL - - $18,407.22 $317i'€_>‘66 Il 58.05%
110011 - PERS - - e $83,043.47  $165,000.00 50.33%
110012 - MEDICARE o ~ $6,505.82 $11,000.00 59.14%
10013 - DENTAL EXPENSE ) _ 510,105.45 ~ $26,750.00 37.78%
10014 - HEALTH INS T $63,242.95 $132,500.00 . 47.73%
‘10015 - VISION INS - | ~ §843.30 $2,800.00 ) 30.12%
10016 - WORKERS COMP - ~ 557,857.66  $136,400.00 42.42%
‘10018 - WELLNESS PROGRAM - $4,402.92  $13,200.00 33.36%
10120 - UNIFORM ALLOWANCE $3,250.00 . $5,000.00 65.00%
Total 10000 - Payroll & Benefits ~ | §675,058.40 $1,381,360.00 48.87%
120100 - Payroll Expenses | | $713.87 $500.00 142.77%
i20119 - Bank Service Charges L $623.07 ~$500.00 124.61%
120120 - -SUPPLIES i ] - N o
20121 - MATERIALS/SUPPLY | $25,284.98 . | $43,500.00 | - 58.13%
120122 - REPAIR/MAINTENANCE | $13,162.45 | $20,000.00  65.81%
20160 - OFFICE SUPPLIES ] $2,631.64 $3,089. oo 85.19%
"'20120 - -SUPPLIES - Other o $141.65 -
‘Total 20120 - -SUPPLIES - $41,220.72 ~ $66,589.00 ~ 61.90%
120130 - UTILITIES & SERVICES i 11 '
20126 - STREET SWEEPING o B §5,991.04 §1,200.00 499.25%
20127 - GABILAN CREW . $1,608.66 ~52,000.00 80.43%
20131 - UTILITIES/PGE _$2,950.81 . §7,500.00 39.34%
120132 - UTILITIES/WATER B §862.13 | '$5,000.00 . 17.24%
20140 - TELEPHONE / INTERNET - ] ~ $4,606.30 .__+.______§l5_g_pp 00 0 30.71%
120145 - WEBSITE DESIGN & MAINTENANCE 1 $4,181.25 | $1,500.00 278.75%
20163 - BACKGROUND-TESTING o . 8145371 | 1 o
20168 - POSTAGE / SHIPPING | $1,049.18 $4,113.00 25.51%
20170 - TRAVEL/CONFERENCE B $2,747.70 ~ $9,500.00 | 28.92%
120171 - MEMBER/DUES/CONTRIBUTIONS  "s542739 $14,500.00 37.43%
120172 - AD/PROMOTION CITY CNCL © 1 81,378.45 ~ $1,500.00 91.90%
20173 - LEGAL ADVERT NON-DEPT - ~ §215.00 _$1,000.00 21.50%
720174 - BOOK/PERIODICAL N . %10000
20175 - MEETING CITY CNCL ) $443.75 $1,000.00 44.38%
‘Total 20130 - UTILITIES & SERVICES N $31,607.23 ~ $63,913.00 49.45%
‘20176 - PRINTING / PUBLICATIONS ) | . $500.00 00 L L
20180 - OUTSIDE SERVICES 1 | -
20178 - TRAINING POLICE - §4,465.21 1 | $8,000.C 00 g 55.82%
20181 - OTHER PERMITS PW/ENGNR' ] $3530  32,000.00 | 1.77%
20191 - EQUIPMENT MAINT B ~ $2,203.39 | ~ $21,500.00 . 10.25%
/30044 - LIABILITY/PROP NON-DPT ] _ $14,53276 52500000, 58.13%
30113 - CONTRACTUAL AUDIT 5 $5,262.50 $25,000.00 ~ 21.05%
‘30115 - DATA PROCESSING - 1 $2,159.04  $3,500.00 61.69%
'30116 - CONTRACTUAL SVCS PLANNING / ENG | $2,783.97 §25,000.00 11.14%
30119 - CONTRACTUAL SVCS - LEGAL R $3,076.48  $20,000.00 15.38%
‘30120 - CONTRL RETAINER LEGAL i §1,131.04 $12,000.00 9.43%

Page 3 of 4



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

FISCAL YEAR 2010/2011 BUDGET VS. ACTUAL
July through November 2010

130200 -

- i - Actual Total for FY 2010-2011 % of Annual
2010-2011 Budget Budget
30126 - JANITORIAL FUND | 3 ~ $§1,275.00 | ~$4,200.00 30.36%
130127 - RADIO DISPATCH POLICE 7 $38,259.50 | "$42,500.00 90.02%
30165 - COMM HUM SERV NON-DEPT B $3,057.00 1 [ $3,500.00 87.34%
‘Total 20180 - OUTSIDE SERVICES - ~ $78,241.19 $192,200.00 40.71%
130170 - AUTO OPERATION - - T T B
130181 - AUTO OPS - SUPPLIES / EQUIP $531.03 ~ $5,000.00 ) 10.62%
130182 - AUTO OPS - FUEL - §5,057.95  $25,000.00 20.23%
30190 - AUTO REPAIR/MAINTENANCE $4,161.08 '$19,000.00 21.90%
‘Total 30170 - AUTO OPERATION - ~ $9,750.06 $49,000.00 19.90%
;30180 POLICE AND FIRE - 1 ] - '
‘30183 - FUND JAIL & PRISONER ) $602.06 | $1,000.00 - 60.21%
‘30184 - ACJIS SYSTEM POLICE R ~ $1,406.24 ~ §1527.00 . 92.09%
1301861 - FIRE SEASIDE | $52,496.36 $116,000.00 45.26%
30187 - ANIMAL REGULATION FIRE - | $965.58 ©$2,500.00 ~ 38.62%
‘Total 30180 - POLICE AND FIRE - ~ §55,470.24 ~ $121,027.00 45.83%
STREETS & STORM WATER A B 7;;7;777 B )
130219 - S.M.LP. ) T $24.14 | $200.00 12.07%
30220 - SB 1473 - $9.60 |
/30230 - STREET LIGHTING o ~ §5,696.64 } ~ $17,000. oqi : 33.51%
30231 - STORM WATER PROJECT - PHASE1&2 $496.67 $5,500.00 9.03%
‘Total 30200 - STREETS & STORM WATER r ~ §6,227.05  $22,700.00 27.43%
/60001 - AUTO LEASE PAYMENTS D $19,970.61 ~ $20,000.00 0 99.85%
' __ TOTALEXPENDITURES §918,882.44  $1,918,289.00 . 47.90%
- - Total Revenue $582,074.77 o -
T - Total Expenditures $918,882.44 T
" Total Operating Revenue Less Expenditures This -
) Fiscal Year to Date ($336,807.67) o

Page 4 of 4



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
CASH FUNDS BALANCE REPORT
AS OF NOVEMBER 30, 2010

CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

' CASH BALANCES AS OF NOVEMBER 30, 2010

- 11000 - GENERAL CHECKING - L 524,815.01}7
1008 - LAIFCITY-246 o $342,540.36
Total City Checklng/Savmgs - ~ $367,355.37
- " REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY
- (j&SﬁHiBéLANCES AS__O_F _NOVEMBER 30 2010 B
10 1001 - GENERAL CHECKING 8518590
i 110-1003 - DUFFY EIR/CEQA CHECKING 7 . 520,778.47
| 10-1002 - LAIF RDAACCOUNT B $21,365.69
_ Total RDA Checking/Savings . 347,330.06
GRAND TOTAL CASH BALANCES $414,685.43

Page Lol 1



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
FISCAL YEAR 2010-2011 CAPITAL OUTLAY BUDGET VS ACTUAL
JULY 1, 2010 - JUNE 30, 2011

) Actual Totals for FY 2010-2011
2010-2011 Budget
;0ther Income/Expense L
Otherﬁgnle o - o -
. 4900-CAPITALOUTLAYFUND S
| . 3625-2000 PARK BOND GRANT I -
o, 3627 2002 Parks Resources Bond Act B 99,255.00
] 3720 - Portola/(_;g_rl_tgr'n_(ﬂ@p_l_p) cp - 400,000.00 |
Lol 3730 Porto_lg_/_!\lﬂlg\nl_alliwqy_{MPRPD) ] 12,500.00
| 3740 stream Blockage (State) N e
3750 Portola/Work Street (TAMC) - L o
3760 - Clty Monument Sign Proceeds i -
Total 4900 - CAPITAL OUTLAY FUND 511,755.00
777777'0ther Expense - .
1 50400 - CAPITAL OUTLAY - IR
RN 5042(}__MQ_NUMEN‘_I'_SIGN -
BEED '50430 - PORTOLA / CARLTON (PROP 1B) ] © 400,000.00
1 50440 - PORTOLA / WORK WALKWAY (MPRPD) 1250000
7 50450 -2000 PARKS BONDACT — an
|| 50460 - 2002 PARKS RESOURCES BOND ACT 1 ~99,255.00
| | 50470 STREAM BLOCKAGE (STATE GRANT) o
Ti /50480 - PORTOLA / WORK STREET (TAMIC)
BB Total 50400 - CAPITAL OUTLAY 511,755.00

Page 1 of 1



FIRE DEPARTMENT
1635 Broadway Avenue Telephone (831) 899-6790
Seaside, CA 93955 FAX (831) 899-6261

December 1, 2010

Chief Langford

Del Rey Oaks City Hall
650 Canyon Del Rey

Del Rey Oaks, CA 93940

Dear Chief Langford:

Enclosed is a copy of the response reports for the Seaside Fire Department response to Del Rey
Oaks for the period of November 1, 2010 thru November 30, 2010.

The City of Del Rey Oaks will be billed for the following incident numbers:

Incident #
10-1908
10-1911
10-1923
10-1925
10-1948
10-1956
10-1966
10-1969
10-1975
10-1991
10-2004
10-2026
10-2001

There are a total of thirteen fire calls for the month of November. If you have any questions,
please contact me.

Sincerely,

Wik (rr—

Kathryn Pemet
Sr. Administralive Assistant

CC: File



Alarm

Seaside Fire

Incident List by Alarm Date/Time

Date Between {11/01/2010} And {11/30/2010}

and District = "Q29"

Incident-Exp#

Alm Date

Alm Time

Location

Incident Type

=310-0001908-000
~—>10-0001911-000
-~310-0001923-000
~310-0001925-000
—>10-0001948-000
~310-0001956-000
~310-0001966-000
~$10-0001969-000
~)10-0001975-000
~310-0001991-000
-3 10-0002004-000

10-0002020-000
—X10-0002026-000

10-0002065-000
~310-0002091-000

Total Incident Count

12/01/2010

11/02/2010
11/02/2010
11/04/2010
11/04/2010
11/07/2010
11/07/2010
11/08/2010
11/09/2010
11/11/2010
11/13/2010
11/15/2010
11/17/2010
11/18/2010
11/24/2010
11/28/2010

13:53

11:
16:
10:
3.3
07:
19:
18:
16:
10:
10:
15:
20:
:16:00

12

16:
13

15

56:00
49:00
50:00
56:00
55:00
04:00
2B8:00
33:00
45:00
52:00
09:00
30:00

50:00
44:00

1007 PORTOLA DR /Del Rey
1007 PORTOLA DR /Del Rey
1007 PORTOLA DR /Del Rey
947 PORTOLA DR /Del Rey O
620 PHEASANT RIDGE RD /De
18 ALTA CIR

29 1.0S ENCINOS DR /Del Re
1048 PALOMA RD /Del Rey ©
22 CARLTON DR /Del Rey Oa
815 CANYON DEL REY BLVD /
22 LOS ENCINOS DR /Del Re
826 PORTOLA DR /Del Rey O
1027 PORTOLA DR /Del Rey
831 ROSITA RD /Del Rey Oa
435 CANYON DEL REY BLVD /

e
\’bt/'

412
500
321
510
321
321
111
4471
321
400
321

Gas leak

Service Call,

EMS call,
Person in
EMS call,
EMS call,

(natural gas or LPG

other
excluding vehicle
distress, Other
excluding vehicle
excluding vehicle

Building fire

Heat from
EMS call,
Hazardous
EMS call,

short circuit (wir
excluding vehicle
condition, Other

excluding vehicle

6111 Cancelled upon arrival, no

321

EMS call,

excluding vehicle

621 Wrong location

321

EMS call,

excluding vehicle

Page 1



Del Rey Oaks Police Department
Monthly Report of Activity
NOVEMBER - 2010
Completed By: Ron Langford, COP

ARRESTS: Prior Year
Felony Arrests 02
Misdemeanor Arrests
Warrant Arrests (OJ)
TOTAL ARRESTS 02 04
REPORTS FILED:

19 [ 11 ]
BURGLARIES: Prior Year
Residential 02
Commercial
From Locked Vehicle
Other
TOTAL BURGLARIES 02 01
GRAND & PETTY THEFTS: Prior Year
Residential
Commercial
Shoplifting 01
From Motor Vehicle
Other 01
TOTAL THEFTS 02 02
CITATIONS ISSUED: Prior Year
Traffic Citations Issued 22
Parking Citations Issued
Admin Citations Issued 01
TOTAL CITATION ISSUED 23 16

ASSAULTS: Prior Year

Simple Assault 01

Domestic Violence

Weapon Involved

TOTAL ASSAULTS 01 00

TRAFFIC ACCIDENTS: Prior Year

Non-Injury Accidents 02

Injury Accidents 01

TOTAL ACCIDENTS 03 02

TOWED & STORED VEHICLES: Prior Year
03 01

ALARMS: Prior Year

Residential

Commercial

TOTAL ALARMS 00 00

DUI ENFORCEMENT: Prior Year
00 00

Storm Water Violation



REPORT TO THE
CITY COUNCIL
City of Del Rey Oaks, California

DATE: December 28, 2010

FROM: Christopher A. Callihan, City Attorney

SUBJECT: 2010 BUILDING CODE AND FIRE CODE ADOPTION
RECOMMENDATION:

It is recommended that the City Council adopt an ordinance amending Chapter 15 of the Del Rey Oaks
Municipal Code related to the adoption of the 2010 California Building Code and related building construction
codes, appendices, amendments, and referenced standards thereto.

It is also recommended that the City Council introduce an ordinance amending Chapter 8.04 of the Del Rey
Oaks Municipal Code related to the adoption of the 2010 California Fire Code with amendments thereto.

DISCUSSION:

Building Code

The California Building Standards Commission adopts various codes and standards to serve as the California
Building Code and related building construction codes, appendices, and reference standards including State of
California amendments that apply throughout the state. Any building standards adopted by the state can be
amended locally as reasonably necessary and based on local geologic, climatic or topographic conditions as set
forth in California Health and Safety Code sections 17922, 17958.5, and 17958.7.

As Council is aware, the City of Del Rey Oaks contracts with the City of Monterey to provide building services,
plan check services, and inspection services. As the City of Del Rey Oaks is similarly situated to the City of
Monterey with respect to local geologic, climatic, and topographic conditions, and to provide regional
consistency, the proposed ordinance has incorporated the building standards codes and local amendments
adopted by the City of Monterey. Additionally, in order to bring the City of Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code up to
date and consistent with the proposed ordinance several existing chapters of the Municipal Code must be
repealed. Those chapters are individually listed in the proposed ordinance.

Fire Code

The State of California adopts a model code to serve as the California Fire Code. The most recent version,
applicable throughout the state, is the California Fire Code, 2010 edition. As with the building standards
codes, the City of Del Rey Oaks is authorized by the California Health and Safety Code to make local
amendments to the model code provided such amendments are justified by local geologic, climatic or
topographic conditions.

As the Council is also aware, the City of Seaside provides fire protection services to the City of Del Rey Oaks
pursuant to a fire protection contract. Section 3 of the fire protection contract obligates the City of Del Rey
Oaks to “adopt and maintain in effect an ordinance adopting the most current Uniform Fire Code with

1



amendments consistent with those adopted by Seaside.” And, as the City of Del Rey Oaks is similarly situation
with the City of Seaside with respect to local geologic, climatic, and topographic conditions, it is appropriate
for the City of Del Rey Oaks to adopt the same fire code and local amendments as those adopted by the City of
Seaside. As with the building standards codes, in order to bring the City of Del Rey Oaks Municipal Cade up to
date and consistent with the proposed ordinance Chapter 8.04 of the Municipal Code must be amended in its
entirety.

ISSUES:

1. Shall the City Council adopt an ordinance amending Chapter 15 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code
related to the adoption of the 2010 California Building Code and related building construction codes,
appendices, amendments, and referenced standards thereto so as to be consistent with the City of
Monterey? This ordinance was introduced by the City Council at its regular meeting of November 16,
2010.

2. Shall the City Council introduce an ordinance amending Chapter 8.04 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal
Code related to the adoption of the 2010 California Fire Code with amendments thereto so as to be
consistent with the City of Seaside? This ordinance must first be introduced by the City Council for
adoption at a subsequent City Council meeting.

FISCAL IMPACT:

There is no direct impact to the City’s General Fund with the City Council’s introduction and adoption of the
proposed ordinances.

TIME CONSIDERATIONS:

Time is of the essence as the state model codes are effective January 1, 2011, and the local amendments will
not become effective until thirty (30) days following the City Council’s adoption of the ordinances
implementing those local amendments.

ALTERNATIVES:

Council may choose to neither introduce nor adopt the proposed ordinances.

Distribution: Back Up Pages:
City Council Proposed Ordinances
City Manager



ORDINANCE NO. 271

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 15 OF THE DEL REY OAKS MUNICIPAL CODE RELATED TO THE
ADOPTION OF THE 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AND RELATED BUILDING CONSTRUCTION
CODES, APPENDICES, AMENDMENTS, AND REFERENCED STANDARDS THERETO

WHEREAS, the City of Del Rey Oaks has contracted with the City of Monterey to provide
building services, plan check and inspections; and

WHEREAS, the City Council of Del Rey Oaks desires to update its laws pertaining to building
safety in Del Rey Oaks by adopting updated standard codes which are consistent with those standard
codes implemented and enforced in the City of Monterey; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to Sections 17922, 17958, 17958.5 and 17958.7 of the California Health
and Safety Code, the City of Del Rey Oaks may adopt local changes and modifications to the California
Building Codes when the City makes findings that the local changes and modifications are reasonably
necessary because of the local climatic, geographic, and topographical conditions; and

WHEREAS, the factual findings made in the past continue to be valid and relate to the
amendments made to the standard codes in this adoption; and

WHEREAS, the City of Del Rey Oaks has made an environmental finding that the current City of
Monterey green building program as compared to title 24, Part 11 also known as Cal Green, is
determined to be more restrictive; and

WHEREAS, this Ordinance was found to be categorically exempt from environmental review,
per the provisions of Section 15061(b)(3) of the California Environmental Quality Act (“CEQA”) of 1970,
as amended; and

WHEREAS, the provisions of the 2010 editions of the California Building Code and Appendices |
and J, the California Historic Building Code, the California Mechanical Code, the California Plumbing
Code, the California Electrical Code, the 2006 International Property Maintenance Code, and the 2010
Existing Building Code, as adopted and amended herein, shall not apply to any building or structure for
which application for a building permit was made prior to January 1, 2011. Such buildings or structures
shall be erected, constructed, enlarged, altered or repaired in accordance with the provisions of this
chapter in effect at the date of said application; and

WHEREAS, all other applications not covered by the previous recital shall be processed in
accordance with the provisions of the 2010 editions of the California Building Code and Appendices |
and J, the California Historic Building Code, the California Mechanical Code, the California Plumbing
Code, the California Electrical Code, the 2006 International Property Maintenance Code, and the 2010
Existing Building Code, all as adopted and amended in this ordinance.

NOW THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF DEL REY OAKS AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. Chapter 15.01 is added to the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code to read as follows:

City of Del Rey Oaks Pagelof6
2010 Building Code Update
December 28, 2010



Sec. 15.04.010. Building Code.
Except as otherwise amended by Title 15 of this Municipal Code Code, the following model codes are
hereby adopted and are incorporated in this chapter by reference and made a part hereof as if fully set
forth herein:

1. 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AND APPENDICES |, J;

2. 2010 CALIFORNIA HISTORIC BUILDING CODE;

3. 2010 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE;

4. 2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE;

5. 2010 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE;

6. 2010 CALIFORNIA ELECTRIC CODE;

7. 2010 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE;

8. 2010 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AND APPENDICES A-J

9. 2006 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

SECTION 2: Chapter 15.04 of the Del Rey Oaks Code is hereby deleted in its entirety and is replaced with
the following which shall read as follows:

Sec. 15.04.010. Amendments to California Building Code.
(a) Section 105.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 105.3.2 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is issued within 180 days
following the date of the application shall expire, and plans and other data submitted for review may
thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the building official. The building official may
extend the time for action by the applicant for a period not exceeding 180 days on written request by
the applicant showing that circumstances beyond control of the applicant have prevented action from
being taken and the extension has been submitted in writing prior to the expiration date.

If a permit has not been obtained after the first extension, additional extensions of 90 days may be
granted provided the applicant submits this request in writing AND pays a fee equal to $500.00 of the
for each requested 90- day extension and the project has not changed in scope.

Exception: If a project has been approved by the City pending an outside agency approval prior to
expiration, written extensions will not be required.

(b) Section 105.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 105.5 Expiration of Permits. Every permit issued by the building official under the provisions of
the technical codes shall expire and become null and void, if the project authorized by such permit has
City of Del Rey Oaks Page 2 of 6

2010 Building Code Update

December 28, 2010



not achieved an approval for one of the required inspections identified in Section 110.3 of the 2010
California Building Code within one year of such permit.

The building official may grant a one-time permit extension of 180 (one-hundred eighty) days provided
the applicant submits a request in writing prior to the permit expiration and the project has not
changed in scope. Additional extension requests of 90 (ninety) days may be granted by the building
official if the request is made in writing, the project has not changed in scope, the project has obtained
at least one inspection approval AND the applicant pays a fee of $1,000 for each ninety (90) day
extension.

Before work can commence or recommence under an expired permit, a new permit application must be
submitted and permit obtained along with all applicable fees applied for this new project.

All existing projects are subject to this section and will be subject to the conditions listed above.
(c) Section 1505.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 1505.1.1 Real Coverings within ALL Fire Hazard Severity Zones. Any new roof on a new or
existing structure, and any re-roofing of an existing structure of 50% or more of the total roof area
within a one-year period shall be of a fire retardant roof or class A roof.

Sec. 15.04.020. Amendments to 2010 California Residential Code.
(a) Section R105.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R105.3.2 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is issued within 180 days
following the date of the application shall expire, and plans and other data submitted for review may
thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the building official. The building official may
extend the time for action by the applicant for a period not exceeding 180 days on written request by
the applicant showing that circumstances beyond control of the applicant have prevented action from
being taken and the extension has been submitted in writing prior to the expiration date.

If a permit has not been obtained after the first extension, additional extensions of 90 days may be
granted provided the applicant submits this request in writing AND pays a fee equal to $500.00 of the
for each requested 90- day extension and the project has not changed in scope.

Exception: If a project has been approved by the City pending an outside agency approval prior to
expiration, written extensions will not be required.

(b) Section R105.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R105.5 Expiration of Permits. Every permit issued by the building official under the provisions
of the technical codes shall expire and become null and void, if the project authorized by such permit
has not achieved an approval for one of the required inspections identified in Section 110.3 of the 2010
California Building Code within one year of such permit.

The building official may grant a one-time permit extension of 180 (one-hundred eighty) days provided
the applicant submits a request in writing prior to the permit expiration and the project has not
changed in scope. Additional extension requests of 90 (ninety) days may be granted by the building
City of Del Rey Oaks Page 3 of 6

2010 Building Code Update

December 28, 2010



official if the request is made in writing, the project has not changed in scope, the project has obtained
at least one inspection approval AND the applicant pays a fee of $1,000 for each ninety (90) day
extension.

Before work can commence or recommence under an expired permit, a new permit application must be
submitted and permit obtained along with all applicable fees applied for this new project.

All existing projects are subject to this section and will be subject to the conditions listed above.
(c) Section R313.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R313.2 One-and Two-Family Dwellings Automatic Fire Systems. New one- and two-family
dwellings, an automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed, or to which additions,
alterations, or repairs are made that involve the removal or replacement to 50 percent or greater of the
linear length of walls of the building (exterior plus interior) within a one-year period shall meet the
requirements of new construction or this code.

Exception:

(1) One-and two-family dwelling buildings with less than 1500 square feet where an addition will
not increase the total square footage to more than 1500 square feet, unless the increase involves a
second story (in this case, the 50% linear wall length rule would apply to determine if the project would
need an automatic fire sprinkler system).

(d) Section R403.1.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R403.1.3 Seismic Reinforcing. Concrete footings located in Seismic Design Categories DO, D1
and D2, as established in Table R301.2(1), shall have minimum reinforcement of at least two continuous
longitudinal reinforcing bars not smaller than No. 4 bars. Bottom reinforcement shall be located a
minimum of 3 inches (76 mm) clear from the bottom of the footing.

In Seismic Design Categories DO, D1 and D2 where a construction joint is created between a concrete
footing and a stem wall, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be installed at not more than 4 feet (1219
mm) on center. The vertical bar shall extend to 3 inches (76 mm) clear of the bottom of the footing,
have a standard hook and extend a minimum of 14 inches (357 mm) into the stem wall.

In Seismic Design Categories D0, D1 and D2 where a grouted masonry stem wall is supported on a
concrete footing and stem wall, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be installed at not more than 4 feet
(1219 mm) on center. The vertical bar shall extend to 3 inches (76 mm) clear of the bottom of the
footing and have a standard hook.

In Seismic Design Categories DO, D1 and D2 masonry stem walls without solid grout and vertical
reinforcing are not permitted.

Exception: In detached one- and two-family dwellings which are three stories or less in height and
constructed with stud bearing walls, isolated plain concrete footings supporting columns, or pedestals
are permitted.

(e) Section R902.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:
City of Del Rey Oaks Page 4 of 6
2010 Building Code Update
December 28, 2010



Section R902.1.1 Real Coverings within ALL Fire Hazard Severity Zones. Any new roof on a new or
existing structure, and any re-roofing of an existing structure of 50% or more of the total roof area
within a one-year period shall be of a fire retardant roof or class A roof.

SECTION 3. Chapter 15.08 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety.
SECTION 4, Chapter 15.12 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety.
SECTION 5. Chapter 15.16 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety.

SECTION 6. Chapter 15.20 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code is hereby deleted in its entirety and is
replaced with the following which shall read as follows:

Sec. 15.20.010. Amendments to California Plumbing Code.
(a) Section 710.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 710.1 In every case where the outlet of a trap for a plumbing fixture is installed or located at an
elevation which is less than two feet (2') above the rim of the nearest manhole uphill from the point of
connection of the building sewer to the public sewer in any new or existing drainage system, approved
types of backwater valve, relief vent and cleanout approved shall be installed in the building sewer at
the point of lowest elevation of the ground surface of the building site outside of the building or at such
other location as is permitted by the Building Inspector, providing that at any such location, the
elevation of the ground surface is not less than two (2') below the lowest trap outlet served by the
building sewer.

The installation shall consist of an approved fresh air inlet and a Y branch or combination fitting
installed in sequence in the line of flow from the building. The vent from this fresh air inlet shall be
piped to the ground surface and capped with a vent cap. Provision shall be made by elevation above
the ground or by other means for preventing the obstruction of the vent opening or the flow of water
therein. The cleanout shall be placed as close to the valve as is practical and shall be piped to within
one foot (1') of the ground surface and closed with an approved cleanout plug. Every existing
installation which includes a plumbing fixture trap outlet which is less than two feet (2') above the rim
of the nearest manhole uphill from the point of connection of the building sewer to the public sewer is
hereby declared to be dangerous, unsanitary and a menace to life, health and property. Whenever it
shall come to the attention of the Building Inspector that such an installation exists, he or she is hereby
empowered to order and require that such plumbing outlet be immediately plugged or capped, or that
the equipment described in the preceding paragraph of this section be installed immediately.”

SECTION 7. Chapter 15.24 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety.
SECTION 8. Chapter 15.28 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code is hereby repealed in its entirety.
SECTION 9: All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby repealed.

SECTION 10. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is for any reason
held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a decision of any court of any competent jurisdiction, such
decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this ordinance. The Del Rey Oaks City

City of Del Rey Oaks Page 5 of 6
2010 Building Code Update
December 28, 2010



Council hereby declares that it would have passed this ordinance, and each and every section,
subsection, clause and phrase thereof not declared invalid or unconstitutional without regard to
whether any portion of the ordinance would be subsequently declared invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION 11. The City Clerk of the City of Del Rey Oaks is hereby directed to cause the following
summary of this ordinance to be published by one (1) insertion in ,a
newspaper of general circulation circulated in the City of Del Rey Oaks and hereby designated for that
purpose by the Council of Del Rey Oaks:

Title 15 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code is hereby amended with regard to updates
to the Building Code, the California Historic Building Code, the California Existing
Building Code, the California Residential Code, the California Plumbing Code, the
California Electrical Code, the California Mechanical Code, the California International
Property Maintenance Code, and the California Fire Code.

SECTION 12. This ordinance shall be in full force and effect on January 27, 2011.

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DEL REY OAKS this 28th day of December,
2010, by the following vote:

AYES:
NOES:
ABSTAIN:

ABSENT:

APPROVED:

Mayor

ATTEST:

City Clerk

City of Del Rey Oaks Page 6 of 6
2010 Building Code Update
December 28, 2010



REPORT TO THE
CITY COUNCIL
City of Del Rey Oaks, California

DATE: December 28, 2010

FROM: Christopher A. Callihan, City Attorney

SUBJECT: 2010 BUILDING CODE AND FIRE CODE ADOPTION
RECOMMENDATION:

It is recommended that the City Council adopt an ordinance amending Chapter 15 of the Del Rey Oaks
Municipal Code related to the adoption of the 2010 California Building Code and related building construction
codes, appendices, amendments, and referenced standards thereto.

It is also recommended that the City Council introduce an ordinance amending Chapter 8.04 of the Del Rey
Oaks Municipal Code related to the adoption of the 2010 California Fire Code with amendments thereto.

DISCUSSION:

Building Code

The California Building Standards Commission adopts various codes and standards to serve as the California
Building Code and related building construction codes, appendices, and reference standards including State of
California amendments that apply throughout the state. Any building standards adopted by the state can be
amended locally as reasonably necessary and based on local geologic, climatic or topographic conditions as set
forth in California Health and Safety Code sections 17922, 17958.5, and 17958.7.

As Council is aware, the City of Del Rey Oaks contracts with the City of Monterey to provide building services,
plan check services, and inspection services. As the City of Del Rey Oaks is similarly situated to the City of
Monterey with respect to local geologic, climatic, and topographic conditions, and to provide regional
consistency, the proposed ordinance has incorporated the building standards codes and local amendments
adopted by the City of Monterey. Additionally, in order to bring the City of Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code up to
date and consistent with the proposed ordinance several existing chapters of the Municipal Code must be
repealed. Those chapters are individually listed in the proposed ordinance.

Fire Code

The State of California adopts a model code to serve as the California Fire Code. The most recent version,
applicable throughout the state, is the California Fire Code, 2010 edition. As with the building standards
codes, the City of Del Rey QOaks is authorized by the California Health and Safety Code to make local
amendments to the model code provided such amendments are justified by local geologic, climatic or
topographic conditions.

As the Council is also aware, the City of Seaside provides fire protection services to the City of Del Rey Oaks
pursuant to a fire protection contract. Section 3 of the fire protection contract obligates the City of Del Rey
Oaks to “adopt and maintain in effect an ordinance adopting the most current Uniform Fire Code with

1



amendments consistent with those adopted by Seaside.” And, as the City of Del Rey Oaks is similarly situation
with the City of Seaside with respect to local geologic, climatic, and topographic conditions, it is appropriate
for the City of Del Rey Oaks to adopt the same fire code and local amendments as those adopted by the City of
Seaside. As with the building standards codes, in order to bring the City of Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code up to
date and consistent with the proposed ordinance Chapter 8.04 of the Municipal Code must be amended in its
entirety.

ISSUES:

1. Shall the City Council adopt an ordinance amending Chapter 15 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code
related to the adoption of the 2010 California Building Code and related building construction codes,
appendices, amendments, and referenced standards thereto so as to be consistent with the City of
Monterey? This ordinance was introduced by the City Council at its regular meeting of November 16,
2010.

2. Shall the City Council introduce an ordinance amending Chapter 8.04 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal
Code related to the adoption of the 2010 California Fire Code with amendments thereto so as to be
consistent with the City of Seaside? This ordinance must first be introduced by the City Council for
adoption at a subsequent City Council meeting.

FISCAL IMPACT:

There is no direct impact to the City’s General Fund with the City Council’s introduction and adoption of the
proposed ordinances.

TIME CONSIDERATIONS:

Time is of the essence as the state model codes are effective January 1, 2011, and the local amendments will
not become effective until thirty (30) days following the City Council’'s adoption of the ordinances
implementing those local amendments.

ALTERNATIVES:

Council may choose to neither introduce nor adopt the proposed ordinances.

Distribution: Back Up Pages:
City Council Proposed Ordinances
City Manager



ORDINANCE NO. 272

AN ORDINANCE AMENDING CHAPTER 8.04 OF THE DEL REY OAKS MUNICIPAL CODE RELATED
TO THE ADOPTION OF THE 2010 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE WITH AMENDMENTS THERETO

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Del Rey Oaks desires to update its laws
pertaining to fire prevention in Del Rey Oaks by adopting and amending the 2010 California Fire
Code hy reference in Chapter 8.04 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code; and

WHEREAS, the 2010 California Fire Code becomes effective on January 1, 2011; and

WHEREAS, pursuant to California Health and Safety Code sections 17922, 17958,
17958.5, and 17958.7 the City may adopt the provisions of the California Fire Code and related
California codes with certain amendments which are reasonably necessary to protect the health,
welfare, and safety of the residents of Del Rey Oaks because of local climatic, geological, and
topographical conditions; and

WHEREAS, the City Council desires to make local changes and maodifications and finds
that such changes and modifications are reasonably necessary because of the following local
geological, topographical, and climatic conditions:

1. Climatic. The climatic weather patterns within the city of Del Rey Oaks are
considered to be moderately affected by the ocean bodies of the Pacific Ocean,
particularly Monterey Bay, which extend the year-round growing season of
vegetation. The normal year’s rainfall is approximately eighteen (18) inches on the
average yearly calendar. Summer conditions with the prevalent Pacific High Cell
create the mid-day fog normally associated with Seaside. This climatic fog assists
the natural vegetation growth.

Later in the year, the winds and drying vegetation mix to create a hazardous fuel
condition which has caused grassland and brushland fires in recent years. While
normal temperatures usually do not exceed 75-80 degrees, during late summer and
early fall (August, September, October) the temperatures can climb to 90 degrees
plus. The afternoon winds can move a fire quickly in the city limits and outlying
areas that once were Fort Ord.

Due to storage capacities and consumption, as well as climatic conditions, limited
water resources are an issue. While sound management of the water resources is
possible, actual demands on an already stressed water supply can most assuredly be
predicted.

2. Geological. Seismic activity within the city of Del Rey Oaks occurs yearly with little
or no damage, although real potential for damage does exist with four local active
faults. New construction may be limited by its respective distance to such faults,
and replacement of existing structures could be costly. The region is located in an
area of high seismic activity as indicated by the United States Geological Survey.
Recent earthquake activity has indicated the lack of flexibility of materials and
building systems has been a contributing factor to damages that reduced the
protection of the life-safety of building occupants and increased the cost of
rehabilitation of structures. Activities have indicated the need for increased levels

City of Del Rey Oaks Page 1 of 10
2010 Fire Code Update
December 28, 2010



of safety in building systems including, but not limited to, means of egress, wiring
systems, and fire protection systems.

3. Topographical. The findings in this section are caused by the construction and
design of the city of Del Rey Oaks due to elevation changes, as well as the
mountains, hills, and canyons that dissect the city with the addition of a portion of
the former Fort Ord military base that is now considered to be a part of Del Rey
Oaks. The water supply (domestic and fire flow) is directly affected by the
topographical layout.

WHEREAS, this ordinance was found to be categarically exempt from environmental
review per section 15061(b)(3) of the CEQA (California Environmental Quality Act) Guidelines;
and

WHEREAS, the City Council held a duly noticed public hearing on December 28, 2010,
where members of the public had an opportunity to comment on the code adoption and the
proposed local amendments thereto.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT ORDAINED BY THE COUNCIL OF DEL REY OAKS AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code Chapter 8.04 is hereby amended in its entirety to read
as follows:

Sec. 8.04.010. Adoption of California Fire Code.

The California Fire Code, 2010 edition, is hereby adopted by reference, and made a part hereof,
as the Fire Code of the City of Del Rey Oaks.

Sec. 8.04.020. Definitions.

The following terms shall have the definitions set forth in this section, or in any other uniform
codes or other nationally recognized fire safety standard, made a part of this chapter, unless
otherwise apparent from the context:

(a) “City” means the City of De Rey Oaks when it refers to a political entity, and means the
incorporated area of the City of Del Rey Oaks when it refers to an area.

(b) “City Council” means the city council of Del Rey Oaks.
(c) “Fire Chief” means the chief of the fire department serving the City of Seaside.
(d) “Mayor” means the mayor of the City of Del Rey Oaks.
(e) “Municipality” means the City of Del Rey Oaks.
Sec. 8.04.030. Bureau of Fire Prevention Established.

The City of Seaside Bureau of Fire Prevention is hereby established to enforce the Califarnia Fire
Code and shall be presided over by the Fire Chief or his/her designee.

City of Del Rey Oaks Page 2 of 10
2010 Fire Code Update
December 28, 2010



Sec. 8.04.030. California Fire Code, 2010 Edition—Amendments, Additions, and Deletions.

(a) Section 307.3. of Chapter 3 of the California Fire Code is amended by adding subsection
307.3.1 to read as follows:

Except as otherwise provided in this Section, all outdoor rubbish fires are prohibited. No waste
matter shall be disposed of by burning within the City of Seaside.

(b) Section 307.4.4 is added to read as follows:

Permit Required. No person shall kindle or maintain any open fire or authorize any such fire to
be kindled or maintained for the purpose of preparation of food, such as in the case of a Luau or
barbecue or recreational fire without a permit from the Seaside Fire Department. Other than
one and two family residential dwelling units, a permit and/or clearance from the Monterey Bay
Unified Air Pollution Control District is required.

(c) Sections 903.2 through 903.2.18 of Chapter 9 of the California Fire Code are amended to
read as follows:

Section 903.2 All Occupancies.

(1) An automatic fire sprinkler system shall be installed and maintained in all new
construction.

Exceptions:

a. When fire sprinklers are considered undesirable because of the nature of
the contents or in rooms or areas which are of noncombustible construction
with wholly noncombustible contents and which are not exposed by other
areas. Sprinklers shall not be omitted from any room merely because it is
damp, of fire-resistive construction or contains electrical equipment.
Temporary Buildings under 1,000 sq. ft.

Airport control towers.

One story detached accessory buildings to a group R-3 dwelling units.

Open parking structures.

Sprinklers shall not be installed when the application of water or flame and

water to the contents may constitute a serious life or fire hazard, as in the

manufacture or storage of quantities of aluminum powder, calcium carbide,

calcium phosphide, metallic sodium and potassium, quicklime, magnesium

powder and sodium peroxide.

g. Existing mobile home parks within the City regulated by the Department of
Housing and Community Development are exempt: Health and Safety Code,
Mobile Home Parks Act, Section 18300.

~mao0 T

(d) Sections 903.3.1.3 of Chapter 9 of the California Fire Code are amended to read as
follows:

City of Del Rey Oaks Page 3 of 10
2010 Fire Code Update
December 28, 2010



903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D Sprinkler Systems. Where allowed, automatic sprinkler systems installed in
one-and two-family dwellings shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D.

903.3.1 .3.1. All fire sprinkler systems installed in one-and two-family dwellings shall be
tested for leakage by undergoing a hydrostatic test made at 200 psi for a two-hour duration.

903.3.1.3.2. Each water system supplying both domestic and fire protection systems shall
have a single indicating-type control valve, arranged to shut off both the domestic and
sprinkler systems. A separate shut-off valve for the domestic system only shall be permitted
to be installed. The location of the control valve shall be approved by the fire code official.

903.3.1.3.3. Local water flow alarms shall be provided on all sprinkler systems. Local water flow
alarms shall be powered from the main kitchen refrigerator circuit. The local water flow alarm
shall be clearly audible from within the master bedroom at an audibility level of not less than 75
dBa. Where no kitchen exists in the building, the water flow alarm shall be powered from the
bathroom lighting circuit.

(e} Section 903.6 of Chapter 9 of the California Fire Code is amended to read as follows:

903.6 Existing buildings - Repairs, Alterations, and Additions. In all buildings, except where
otherwise provided herein in this Section, where the total floor area exceeds five thousand
square feet (5000sf), or which are forty feet (40') or more in height, or which are three or more
stories in height, they shall be made to comply with the provisions of this Section.

In all buildings where the total floor area exceeds five thousand square feet (5000sf), or which
are forty feet (40') or more in height, or which are three or more stories in height, if the repairs
or alterations are made exceeding twenty-five percent of the current market value of the
building and property as shown in the records of the County Assessor within any three hundred
sixty (360) day period shall be made to comply with the provisions of this section.

Exception:

(1) Valuation may also be determined by the replacement costs of the existing structure based
upon the most recent “Building Valuation Data” contained in the “Building Standards” magazine
published by the International Conference of Building Officials. The intent of this exception is to
allow the use of a less restrictive application (if applicable) to determine if repair, alterations or

additions are twenty-five percent (25%) or more of the value of the building.

Definitions

Repair. It is the reconstruction or renewal of any part of an existing building or structure for the
purpose of its maintenance.

Alteration. It is any change, addition, or modification in construction or occupancy.

Exception: Projects where the sole purpose is for seismic upgrade.

City of Del Rey Oaks Page 4 of 10
2010 Fire Code Update
December 28, 2010



Existing Group R, Division 3 buildings to which additions, alterations, or repairs are made that
involve the removal or replacement to 50 percent or greater of the linear length of walls of the
building (exterior plus interior) within a one-year period shall meet the requirements of new
construction or this code.

(f) Appendix AE—Alternative Energy Systems—is added to read as follows:
APPENDIX AE — ALTERNATIVE ENERGY SYSTEMS

AE101.1. Scope. Applications for the installation, additions or remodel of alternative energy
system, including but not limited to photovoltaic and wind generation systems, shall be subject
to this appendix when conditioned by the fire code official.

AE101.2. Conflicting Sections. Where provisions in this appendix conflict with other sections of
this code or other appendices, the provisions of this appendix shall prevail unless otherwise
directed by the fire code official.

AE102. SIGNING AND MARKING: All photovoltaic systems shall be permanently marked as
specified in this section.

AE102.1. Main Service Disconnect

a. Main Panel Exterior Marking. A placard is required to be permanently affixed to the
main service disconnect panel. The placard shall be red in color with white capital letters at least
3/4” in height and in a non-serif font, to read “SOLAR DISCONNECT INSIDE PANEL.” The placard
shall be constructed of weather-resistant, durable plastic with engraved letters, or other
approved material.

b. Circuit Disconnecting Means Marking. A permanent label is to be affixed adjacent to
the circuit breaker controlling the inverter or other photovoltaic system electrical controller. The
label shall have contrasting color capital letters at least 3/8” in height and in a non-serif font, to
read “SOLAR DISCONNECT.” The label shall be constructed of durable adhesive material or other
approved material.

AE102.2. Direct Current (DC) Conduits, Raceways, Enclosures, Cable Assemblies, and Junction
Boxes.

a. Marking is required on all interior and exterior direct current (DC) conduits,
raceways, enclosures, cable assemblies, and junction boxes.

b. Marking Locations. Marking shall be placed on all DC conduits, raceways, enclosures,
and cable assemblies every ten feet (10’), at turns and above and below penetrations. Marking
shall also be placed on all DC combiner and junction boxes.

c. Marking Content and Format. Marking for DC conduits, raceways, enclosures, cable
assemblies and junction boxes shall be red with white lettering with minimum 3/8” capital
letters in a non-serif font, to read “WARNING: SOLAR CIRCUIT”. Marking shall be reflective,
City of Del Rey Oaks Page 5 of 10

2010 Fire Code Update
December 28, 2010



weather resistant, and suitable for the environment, Materials used should be in compliance
with UL Standard 969.

AE102.3. Secondary Power Sources. Where photovoltaic systems are interconnected to battery
systems, generator backup systems, or other secondary power systems, additional sighage
acceptable to the fire code official shall be required indicating the location of the secondary
power source shutoff switch.

AE102.4. Installer Information. Signage acceptable to the fire code official indicating the name
and emergency telephone number of the installing contractor shall be required to be installed
adjacent to the man disconnect.

AE102.5 Inverters. No markings are required for inverters.

AE102.6 AC Photovoltaic Systems. AC Photovoltaic Systems shall be marked as specified in this
section.

a. Main Panel Exterior Marking. A placard is required to be permanently affixed to the
car service disconnect panel. The placard shall be red in color with white capital letters at least
3/4” in height and in a non-serif font, to read “SOLAR DISCONNECT INSIDE PANEL.” The placard
shall be constructed of weather resistant, durable plastic with engraved letters, or other
approved material.

b. Circuit Disconnecting Means Marking. A permanent label is to be affixed adjacent to
the circuit breaker controlling the inverter or other photovoltaic system electrical controller. The
label shall have contrasting color capital letters at least 3/8” in height and in a non-serif font, to
read “SOLAR DISCONNECT.” The label shall be constructed of durable adhesive material or other
approved material.

AE103 BUILDING MOUNTED PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEMS.

AE103.1. All building- or roof-mounted photovoltaic systems shall be installed as specified in
this section.

a. Access, Pathways, and Smoke Ventilation. Access and spacing requirements shall be
observed to ensure emergency access to the roof, provide pathways for specific areas of the
roof, provide for smoke ventilation opportunity areas, and to provide emergency egress from
the roof.

b. Exceptions. Exceptions to the requirements in this section shall be permitted to be
granted by the fire code official where access, pathway or ventilation requirements are reduced
due to any of the following circumstances:

(1) Proximity and type of adjacent exposures.
(2) Alternative access opportunities, as from adjoining roofs.
(3) Ground level access to the roof.
(4) Adeguate ventilation opportunities below solar arrays.
City of Del Rey Oaks Page 6 of 10

2010 Fire Code Update
December 28, 2010



(5) Adequate ventilation opportunities afforded by module set back from other rooftop
equipment.

(6) Automatic ventilation devices.

(7) New technologies, methods, or other innovations that ensure adequate fire
department access, pathways, and ventilation opportunities.

c. Designation of ridge, hip, and valley does not apply to roofs with 2-in-12 or less pitch.
d. Measurement Conventions. All roof dimensions shall be measured to centerlines.

e. Roof Access Points. Roof access points shall be defined as areas where ladders are
not placed over openings (windows or doors) and are located at strong points of building
construction and in locations where they will not conflict with overhead obstructions (tree
limbs, wires, or signs).

AE103.2 Household Systems (One- and Two-Family Dwellings)
a. Access and Pathways.

(1) Hip Roof Layouts. Modules shall be located in a manner that provides one (1) three
foot (3’) wide clear access pathway from the eave to the ridge of each roof slope
where the modules are located. The access pathway shall be located at a
structurally sound location on the building, such as a bearing wall. EXCEPTION:
Where adjoining roof planes provide a three foot (3’) wide clear access pathway.

(2) Single Ridge Layouts. Modules shall be located in a manner that provides two (2)
three-foot (3’) wide access pathways from the eave to the ridge on each roof slope
where the modules are located.

(3) Hip and Valley Layouts. Modules shall be located no closer than one and one-half
feet (1-1/2) to a hip or valley if modules are to be placed on both sides of a hip or
valley. Where modules are located on only one side of a hip or valley that is of equal
length, the modules shall be permitted to be placed directly adjacent to the hip or
valley.

b. Ridge Setback. The modules shall be located no higher than one and one—half feet
(1—1/2’) below the ridge.

AE103.3. Commercial Systems.

a. Definition. Commercial Systems shall be defined as all photovoltaic systems installed
in any occupancy other than a one and two family dwelling.

b. Alternative Requirements. Where the fire code official determines that the roof
configuration is similar to residential {i.e., townhouses, condominiums, or single-family attached
buildings) the fire code official shall be permitted to make a determination to apply the

City of Del Rey Oaks Page 7 of 10
2010 Fire Code Update
December 28, 2010



requirements under Section AE103.2, above.

c. Access. There shall be a minimum six—foot (6’) wide clear perimeter around the
edges of the roof. EXCEPTION: If either access to the building is 250 or less, there shall be a
minimum four foot (4°) wide clear perimeter around the edges of the roof.

d. Pathways. Pathways shall be established as follows:

(1) Pathways shall be over structural members.

(2) Centerline axis pathways shall be provided in both axes of the roof.

(3) Centerline axis pathways shall run on structural members or Over the next closest
structural member nearest to the center lines of the roof.

(4) Pathways shall be straight line not less than four feet (4') clear to skylights,
ventilation hatches, and/or roof standpipes.

(5) Pathways shall provide not less than four feet (4’) clear around roof access hatches
with at least one not less than four foot (4’) clear pathway to the parapet or roof edge.

e. Smoke Ventilation.
(1) Solar arrays shall be no greater than 150 feet by 150 feet in distance in either axis.

(2) Ventilator options between array sections shall be (a) a pathway eight feet (8’) or
greater in width; (b) a pathway four feet (4’) or greater in width and bordering on existing roof
skylights or ventilation hatches; or (c) a pathway four feet (4’) or greater in width and bordering
four foot by eight foot (4’ X 8) “venting cutouts” every twenty feet (20’) on alternating sides of
the pathway.

AE104. Location of Direct Current (DC) Conductors.

a. Exterior mounted Direct Current conduits, wiring systems and raceways for
photovoltaic circuits shall be located as close as possible to the ridge, hip or valley and from the
hip or valley as directly as possible to an outside wall to reduce trip hazards and maximize
ventilation opportunities.

b. Conduit runs between sub—arrays and to DC combiner boxes shall use design
guidelines that minimize the total amount of conduit by taking the shortest path from the array
to the DC combiner box.

c. DC combiner boxes shall be located so that conduit runs are minimized in the
pathways between arrays.

d. DC wiring shall be run in metallic conduit or raceways when located within enclosed
spaces in a building and shall be run as follows:

City of Del Rey Oaks Page 8 of 10
2010 Fire Code Update
December 28, 2010



(1) When run perpendicular or parallel to load bearing members, a minimum ten—inch
(10”) space below roof decking or sheathing shall be maintained.

(2) Where flexible metal conduit (FMC) or metal clad cable (MC) containing PV power
circuit conductors is installed across ceilings or floor joists, the raceway or cable shall be
protected by guard strips.

AE105 GROUND MOUNTED PHOTOVOLTAIC SYSTEMS
AE105.1. Marking shall be in accordance with Section AE102, above.

AE105.2. Setbacks. Special setback requirements do not apply to ground-mounted,
freestanding photovoltaic arrays. NOTE: The zoning regulations of the jurisdiction regulate
setbacks between buildings, accessory structures (possibly including ground-mounted
photovoltaic arrays) and property lines.

AE105.3. Clearances. A clear area of ten feet (10’) around ground-mounted photovoltaic
installations shall be provided.

AE105.4. Non-Combustible Base. A gravel base or other non—combustible base acceptable to
the fire code official shall be installed and maintained under and around the installation.

AE105.5. Protection. Fencing, skirting, or other suitable security barrier shall be installed when
required by the fire code official. NOTE: Security barriers are intended to protect individuals and
animals from contact with energized conductors or other components.

AE105.6. Fire Sprinkler Protection. Fire sprinkler protection is not required for ground-mounted
photovoltaic installations.

SECTION 2. If any section, subsection, sentence, clause or phrase of this ordinance is for any
reason held to be invalid or unconstitutional by a decision of any court of any competent
jurisdiction, such decision shall not affect the validity of the remaining portions of this
ordinance. The Del Rey Oaks City Council hereby declares that it would have passed this
ordinance, and each and every section, subsection, clause and phrase thereof not declared
invalid or unconstitutional without regard to whether any portion of the ordinance would be
subsequently declared invalid or unconstitutional.

SECTION 3. This ordinance shall be effective on February 27, 2011.

SECTION 4. The City Clerk of the City of Del Rey Oaks is hereby directed to cause the following
summary of this ordinance to be published by one (1) insertion in

, @ newspaper of general circulation circulated in the city
of Del Rey Oaks and hereby designated for that purpose by the Council of Del Rey Oaks:

"Chapter 8.04 of the Del Rey Oaks Municipal Code is hereby amended by adopting the 2010
California Fire Code and related codes and making local amendments thereto."

City of Del Rey Oaks Page 9 of 10
2010 Fire Code Update
December 28, 2010



This ordinance was introduced and read on the 28" day of December 2010, and passed and
adopted on the 18" day of January 2011, by the following vote:

AYES:
NOES:
ABSTAIN:

ABSENT:

Mayor

ATTEST:

City Clerk

City of Del Rey Oaks Page 10 of 10
2010 Fire Code Update
December 28, 2010



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

650 CANYON DEL REY RD
DEL REY OAKS CA 93940
‘ AGENDA REPORT I
TO: Honorable Mayor and Members of City Council
FROM: Daniel Dawson, City Manager

MEETING DATE: December 28, 2010

Consideration and Adoption of Resolution to Revise Terms of
SUBJECT: Reference (i.e., Bylaws) for the Monterey County Integrated
Waste Management Task Force
CEQA: This does not constitute a “Project” under California

) Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) Guidelines

RECOMMENDATION
Adopt a resolution to approve the revised Terms of Reference for the Monterey County
Integrated Waste Management Task Force.

DISCUSSION

On February 27, 1990, the County established by resolution the Monterey County
Integrated Waste Management Task Force, to comply with the California Integrated
Waste Management Act of 1989, specifically, Section 40950 of the Public Resources
Code. The original goal of the task force was to develop and implement the Countywide
Integrated Waste Management Plan (CIWMP). The CIWMP addressed waste
management conditions within the county and outlined the actions to be taken to achieve
the diversion requirements of Public Resources Code Section 41780 and to maintain 15
years of disposal capacity. The Task Force is guided by by-laws, called “Terms of
Reference,” that prescribe the membership and procedures of the Task Force.

Having achieved its original goals, the Task Force continues to explore waste
management issues of shared importance to all members. For example, in recent years
the Task Force has developed a model Construction Demolition Debris ordinance to
facilitate diversion of this substantial waste stream. It has also worked to ensure proper
handling and disposal of sharps and pharmaceutical waste, and to improve and
standardize waste collection franchise agreements throughout the County.

On May 12, 2010, the Task Force approved a revision of its Terms of Reference, to
modernize its membership and practices in order to improve representation and
responsiveness to vital issues. For example, the membership portion was amended to
include: all of the franchised waste haulers in the County; the Salinas Valley Solid Waste
Authority; the Monterey County Business Council; and the Pebble Beach Community
Services District. The by-laws also removed members that had not actively participated in

Page 1 of 2



the Task Force for many years, including representatives of the Association of Monterey
Bay Area Governments, military organizations, and several County departments.
Moreover, the revised Terms of Reference also require the Task Force to meet at least
once annually or when requested by at least five members.

The revised Terms of Reference will assist the Task Force to achieve its goals by
including critical representatives to its membership and by employing new technologies
that were not previously available to expedite distribution of vital information. Pursuant
to state law and the adopted Terms of Reference, the Board of Supervisors and the city
councils of a majority of the cities within the County that contain a majority of the cities’
population must approve the proposed amendments.

The recommended action was taken by the Board of Supervisors on July 27, 2010. If
now ratified by the cities as described above, the Task force would comprise
representatives of the following entities and agencies:

e  The cities of Marina, Seaside, Sand City, Del Rey Oaks, Monterey, Pacific Grove,
Carmel-by-the-Sea, Salinas, Gonzales, Soledad, Greenfield, and King City;

e A member of the general public from each of the five Monterey County
Supervisorial Districts; Monterey County Health Department; and Pebble Beach
Community Services District;

e  All franchise waste haulers in the County — currently, BFI Waste Services, Carmel
Marina Corporation, and Monterey/Tri-Cities Disposal;

e  The Monterey Regional Waste Management District and the Salinas Valley Solid
Waste Authority;

e  Various environmental organizations, the recycling industry and the agricultural
industry; and

e  The Monterey County Business Council.

The requested action is not a project under CEQA because it is an organizational activity
of government that will not result in direct or indirect changes in the physical
environment (see CEQA Guideline Section 15378(b)(5)).

FISCAL IMPACT
None.

ATTACHMENTS

1. Resolution No. 10-27, with Exhibit A: Amended Terms of Reference
2. Current Terms of Reference, redlined to show proposed amendments

Page 2 of 2



RESOLUTION NO. 2010-27

RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF
DEL REY OAKS APPROVING REVISED TERMS OF REFERENCE FOR
THE MONTEREY COUNTY INTEGRATED WASTE MANAGEMENT TASK
FORCE TO ENABLE REORGANIZATION OF MEMBERSHIP AND
BUSINESS PRACTICES TO IMPROVE REPRESENTATION AND
RESPONSIVENESS

WHEREAS, on February 27, 1990, the Board of Supervisors established by
resolution the Monterey County Integrated Waste Management Task Force (“Task
Force™) to comply with Public Resources Code Section 40950; and

WHEREAS, on July 17, 1990, the Board of Supervisors approved the Terms of
Reference to govern membership and practices of the Task Force; and

WHEREAS, the City Council of the City of Del Rey Oaks approved membership
on the Task Force and approved the Terms of Reference by adopting Resolution 6105 on
August 1, 1990; and

WHEREAS, amendment of the Terms of Reference requires an affirmative vote
by two-thirds of written ballots returned by Task Force members; approval by the Board
of Supervisors; and approval by a majority of the city councils of the cities that contain a
majority of the population of the incorporated area of Monterey County; and

WHEREAS, on May 12, 2010, the Task Force unanimously by written ballot
approved the Terms of Reference as amended as shown on the document attached hereto
as Attachment 1; and

WHEREAS, the revisions to the Terms of Reference will assist the Task Force to
achieve its goals by modernizing its membership and practices in order to improve
representation and responsiveness to vital issues; and

WHEREAS, on July 27, 2010, the Monterey County Board of Supervisors
adopted Resolution No. 10-230 to approve the revised Terms of Reference for the Task
Force; and

WHEREAS, in the development of this matter, the City followed the guidelines
adopted by the State of California and published in the California Code of Regulations,
Title 14, Section 15000, et seq.; and

WHEREAS, this action does not constitute a “project” as defined by California

Environmental Quality Act (CEQA) because it is an organizational or administrative
activity that shall not result in direct or indirect physical change to the environment.

Page 1 of 2



NOW, THEREFORE, THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
DOES RESOLVE AS FOLLOWS:

SECTION 1. The City Council finds each recital set forth above to be true and
correct, and by this reference incorporates each as an integral part of this Resolution.

SECTION 2. The City Council approves the revised Terms of Reference for the
Monterey County Integrated Waste Management Task Force, attached hereto as
Attachment 1 and incorporated herein by reference.

SECTION 3. This Resolution shall become effective immediately following
passage and adoption thereof.

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
this 28th day of December, 2010, by the following vote:

AYES:
NOES:
ABSENT:
APPROVED:
Jerry B. Edelen, Mayor
ATTEST:

Dan Dawson, City Clerk

APPROVED AS TO FORM.:

Chris Callihan, City Attorney

Page 2 of 2



Attachment 1 to Exhibit A

Salinas, California
May 12, 2010

TERMS OF REFERENCE
MONTEREY COUNTY INTEGRATED WASTE MANAGEMENT TASK FORCE

CONVENING THE TASK FORCE

The Monterey County Integrated Waste Management Task Force (Task Force) was
established by a Resolution of the Monterey County Board of Supervisors on February
27, 1990. This action was in compliance with the California Integrated Waste
Management Act of 1989 (AB 939, Sher). (“Act”) and specifically, Public Resources
Code § 40950,

PURPOSE

The Task Force is established by the Board of Supervisors and the City Councils to
ensure a coordinated and cost effective county-wide recycling system; to identify solid
waste management issues of county-wide concern; to determine the need for waste
collection systems, waste processing facilities, waste disposal systems and marketing
strategies to serve the cities and the county; and to facilitate development of county-wide
strategies for marketing of recyclable and compostable materials. The Task Force shall
develop goals and recommend policies consistent with State law and regulations as
appropriate to Monterey County. Wherever possible the Task Force shall act as a forum
for resolution of conflicts and inconsistencies between the waste management plans and
operations of the various jurisdictions. The Task Force will provide technical guidance to
the jurisdictions to assist in the preparation of the required Siting and Source
Reduction/Recycling Elements and will review and comment on draft documents before
they are submitted to the California Department of Resources Recycling and Recovery.

MEMBERSHIP AND OFFICERS
The Task Force is made up of the following members representing vatious interests as
follows: ' '

1 Member representing each incorporated City in Monterey County;,

1 Member representing each waste collection franchise in the County,
representing the Waste Collection industry;

1 Member representing the Monterey Regional Waste Management District;
1  Member representing the Salinas Valley Solid Waste Authority;

1 Member representing Environmental Organizations;



. Attachment 1 to Exhibit A

1 Member of the general public representing each of the five Supervisorial
Districts of Monterey County;

1  Member representing the Recycling industry;
1 Member representing the Agricultural industry;
1 Member representing the Monterey County Business Council;

1 Member representing the Monterey County Health Department (Local
Enforcement Agency); and,

1  Member representing the Pebble Beach Community Services District

Members shall be nominated by the organization represented and confirmed by a
resolution of the Monterey County Board of Supervisors. Those members representing
each of the five County Supervisorial Districts and Environmental Organizations shall be
nominated by a member of the Board of Supervisors and confirmed by a resolution of the
Board of Supervisors. Members may designate an alternate by written notice to the
Secretary, such alternate to have the member’s authority to attend meetings and vote in
place of the member. Members or alternates are expected to attend the meetings and
participate in the work of the Task Force. If a member is not present or represented for
three of any six consecutive meetings, the Chair shall notify the member’s sponsor in
wtiting requesting a replacement.

The officers of the Task Force are to be a Chair, Vice-Chair and Secretary, The Secretary
will be the member representing the County Health Department. The Chair and Vice-
Chair shall serve for a term of two years and may serve up to three consecutive terms.
The initial term of the Vice Chair shall be one year to establish a staggered end date for
the terms of the Chair and Vice-Chair. As an officer approaches the end of his or her two-
year term, the Chair shall appoint a Nominating Committee of three members, to include
a representative of a city, a County representative and a third member, chosen from
members representing other than the groups which supply the ofher two members. The
Nominating Committee will prepare a slate with one or more candidates for each office;
will assure that each nominee is prepared to serve if elected; and will prepare a form of
written ballot, allowing space for writing in the names of nominees from the floor. The
election will be held at a regularly scheduled meeting and members will be allowed to
nominate candidates from the floor. If such nomination is seconded, the candidates name
shall be written into the ballot, except that the candidate must be present at the meeting,
or the nominating member must present the candidate’s affidavit indicating willingness to
serve. Ballots will be collected and tallied by the Nominating Committee. Election is by
simple majority of members present, and run-offs between two candidates receiving the
most votes may be necessary and will be conducted then and there. Nominating
Committee will deliver the tally and all ballots to the Secretary for confirmation and
announcement of results.



Attachment 1 to Exhibit A

The duties of the Officers are as follows:

Chair:

Vice-Chair:

Secretary:

MEETINGS

Plan and schedule meetings of the Task Force;

Preside over meetings in accordance with the Ralph M. Brown Act
and using established rules of order;

Delegate tasks to members and officers to assure timely resolution
of matters arising;

Represent the Task Force before the Monterey County Board of
Supervisors or other State or Local Government bodies as
appropriate.

Establish and coordinate Subcommittees of the Task Force.

To serve in place of Chair when Chair is absent;
To undertake special assignments on behalf of Chair.

To provide staff services to the Task Force to assure timely
production of agendas, notices of meetings, minutes and
correspondence;

To advise the Task force in connection with coordinating its
activities with Monterey County;

To prepare reports and recommendations by the Task Force in such
form to assure efficient consideration and action by the Monterey
County Board of Supervisors,

To maintain formal or informal relationships with the California
Department of Resources Recycling and Recovery (CalRecycle)
and to provide Task Force members with timely information about
CalRecycle activities.

Meetings shall be noticed and conducted in accordance with the Ralph M. Brown Act
(Government Code §54950 et seq.). Meetings shall be scheduled upon the call of the
Chair. Meetings shall be held a minimum of once during each calendar year. The regular
meeting location shall be rotated among the government agency members. Meetings may
also be demanded by written petition signed by five or more members, such petition to be
delivered to the Chair. The Chair will then be obligated to call a meeting within 21
calendar days after the receipt of the petition.



Attachment 1 to Exhibit A

Written notices of regular meetings shall be disiributed to members ten or more calendar
days in advance of the meeting. For the purpose of mailing notices to members, the
mailing of minutes which establish the date and time for the meeting is considered
appropriate notice. Agendas shall be distributed five or more calendar days in advance of
the meeting. Items requiring Task Force action shall be included in the Agenda. All
meetings are open to the public and agendas will provide an opportunity for public
comment to be limited to three minutes per person requesting an oppottunity o be heard.
Notices of regular meetings and agendas shall be distributed to the media at least five
days in advance of each meeting. Written minutes of meetings shall be distributed to
members within 14 calendar days after the meeting.

QUORUM AND AUTHORITY

A meeting duly called can conduct the business of the Task Force so long as one officer,
one representative from the Salinas Valley Solid Waste Authority, one representative
from the Monterey Regional Waste Management District, one representative from three
cities and one representative from the Monterey County Health Department (LEA) are
present. A representative from the Pebble Beach Community Services District may
substitute for one of the three city representatives necessary for a quorum. Actions will be
by majority of members present, except any change proposed for these Terms of
Reference shall be voted by written ballot distributed to all members.

The ballot shall specify a closing date, not less than 14 calendar days after distribution, A
two-thirds majority of ballots returned will provide authority for recommending the
change in Terms of Reference for approval by the County Board of Supervisors and the
City Councils. Task Force actions may recommend the expenditure of public funds, but

~ the appropriation and use of such funds is reserved to the authorized County and City
bodies.

SUBCOMMITTEES
The Task Force may establish subcommittees to perform necessary investigative and staff
work. Chair and membership of each subcommittee shall be appointed by the Task Force

Chair.



BOARD OF DIRECTORS

WILLIAM MERRY, P.E., BCEE

LEO LASKA GENERAL MANAGER/
CHAIR DISTRICT ENGINEER
SUE McCLOUD TIMOTHY S. FLANAGAN
VICE CHAIR ASST. GENERAL MANAGER
GARY BALES RICHARD SHEDDEN, P.E.
Eg\g\? ggr\:&%amss SENIOR ENGINEER
JANE PARKER MONTEREY REGIONAL RICHARD NORTON
IAN OGLESBY ADMIN. SERVICES MGR.
BRUCE DELGADO

KRISTIN CLARK

WASTE MANAGEMENT DISTRICT
>, ?me 7’ the Q%Aé %%wm% :%(uﬁ/zﬁe

ROBERT WELLINGTON
COUNSEL

MEMORANDUM \j E r«?
DATE: November 22, 2010 R v T 70
TO: Del Rey Oaks City Council o P\‘;—é\% gﬁa
FROM: Kristin Clark ™
SUBJECT:  Highlights of the November 19, 2010 Board Meeting

The highlights of the meeting are as follows:

1) The District’s annual audit for Fiscal Year (FY) 2009/10, prepared by Hayashi & Wayland
(H&W), was reviewed and accepted by the Board. Mr. Mike Nolan of H&W reported that the
District received a “clean” audit and no recommendations to internal controls, which was the
highest level assurance that an agency can receive from an auditor. For the year, operating
revenues were $516,692 above budget, and with strong controls on discretionary expenditures
and deferral of capital purchases, the District ended the FY with net operating income of
$672,547 and a decrease in cash of $280,108 compared to a budgeted decrease of $899,500.

2) A Board workshop was held to further discuss the preliminary findings presented by Bob Hilton
of HF&H Consultants (HF&H), at the October Board meeting, on alternative funding strategies and
regional cooperation. The purpose of the workshop was to provide HF&H with input prior to the
preparation of a draft final report. Staff provided the Board with a color-defined chart, which
depicted short term and long term options, and in the priority order of those options that increase
revenue, increase diversion, and support the generation of renewable power. Input was provided to
HF&H and will be incorporated into the draft final report, which is scheduled to be presented at the
December Board meeting.

3) The Board reviewed the Draft Annual Report for FY 2009/10. Following discussion and input to
staff, the Board approved the report. The final report will be delivered to District member agencies
and other interested parties.

4) During closed session, the Board conducted and completed the annual evaluation of the General
Manager.

If you have any questions or need more information, please contact General Manager William Merry
at 384-5313, or me.

Kristin Clark, Director
Monterey Regional Waste Management District

14201 DEL MONTE BLVD * BOX 1670 * MARINA, CA 93933-1670 * 831/384-5313, FAX 831/384-3567 * www.mrwmd.org

@ PRINTED OM RECYCLED PAPER USING SOY-BASED INK



MST

MONTEREY-SALINAS TRANSIT

TRANSIT DISTRICT MEMBERS: %{ ot e 3

City of Carmel-by-the-Sea + City of Del Rey Oaks * Cily of Gonzales = City of Greenfield »

City of King » City of Marina = City of Monterey « Cily of Pacific Grove * Cify of Salinas ;3; %G yH
City of Sand City = Cily of Seuside » City of Soledad « County of Monterey N L ="

DEL REY OAKS

L

MST HIGHLIGHTS OITY OLERK
November 8, 2010 BOARD MEETING

OCTOBER EMPLOYEE OF THE MONTH

The MST Board adopted Resolution 2011-10 recognizing Angela Dawson, Accountant, as
Employee of the Month for November 2010. Mrs. Dawson has successfully met many
challenges, including reconciling and documenting MST’s extensive inventory of assets and
assisting in the “clean up” of MST’s financial records. She has excelled in assisting with the
review of longstanding financial and accounting practices to look for ways to eliminate
repetitive efforts and inefficiencies. She has also utilized technology and innovative
strategies to maximize MST's financial report.

DONATION OF VEHICLES
The MST Board authorized the donation of two Dodge vans to the Community Alliance for a
Sustainable Economy.

CLAIM REJECTION
The MST Board rejected claims from Ms. Guadalupe Mejia and Mr. Jesus Blanco Gonzales.

MONTEREY COUNTY OPERATIONAL AREA AUTHORITY - MOU

The MST Board authorized staff to enter into a Memorandum of Understanding where MST
would become a participant in the Monterey County Operational Area Authority (OAA). The
OAA coordinates emergency management functions and response operations within
Monterey County during periods of major emergency or disaster.

AB2766 AIR DISTRICT GRANT

The MST Board approved the execution of FY 2011 Monterey Bay Unified Air Pollution
Control District AB2766 grant for $100,000. The grant will be utilized to fund the Salinas Area
Service Study.

One Ryan Ranch Road + Monterey, California 93940-5703 USA + Fax 831.899.3954 » Phone §31.899.2558 or 424.7695
www.mst.org * e-mail: mst@mst.org



