8.

CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

650 CANYON DEL REY RD. - DEL REY OAKS, CALIFORNIA 93940
PHONE (831) 394-8511 - FAX (831) 394-6421

AGENDA
MEETING OF THE CITY OF DEL REY OAKS CITY COUNCIL
TUESDAY, NOVEMBER 16, 2010 at 6:00 P.M.
CHARLIE BENSON MEMORIAL HALL, CITY HALL

6:00 P.M. - ROLL CALL - Council
PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
COMMUNICATIONS: None

PROCLAMATION:
Outstanding Public Service

PRESENTATION:
Monterey Regional Storm Water Management Plan: Sydney Moe

PUBLIC COMMENTS:

Anyone wishing to address the City Council or Agency on matters not appearing on the
Agenda may do so now. The public may comment on any other matter listed on the
Agenda at the time the matter is being considered. There will be a time limit of not more
than three minutes for each speaker. No action will be taken on matters brought up under this
item and all comments will be referred to staff.

CONSENT AGENDA: Action Items
A. MINUTES:
1. October 26, 2010, Regular City Council Meeting
B. MONTHLY REPORTS:
1. Claims, October 2010
2. Financials, October 2010
3. Fire Department Response Report, October 2010
4. Police Activity Report, October 2010

OLD BUSINESS: None Action Items

Page 1lof 2



Del Rey Oaks Council Meeting — November 16, 2010

9.

10.

11.
12.

13.

14.

15.

NEW BUSINESS: Action Items

A. Consider Resolution No. 2010-26, A Resolution of the City of Del Rey Oaks
Canvassing the November 2, 2010 General Municipal Election

B. Consider Ordinance No. 271, An Ordinance Amending Chapter 15 of the Del Rey
Oaks Municipal Code which Adopts the City of Monterey Changes to the City of
Monterey Municipal Code:
AMENDING CHAPTERS 9 AND 13 OF THE MONTEREY CITY CODE ADOPTING
THE 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AND APPENDICES I AND J;
2010 CALIFORNIA HISTORIC BUILDING CODE;
2010 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE;
2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE;
2010 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE;
2010 CALIFORNIA ELECTRIC CODE;
2010 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE;
2010 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE INCLUDING A-J; AND
2006 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

STAFF REPORTS:
A. City Manager Report

MAYOR AND COUNCIL REPORT
CORRESPONDENCE: None

CLOSED SESSION: As permitted by Government Code Section 54956 et. seq. the
Council may adjourn to a Closed Session to consider specific matters dealing with
certain litigation, personnel, or labor/real property negotiations

A. Existing litigation pursuant to Government Code Section 54956.9(a), City of Del
Rey Oaks v. Federal/JER Associates, LLC et al., Monterey County Superior Court
Case No. M107509.

SET NEXT MEETING DATE: Establish Tuesday, December 28, 2010, at 6:00 P.M. as
the date and time of the Council’s next regular meeting.

ADJOURNMENT

Information distributed to the Council at the meeting becomes part of the public record. A
copy of written material, pictures, etc. must be provided to the secretary for this purpose.
All enclosures and materials regarding these agenda items are available for public review at
the Del Rey Oaks City Hall, 650 Canyon Del Rey Road, Del Rey Oaks.

Page 2 of 2




CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

650 CANYON DEL REY RD. - DEL REY OAKS, CALIFORNIA 93940
PHONE (831) 394-8511 - FAX (831) 394-6421

A PROCLAMATION HONORING
JAMES D. CLARK, KRISTIN A. CLARK AND BOB ASHTON
G22.0)

WHEREAS, Jim Clark, Kristin Clark and Bob Ashton have been Del Rey Oaks residents for
over 15 years; and

WHEREAS, each night they take a walk through the City for exercise and camaraderie,
meeting and greeting their neighbors along their route; and

WHEREAS, on Monday, November 9th, 2010 at approximately 6:15 p.m. the group saw
something very strange; and

WHEREAS, the garage door of 29 Los Encinos was going up and down in an erratic
fashion; and

WHEREAS, the group stopped to investigate and found the garage on fire; and

WHEREAS, the group worked as a team to evacuate the homeowner, call 911, and begin to
fight the fire with garden hoses; and

WHEREAS, Jim Clark at an extreme risk to his personal safety entered the garage filled
with fire and super heated toxic gas to open the garage door providing a better opportunity to
tight the fire; and

WHEREAS, Jim Clark and Bob Ashton with garden hoses suppressed the fire, keeping it
from spreading into the ceiling and the rest of the house while the Fire and Police Departments
responded to the scene; and

WHEREAS, the actions of Jim Clark, Kristin Clark and Bob Ashton protected the life of the
residents and stopped the fire from spreading throughout the garage and the rest of the house,
saving hundreds of thousands of dollars in property damages.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, that L, Jerry B. Edelen, Mayor of Del Rey Oaks,
the City Council, and all citizens of our fair City, do hereby thank Jim Clark, Kristin Clark and Bob
Ashton for their heroic actions in coming to the immediate aid of their fellow Del Rey Oaks

citizens.
Dated this 16th day of November 2010

JERRY B. EDELEN, Mayor



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
STAFF REPORT

TO: Honorable Mayor and City Council

FROM: Sydney Moe

DATE: November 16, 2010

SUBJECT: NATIONAL POLLUTANT DISCHARGE AND ELIMINATION

SYSTEM PERMIT COMPLIANCE

PURPOSE

The purpose of this item is for the City Council to review the Monterey Regional Storm Water
Management Plan.

RECOMMENDATION

It is recommended that the City Council review the Monterey Regional Storm Water
Management Plan.

BACKGROUND

In 1972, Congress amended the Federal Water Pollution Control Act (also referred to as the
Clean Water Act) to prohibit the discharges of pollutants to waters of the United States. The
Environmental Protection Agency implemented this act through the creation of a National
Pollutant Discharge Elimination System (NPDES) permit. In the State of California, this
requirement is enforced by the California Regional Water Quality Control Board.

In order to comply with the requirements of the NPDES permit, the City of Del Rey Oaks joined
efforts with adjacent jurisdictions to create the Monterey Regional Storm Water Management
Program (MRSWMP). Participating entities are joined together with a Memorandum of
Understanding include the Cities of Del Rey Oaks, Seaside, Monterey, Pacific Grove, Sand City,
Carmel-by-the-Sea, Marina, and the County of Monterey.

A Management Committee comprised of one staff representative from each entity was formed to
develop the permit and provide overall program coordination, review, and budget oversight. The
Management Committee holds regular monthly meetings and the City of Del Rey Oaks is
represented by Sydney Moe, Junior Engineer for the City of Seaside. Program cost sharing is
based upon population and a budget for the Group is created annually.

For fiscal year 2010/2011 the group program cost to the City of Del Rey Oaks was $5,535, or
approximately 2% of the group budget. The two major costs incurred by the Group are the full
time Program Manager position, hosted by Monterey Regional Water Pollution Control District



Honorable Mayor and City Council November 4, 2010
National Pollutant Discharge Elimination System Permit Page 2

and held by Heidi Niggemeyer, and the Public Education and Public Outreach program. Other
costs included in the budget are water quality monitoring and group program implementation.

The Monterey Regional Storm Water Management Program (MRSWMP) outlines specific tasks,
referred to as Best Management Practices, grouped into six Minimum Control Measures
(MCM’s), which the City is required to perform in order to maintain compliance. These MCM’s
are conducted throughout the year and reported on through an Annual Report to the California
Regional Water Quality Control Board (RWQCB). The six MCM’s are as follows:

Minimum Control Measure 1 & 2: Public Education and Outreach

The intent is to distribute educational materials and conduct presentations to the community to
educate residents. The target audience is mostly school age children reached through classroom
activities and presentations, but there is also media advertising on the radio, television, and in
print targeted at all age groups.

Minimum Control Measure 3: Illicit Discharge Detection and Elimination

The intent is to develop, implement, and enforce a program to detect and eliminate illicit
discharges within the City. This includes performing inspections of all Automotive, Restaurant,
and Gasoline and Auto Repair business, which is completed under contract with Monterey
Regional Water Pollution Control District Source Control. lllicit discharges are identified by
Public Works and Park Crew Staff, Code Enforcement, Police Patrol and members of the public.
Examples of illicit discharges are anything that is non-storm water including: car washing
(excluding personal residential vehicle on private property), pressure washing of sidewalks,
driveways or buildings, and any obvious pollutant such as motor vehicle fluids or trash/debris.

Minimum Control Measure 4: Construction Site Storm Water Runoff Control

The intent is to develop, implement, and enforce a program to reduce pollutants from
construction activities. This requires the City to perform a site plan review of all development
projects and inspect construction activities.

Minimum Control Measure 5: Post-Construction Storm Water Management in New and
Redevelopment

The intent is to develop, implement, and enforce a program to reduce pollutants from new
construction and renovation projects. This requires the City to condition public and private
development projects to consider water quantity and quality impacts and mitigate them through
different available options.

Minimum Control Measure 6: Pollution Prevention/Good Housekeeping for Municipal
Operations

The intent is to have standard municipal operations conducted in a manner that considers storm
water runoff. This includes activities such as proper training, fleet maintenance, street sweeping,
storm drain system cleaning, and parks and open space management.

The Del Rey Oaks Permit Year 4 Annual Report has recently been completed and will be
submitted with the rest of the Group to the RWQCB on November 22, 2010.



MEETING OF THE CITY OF DEL REY OAKS CITY COUNCIL
CONVENED AT 6:00 P.M. ON TUESDAY, OCTOBER 26, 2010 IN
THE CHARLES BENSON MEMORIAL HALL, CITY HALL

Present: Council Members Cecilio, Zuccaro, Allion and Mayor Edelen
Absent: Council Member Clark

Also present: City Attorney Callihan, City Manager Dawson and Deputy City
Clerk Minami

Meeting came to order at 6:00 p.m. and roll call was taken.

PLEDGE OF ALLEGIANCE
Council Member Zuccaro: Led the Pledge of Allegiance

COMMUNICATIONS: None

PROCLAMATION:

The Council considered ITEM 4.A. Proclaim Monterey County Veterans
of the Year for 2010 honoring Del Rey Oaks resident: Gerald Flowers
Mayor Edelen: Read the proclamation into the record and presented it Mr.
Flowers.
Mr. Flowers: Deeply honored and thanked the Council.

PUBLIC COMMENT:

Henry OLaughlin, of 8 Setter Place: Read a Thank You note from several
residents on Setter Place and Quendale Ave. They appreciated the quick
response to last month’s concern of work needing to be done on the street.

CONSENT AGENDA:
The Council considered the following items:
A. MINUTES:

1. August 24, 2010, Regular City Council Meeting (This
item was continued from a previous meeting due to lack
of quorum)

2. September 28, 2010, Regular City Council Meeting

Page 1 of 4



B. MONTHLY REPORTS:
1. Claims, September 2010
2. Financials, September 2010
3. Fire Department Response Report, September 2010
4. Police Activity Report, September 2010

Motion by Council Member Cecilio to approve the consent agenda, motion
seconded by Council Member Allion.

There was no public comment received

Motion passed 4-0

OLD BUSINESS: None

NEW BUSINESS:
Action Items
A.Resolution 2010-22, A Resolution approving the changes to the
Association of Monterey Bay Area Governments’ (AMBAG) By-
Laws.
Council Member Allion: How much do we pay AMBAG?
City Manager Dawson: Under a thousand dollars a year.
Council Member Zuccaro: The fee is based on population of the
City.
Motion by Council Member Zuccaro to approve item 8.A. Resolution 2010-22,
motion seconded by Council Member Cecilio.
There was no public comment received
Motion passed 4-0

B. Resolution 2010-23, A Resolution Designating a City Consultant

as the Authorized City Representative to Examine Sales and Use
Tax Records.
City Manager Dawson: Muni-Services will be the consultant for
the City and have access to the State Board of Equalization
information for the City. They will audit and scrutinize what the
City is receiving from the State.
Council Member Zuccaro: What will be the cost to the City?
City Manager Dawson: A percentage of the findings.
Council Member Allion: Makes good sense.

Motion by Council Member Allion to approve item 8.B. Resolution 2010-23,

motion seconded by Council Member Zuccaro.

There was no public comment received

Motion passed 4-0

Page 2 of 4



C. Resolution 2010-24, A Resolution approving the application for
Grant Funds for the Roberti-Z'Berg-Harris Block Grant Program
under the California Clean Water, Clean Air, Safe Neighborhood
Parks, and Coastal Protection Act of 2002.
D. Resolution 2010-25, A Resolution approving the application for
Grant Funds for the Roberti-Z'Berg-Harris Urban Open Space and
Recreation Program under the Safe Neighborhood Parks, Clean
Water, Clean Air and Coastal Protection Bond Act of 2000.
Mayor Edelen: Both Resolution 2010-24 and 25 will be heard and
a motion will be made for both at the same time.
City Manager Dawson: Formality to complete grant process.
These will be in addition to the $95,000 grant. These grant funds,
among other things, will repair Old Towne Hall, buy new park
equipment, and repair Work Ave stairway.
Motion by Council Member Cecilio to approve item 8.C.and 8.C. Resolutions
2010-24 & 2010-25, motion seconded by Council Member Allion.
There was no public comment received
Motion passed 4-0

Staff report:

City Manager Dawson: Attended the ICMA conference for free, because he
volunteered for four hours to greet guests. Attended a lot of meetings this
month regarding water. He, Marina Coast Water, Seaside Sanitation, and FORA
had a special meeting regarding the sewer line that will “for sure” be installed
before the road is complete. Marina Coast Water will pay the $38,000 for it now
and then Seaside Sanitation will pay. There will be a ribbon cutting ceremony on
November 1% for General Jim Moore Blvd, at 11:00am. Meeting on November
10, at the Airport to address the EIR for the work that is planned.

Council Members:

Council Member Allion: Listened to a Scientist from Hopkins Marine at the
Alternative Café on Fremont St. about the brine from the desalination plants can
eventually harm certain sea animals. Spoke to Keith Israel of MRWPCA and he
says that the brine will be diluted. Attended the Monterey Regional Water
Pollution Control Agency meeting.

Council Member Zuccaro: Attended AMBAG meeting, study being done on the
use of Van Pools for Agriculture Workers.

Page 3 of 4



Mayor Edelen: Attended the Yes on 22 meeting and Carl Sedoryk was there and
spoke on what will happen if it doesn’t pass. Attended all of his regularly
scheduled meetings, as well as, a special meeting with all the Peninsula Mayors
and City Managers regarding the water project. Nothing was resolved at this
meeting, but the Cal-Am rate payers want the Mayor’s involved.

Federal Development LLC, has filed a claim against the City and will be heard on
November 16%. All other information will be discussed in closed session.
Congratulations to the City Attorney, Chris Callihan, he placed in the top third
of the Orange County Triathlon. Read thank you note from the Monterey
Peninsula Volunteer Services.

6:34 p.m.: Adjourned

6:36 p.m.: Reconvened into closed session

7:30 p.m.: Adjourned from closed session into open session and reported the
following:

City Manager Dawson: Information was received, no action was taken.

7:32 p.m.: Meeting adjourned

Next meeting: Tuesday, November 16th, 2010, 6 p.m.

Approved

Date

Page 4 of 4



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

Claims Report
October 2010
Date Num Name Memo Amount
AFLAC

10/4/2010 11693 AFLAC Premiums-employee paid-INV. 825269 266.60
Total AFLAC 266.60
AT&T CAL NET 2

10/4/2010 11694 AT&T CAL NET 2 PHONE AUG 2010 220.21
Total AT&T CAL NET 2 220.21
BYTE TECHNOLOGY

10/4/2010 11695 BYTE TECHNOLOGY INV 6014 AND 6058 93.75
Total BYTE TECHNOLOGY 93.75
CALIFORNIA-AMERICAN WATER

10/4/2010 11696 CALIFORNIA-AME...  JUL 22-AUG 20, 2010 115.86
Total CALIFORNIA-AMERICAN WATER 115.86
Cecilio, Jeffrey

10/5/2010 11717 Cecilio, Jeffrey Replace paycheck #11448 - voided 97.45
Total Cecilio, Jeffrey 97.45
CENTRAL COAST TREE AND TIMBER SERV

10/4/2010 11697 CENTRAL COAST T... END OF LOS ENCINOS TRIM PINE TREE, HAUL AWAY ALL WOOD AND DEB... 800.00
Total CENTRAL COAST TREE AND TIMBER SERV 800.00
CITY OF MONTEREY

10/4/2010 11698 CITY OF MONTEREY REPAIRS/FUEL/PLAN CHECKS/BUILDING INSPECTIONS 3,023.74

10/13/2010 11729 CITY OF MONTEREY  VOID: COST SHARE FIRE JPA-this was in the bills to be paid, and was printed in error.

10/13/2010 11729 CITY OF MONTEREY  VOID: COST SHARE FIRE JPA-this was in the bills to be paid, and was printed in error.

10/13/2010 11725 CITY OF MONTEREY COST SHARE FIRE JPA 232.66
Total CITY OF MONTEREY 3,256.40
CITY OF SALINAS, ATTORNEY SERVICES

10/4/2010 11699 CITY OF SALINAS, ... AUG 2010 CITY ATTORNEY SERVICES-INVOICE 226120 1,015.52
Total CITY OF SALINAS, ATTORNEY SERVICES 1,015.52
CO-POWER

10/13/2010 11719 CO-POWER NOV 10 DELTA DENTAL PREMIUM 2,017.09
Total CO-POWER 2,017.09
COMCAST HIGH SPEED INTERNET

10/4/2010 11700 COMCAST HIGH SP... INTERNET-AUGUST 66.63
Total COMCAST HIGH SPEED INTERNET 66.63
COUNTY OF MONTEREY

10/4/2010 11701 COUNTY OF MONT... 3 mobile computer system/network access to County Information 76.00
Total COUNTY OF MONTEREY 76.00
CRAZY DRAINS INC.

10/26/2010 11730 CRAZY DRAINS INC. CLEAN OUT IN MENS PARK TOILET LINE (WEEKEND) 147.00

Page 1



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

Claims Report
October 2010
Date Num Name Memo Amount
Total CRAZY DRAINS INC. 147.00
ENTERSECT CORPORATION

10/4/2010 11702 ENTERSECT CORP...  INVOICE #35430/POLICE ONLINE SERVICE-JULY 2010 79.00

10/26/2010 11731 ENTERSECT CORP...  INVOICE #35804/POLICE ONLINE SERVICE-AUG 2010 79.00
Total ENTERSECT CORPORATION 158.00
FIRST AMERICAN REAL ESTATE SOLUTIONS

10/4/2010 11703 FIRST AMERICAN ... METRO SCAN- ADDRESS SERVICE-SEPT 2010 104.17

10/13/2010 11720 FIRST AMERICAN ... METRO SCAN- ADDRESS SERVICE-AUG 2010 104.17
Total FIRST AMERICAN REAL ESTATE SOLUTIONS 208.34
FIRST NATIONAL BANK CHARGE

10/4/2010 FIRST NATIONAL B... Bankcard Fee 1.38

10/4/2010 FIRST NATIONAL B... Merchant Bankcard Fee 69.90

10/7/2010 CCADJ FIRST NATIONAL B... Bank Fees 3.13

10/12/2010 CCADJ FIRST NATIONAL B... Bank Fees 0.82

10/13/2010 FIRST NATIONAL B... Bankcard Fee 0.82

10/20/2010 CCADJ FIRST NATIONAL B... Bank Fees 1.48

10/21/2010 CCADJ FIRST NATIONAL B... Bank Fees 2.46

10/25/2010 FIRST NATIONAL B... Bank Analysis Fee 58.09
Total FIRST NATIONAL BANK CHARGE 138.08
GLOBALSTAR USA

10/13/2010 11721 GLOBALSTAR USA SATELITE PHONE 26.76
Total GLOBALSTAR USA 26.76
HOME DEPOT CRC

10/13/2010 11722 HOME DEPOT CRC ACCT. # 6035 3220 0248 6219 466.17
Total HOME DEPOT CRC 466.17
LM.P.A.C.GOVERNM'T SER

10/26/2010 11732 L.M.P.A.C.GOVERN... POLICE EQUIPMENT, COMPUTER PROGRAM, PUBLIC WORK EQUIPMENT, ... 1,948.76
Total LM.P.A.C.GOVERNM'T SER 1,948.76
JAMES DE CHALK

10/4/2010 11704 JAMES DE CHALK AUG 2010 375.00
Total JAMES DE CHALK 375.00
KELLY-MOORE PAINT CO.INC

10/4/2010 11705 KELLY-MOORE PAIL.. SUPPLIES 32.26
Total KELLY-MOORE PAINT CO.INC 32.26
M&S BUILDING SUPPLY, INC.

10/4/2010 11706 M&S BUILDING SU... SUPPLIES AUG 2010 21.48
Total M&S BUILDING SUPPLY, INC. 21.48
MINAMI, KAREN

10/29/2010 11728 MINAMI, KAREN Wellness Reimbursement 43.50

Page 2



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

Claims Report
October 2010
Date Num Name Memo Amount

Total MINAMI, KAREN 43.50
MINAMI, KAREN L

10/14/2010 11727 MINAMI, KAREN L Wellness Reimbursment 170.52
Total MINAMI, KAREN L 170.52
MONTEREY AUTO SUPPLY INC.

10/4/2010 11707 MONTEREY AUTO ... VOID: AUTO SUPPLIES/PREVIOUSLY PAID

10/4/2010 11707 MONTEREY AUTO ... VOID: AUTO SUPPLIES/PREVIOUSLY PAID
Total MONTEREY AUTO SUPPLY INC.
MONTEREY BAY AREA INSURANCE FUND

10/13/2010 11723 MONTEREY BAY A... MONTHLY INSTALLMENT FOR W/C LOAN $3033.26 AND MONTHLY PAYM... 11,366.68
Total MONTEREY BAY AREA INSURANCE FUND 11,366.68
MONTEREY BAY TECHNOLOGIES

10/4/2010 11708 MONTEREY BAY T... IT SERVICES AUG RETAINER 350.00
Total MONTEREY BAY TECHNOLOGIES 350.00
NEXTEL COMMUNICATION

10/4/2010 11709 NEXTEL COMMUNI... NEXTEL RADIO- CLK/PW/PD/CM 537.45
Total NEXTEL COMMUNICATION 537.45
OFFICE DEPOT

10/4/2010 11710 OFFICE DEPOT 236.57

10/26/2010 11733 OFFICE DEPOT 141.83
Total OFFICE DEPOT 378.40
OFFICE EQUIPMENT FINANCE SERVICES

10/26/2010 11734 OFFICE EQUIPMEN... LEASE PAYMENT FOR COPIER-OCT. 10 270.11
Total OFFICE EQUIPMENT FINANCE SERVICES 270.11
P.E.R.S.-HEALTH

10/4/2010 11711 P.E.R.S.-HEALTH HEALTH PREMIUM OCT 2010 12,651.43
Total P.E.R.S.-HEALTH 12,651.43
PERS

10/4/2010 11712 PERS Payroll 09-2010-01 9,897.36

10/26/2010 11735 PERS Payroll 09-2010-02 8,734.21
Total PERS 18,631.57
PG&E

10/13/2010 11726 PG&E GAS 7/15/10-8/16/10 ELEC.7/15/10-8/25/10 2,128.17
Total PG&E 2,128.17
PG&E-GJM&218

10/13/2010 11724 PG&E-GIM&218 6817283169-2 44.24

10/26/2010 11736 PG&E-GIM&218 6817283169-2 41.60

Page 3



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

Claims Report
October 2010
Date Name Memo Amount
Total PG&E-GIM&218 85.84
PITNEY BOWES-QTLY INV
10/4/2010 11713 PITNEY BOWES-QT...  postage 228.00
Total PITNEY BOWES-QTLY INV 228.00
PITNEY BOWES PURCHASE POWER
10/4/2010 11714 PITNEY BOWES PU... POSTAGE ACCT. 8000900003463050 234.79
Total PITNEY BOWES PURCHASE POWER 234.79
QuickBooks Payroll Service
10/14/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Monthly processing fee for October 2010 69.00
10/14/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  No state fee for CA for October 2010
10/14/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Fee for 13 employee(s) paid 13.00
10/14/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Fee for 12 direct deposit(s) at $1.25 each 15.00
10/14/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/12/2010 4,032.00
10/14/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/12/2010 523.65
10/14/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/12/2010 523.65
10/14/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/12/2010 1,357.55
10/14/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/12/2010 279.62
10/14/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/12/2010 26,540.44
10/20/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Fee for 1 employee(s) paid 1.00
10/20/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Fee for 1 direct deposit(s) at $1.25 each 1.25
10/20/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/19/2010 16.24
10/20/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/19/2010 16.24
10/20/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/19/2010 12.31
10/20/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/19/2010 1,091.05
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Fee for 5 employee(s) paid 5.00
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Fee for 1 direct deposit(s) at $1.25 each 1.25
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 9.06
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 9.06
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 5.78
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 316.71
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 98.55
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Fee for 1 employee(s) paid 1.00
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 681.00
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 76.80
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 76.80
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 289.54
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Fee for 14 employee(s) paid 14.00
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Fee for 14 direct deposit(s) at $1.25 each 17.50
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 4,388.00
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 532.04
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 532.04
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 1,502.76
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 285.98
10/28/2010 QuickBooks Payroll S...  Created by Payroll Service on 10/27/2010 29,162.87
Total QuickBooks Payroll Service 72,497.74

Page 4



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

Claims Report
October 2010
Date Num Name Memo Amount

RED SHIFT INTERNET SERV

10/26/2010 11737 RED SHIFT INTERN... INTERNET SEPT 2010 20.25
Total RED SHIFT INTERNET SERV 20.25
SHELL OIL COMPANY

10/4/2010 11715 SHELL OIL COMPA... ACCT 079-056-693-FUEL FOR AUG 10 225.88

10/26/2010 11738 SHELL OIL COMPA... ACCT 079-056-693-FUEL FOR SEPT 10 149.00
Total SHELL OIL COMPANY 374.88
US BANK SUPPLY

10/4/2010 11716 US BANK SUPPLY INV I 8493/HEIGHT TAPE FOR P.D. 17.96
Total US BANK SUPPLY 17.96

TOTAL 131,534.65

Page 5



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

FISCAL YEAR 2010/2011 BUDGET VS. ACTUAL
July through October 2010
Actual Total for 2010- FY 2010-2011 % of Annual
2011 Budget Budget
REVENUE
3100 - PROPERTY TAXES
3105 P/T-SECURED $2,075.93 $353,304.00 0.59%
3107 - P/T-UNITARY TAX $5,533.00
3110 P/T-UNSECURED $61.26 $14,452.00 0.42%
3120-P/T-SB813 $2,662.00
3130 P/T-PRIOR SECURED $2,450.94 $21,742.00 11.27%
3132 - PRIOR UNSECURED $84.00
3135 PROPERTY TAX - VLF $121,084.00
3140 - P/T-INT/PENAL $328.00
3145 - P/T - ADMINISTRATIVE FEE ($907.05) ($7,500.00) 12.09%
Total 3100 - PROPERTY TAXES $3,681.08 $511,689.00 0.72%
3200 - OTHER TAXES
3202 - MANDATED COSTS $4,000.00
3205 - SALES TAX $75,718.50 $255,000.00 29.69%
3206 - SALES TAXIN LIEU - 3-FLIP $77,000.00
3208 - Sales Tax - Add On $131,188.88 $388,000.00 33.81%
3209 COP MONIES $30,506.10 $100,000.00 30.51%
3210 - PROPERTY TRANSFER TAX $5,000.00
3220 - GAS FRANCHISES $7,000.00
3225 - ELECTRIC FRANCHISES $15,500.00
3235 GARBAGE FRANCHISES $18,006.39 $40,000.00 45.02%
3240 - CABLE TV FRANCHISES $12,056.07 $25,000.00 48.22%
3245 - WATER FRANCHISES $9,000.00
3851 - SEWER IMPACT $8,500.00
Total 3200 - OTHER TAXES $267,475.94 $934,000.00 28.64%
3300 - LICENSES & PERMITS
3301 - BUSINESS LICENSES $162,894.31 $190,000.00 85.73%
3305 - BUILDING PERMITS $2,872.45 $15,000.00 19.15%
3310 - PLAN CHECK FEES $2,002.81 $7,500.00 26.7%
3315 STREET OPENING PERMITS FEES $200.00 $2,500.00 8.0%
3325 - PLUMBING PERMITS $880.00 $1,000.00 88.0%
3330 ELECTRICAL PERMITS $100.00 $1,000.00 10.0%
3340 - ENVIRON ASSESS FEES/PERMIT $1,000.00
3342 . DEVELOPER PYMT FEES/PERMITS $500.00
3345 OTHER LICENSES/PERMITS $113.60 $500.00 22.72%
Total 3300 - LICENSES & PERMITS $169,063.17 $219,000.00 77.2%
3400 - FINES & FORFEITURES
3401 - VEHICLE CODE FINES $6,710.52 $15,000.00 44.74%
3415 - OTHER COURT FINES $1,000.00
Total 3400 - FINES & FORFEITURES $6,710.52 $16,000.00 41.94%

Page 1 of 4




CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

FISCAL YEAR 2010/2011 BUDGET VS. ACTUAL
July through October 2010
Actual Total for 2010- FY 2010-2011 % of Annual
2011 Budget Budget
3501 - INTEREST EARNED $888.73 $12,000.00 7.41%
3600 - OTHER AGENCY REVENUE
3602 - MOTOR VEHICLE LICENSE FEE(MVLF) $2,474.43 $3,000.00 82.48%
3603 - OFF HIGHWAY $100.00
3604 - HOPTR $1,200.00
3605 - VEHICLE LICENSE COLLECTION $1,000.00
3620-PROP 172 $8,000.00
3648 - GRANTS $25,000.00
3649 - TRAFFIC CONGESTION RELIEF-AB438 $4,129.61 $10,000.00 41.3%
3655 - POLICE GRANTS OTHER AGENCIES $1,000.00
3600 - OTHER AGENCY REVENUE - Other $5.00
Total 3600 - OTHER AGENCY REVENUE $6,609.04 $49,300.00 13.41%
3700 - CURRENT SERVICES
3703 - USE PERMITS $2,275.00 $3,000.00 75.83%
3704 - MAPS/PUBLICATIONS $100.00
3706 - RENTAL INCOME $3,402.00 $9,600.00 35.44%
3707 - POLICE REPORTS $310.00 $1,400.00 22.14%
3709 - PROPERTY INSPECTIONS $500.00 $1,300.00 38.46%
3710 - POLICE SERVICES $4,000.00 $10,000.00 40.0%
3711 - PUBLIC EVENTS $32,400.00 $80,000.00 40.5%
3712 - MISCELLANEOUS SERVICES $1,414.66 $1,000.00 141.47%
3715 - PD DONATIONS $609.24 $1,500.00 40.62%
3700 - CURRENT SERVICES - Other $100.00
Total 3700 - CURRENT SERVICES $45,010.90 $107,900.00 41.72%
3800 - PARKS/RECREATION
3801 - PARK RENTAL $1,400.00 $10,000.00 14.0%
3802 RV RENTAL PARKS $9,265.00 $26,000.00 35.64%
Total 3800 - PARKS/RECREATION $10,665.00 $36,000.00 29.63%
3900 -0THER
2103 - GAS TAX 2103 $393.51
3610 GAS TAX 2107 $3,143.79 $13,500.00 23.29%
3612 - GAS TAX 2106 $2,165.94 $9,000.00 24.07%
3614 - GAS TAX 2107.5 $1,000.00 $900.00 111.11%
3616 - GAS TAX 2105 $2,319.84 $9,000.00 25.78%
3900 - OTHER - Other ($4,678.08)
Total 3900 - OTHER $4,345.00 $32,400.00 13.41%
TOTAL REVENUE $514,449.38 $1,918,289.00 26.82%

Page 2 of 4



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

FISCAL YEAR 2010/2011 BUDGET VS. ACTUAL

July through October 2010

Actual Total for 2010- FY 2010-2011 % of Annual
2011 Budget Budget
EXPENDITURES
10000 - Payroll & Benefits
10009 - OVERTIME $15,244.81 $25,000.00 60.98%
10010 - PAYROLL $330,921.94 $826,000.00 40.06%
100101 - COUNCIL MEMBER STIPEND $2,097.45 $6,000.00 34.96%
100103 - RESERVES PAYROLL $15,135.87 $31,710.00 47.73%
10011 - PERS $66,513.54 $165,000.00 40.31%
10012 - MEDICARE $5,313.70 $11,000.00 48.31%
10013 - DENTAL EXPENSE $8,088.36 $26,750.00 30.24%
10014 - HEALTH INS $50,636.13 $132,500.00 38.22%
10015 - VISION INS $505.98 $2,800.00 18.07%
10016 - WORKERS COMP $45,949.12 $136,400.00 33.69%
10018 - WELLNESS PROGRAM $4,307.30 $13,200.00 32.63%
10120 - UNIFORM ALLOWANCE $3,250.00 $5,000.00 65.0%
Total 10000 - Payroll & Benefits $547,964.20 $1,381,360.00 39.67%
20100 - Payroll Expenses $572.42 $500.00 114.48%
20119 - Bank Service Charges $452.25 $500.00 90.45%
20120 --SUPPLIES
20121 - MATERIALS/SUPPLY $23,246.11 $43,500.00 53.44%
20122 - REPAIR/MAINTENANCE $7,050.31 $20,000.00 35.25%
20160 - OFFICE SUPPLIES $1,747.48 $3,089.00 56.57%
Total 20120 - -SUPPLIES $32,043.90 $66,589.00 48.12%
20130 - UTILITES & SERVICES
20126 - STREET SWEEPING $4,774.16 $1,200.00 397.85%
20127 - GABILAN CREW $553.91 $2,000.00 27.7%
201341 - UTILITIES/PGE $2,224.04 $7,500.00 29.65%
20132 - UTILITIES/WATER $862.13 $5,000.00 17.24%
20140 - TELEPHONE / INTERNET $3,618.63 $15,000.00 24.12%
20145 - WEBSITE DESIGN & MAINTENANCE $4,087.50 $1,500.00 272.5%
20168 - POSTAGE / SHIPPING $1,032.54 $4,113.00 25.1%
20170 - TRAVEL/CONFERENCE $1,667.02 $9,500.00 17.55%
20171 - MEMBER/DUES/CONTRIBUTIONS $5,427.59 $14,500.00 37.43%
20172 - AD/PROMOTION CITY CNCL $1,253.45 $1,500.00 83.56%
20173 - LEGAL ADVERT NON-DEPT $215.00 $1,000.00 21.5%
20174 - BOOK/PERIODICAL $100.00
204175 - MEETING CITY CNCL $143.75 $1,000.00 14.38%
Total 20130 - UTILITES & SERVICES $25,859.72 $63,913.00 40.46%
20176 - PRINTING / PUBLICATIONS $500.00
20180 - OUTSIDE SERVICES
20178 - TRAINING POLICE $4,465.21 $8,000.00 55.82%
20181 - OTHER PERMITS PW/ENGNR $35.30 $2,000.00 1.77%
20191 - EQUIPMENT MAINT $1,993.05 $21,500.00 9.27%

Page 30f 4




CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

FISCAL YEAR 2010/2011 BUDGET VS. ACTUAL
July through October 2010
Actual Total for 2010- FY 2010-2011 % of Annual
2011 Budget Budget
30044 - LIABILITY/PROP NON-DPT $14,032.76 $25,000.00 56.13%
30113 - CONTRACTUAL AUDIT $975.00 $25,000.00 3.9%
30115 - DATA PROCESSING $2,159.04 $3,500.00 61.69%
30116 - CONTRACTUAL SVCS PLANNING / ENG $1,608.57 $25,000.00 6.43%
30119 - CONTRACTUAL SVCS - LEGAL $1,015.52 $20,000.00 5.08%
30120 - CONTRL RETAINER LEGAL $1,081.04 $12,000.00 9.01%
30126 - JANITORIAL FUND $1,275.00 $4,200.00 30.36%
30127 - RADIO DISPATCH POLICE $38,259.50 $42,500.00 90.02%
30165 - COMM HUM SERV NON-DEPT $3,057.00 $3,500.00 87.34%
Total 20180 - OUTSIDE SERVICES $69,956.99 $192,200.00 36.4%
30170 - AUTO OPERATION
30181 - AUTO OPS - SUPPLIES / EQUIP $406.94 $5,000.00 8.14%
30182 - AUTO OPS - FUEL $3,763.72 $25,000.00 15.06%
30190 - AUTO REPAIR/MAINTENANCE $4,088.72 $19,000.00 21.52%
Total 30170 - AUTO OPERATION $8,259.38 $49,000.00 16.86%
30180 - POLICE AND FIRE
30183 - FUND JAIL & PRISONER $582.06 $1,000.00 58.21%
30184 - ACJIS SYSTEM POLICE $1,120.88 $1,527.00 73.4%
301861 - FIRE SEASIDE $52,496.36 $116,000.00 45.26%
30187 - ANIMAL REGULATION FIRE $889.14 $2,500.00 35.57%
Total 30180 - POLICE AND FIRE $55,088.44 $121,027.00 45.52%
30200 - STREETS & STORM WATER
30219-S.M.I.P. $200.00
30220-SB 1473 $3.40
30230 - STREET LIGHTING $4,241.74 $17,000.00 24.95%
30231 - STORM WATER PROJECT - PHASE1&2 $496.67 $5,500.00 9.03%
Total 30200 - STREETS & STORM WATER $4,741.81 $22,700.00 20.89%
60001 - AUTO LEASE PAYMENTS $19,970.61 $20,000.00 99.85%
TOTAL EXPENDITURES $764,909.72 $1,918,289.00 39.88%
Total Revenue $514,449.38
Total Expenditures $764,909.72
Total Operating Revenue Less Expenditures This
Fiscal Year to Date ($250,460.34)

Page 4 of 4




CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
CASH FUNDS BALANCE REPORT
AS OF OCTOBER 31, 2010

CITY OF DEL REY OAKS

CASH BALANCES AS OF OCTOBER 31, 2010

1000 - GENERAL CHECKING $32,477.74
1008 - LAIF CITY - 246 $412,540.36
Total City Checking/Savings $445,018.10
REDEVELOPMENT AGENCY
CASH BALANCES AS OF OCTOBER 31, 2010

10-1001 - GENERAL CHECKING $7,380.38
10-1003 - DUFFY EIR/CEQA CHECKING $23,718.07
10-1002 - LAIF RDA ACCOUNT $20,778.47
Total RDA Checking/Savings $51,876.92
GRAND TOTAL CASH BALANCES $496,895.02

Pagelof 1



CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
FISCAL YEAR 2010-2011 CAPITAL OUTLAY BUDGET VS ACTUAL

JULY 1, 2010 - JUNE 30, 2011

Actual Totals for FY 2010-2011 |
2010-2011 Budget
Other Income/Expense
Other Income

4900 - CAPITAL OUTLAY FUND
3625 - 2000 PARK BOND GRANT
3627 - 2002 Parks Resources Bond Act 99,255.00
3720 - Portola/Carlton (Prop 1B) CIP 400,000.00
3730 - Portola/Work Walkway (MPRPD) 12,500.00
3740 - Stream Blockage (State)
3750 - Portola/Work Street (TAMC)
3760 - City Monument Sign Proceeds

Total 4900 - CAPITAL OUTLAY FUND 511,755.00

Other Expense

50400 - CAPITAL OUTLAY
50420 - MONUMENT SIGN
50430 - PORTOLA / CARLTON (PROP 1B) 400,000.00
50440 - PORTOLA / WORK WALKWAY (MPRPD) 12,500.00
50450 - 2000 PARKS BOND ACT
50460 - 2002 PARKS RESOURCES BOND ACT 99,255.00
50470 - STREAM BLOCKAGE (STATE GRANT)
50480 - PORTOLA / WORK STREET (TAMC)

Total 50400 - CAPITAL OUTLAY 511,755.00

Pagelof 1



FIRE DEPARTMENT
1635 Broadway Avenue Telephone (831) 899-6790
Seaside, CA 93955 FAX (831) 899-6261

November 1, 2010

Chief Langford

Del Rey Oaks City Hall
650 Canyon Del Rey

Del Rey Oaks, CA 93940

Dear Chief Langford:

Enclosed is a copy of the response repotts for the Seaside Fire Department response to Del Rey
Oaks for the period of October 1, 2010 thru October 31, 2010.

The City of Del Rey Oaks will be billed for the following incident numbers;

Incident #
10-1801
10-1806
10-1813
10-1842
10-1851
10-1893

There are a total of six fire calls for the month of October. If you have any questions, please
contact me.

Sincerely,

Kathryn Pernet
Sr. Administrative Assistant

CC: File



Seaside Fire

Incident List by Alarm Date/Time

Alarm Date Between {10/01/2010} And {10/31/2010}
and Digtrict = "Q29"

Incident-Exp# Alm Date Alm Time Location Incident Type
10-0001738-000 10/03/2010 19:12:00 249 VIA VERDE RD /Del Rey 6111 Cancelled upon arrival, no
10-0001801-000 10/15/2010 11:57:00 1004 PORTOLA DR /Pel Rey 321 EMS call, excluding vehicle
10-0001804-000 10/15/2010 18:57:00 815 CANYON DEL REY BLVD / 611 Dispatched & cancelled en ro
10-0001806-000-10/15/2010 22:05:00 1091 ROSITA RD /Del Rey O 321 EMS call, excluding vehicle
1070001809-000 10/16/2010 20:27:00 141 QUAIL RUN CT /Del Rey 6111 Cancelled upon arrival, no
10-0001813-000 10/17/2010 06:40:00 811 AVALON PL /Del Rey Oa 321 EMS call, excluding vehicle
10-0001818-000 10/17/2010 23:34:00 815 CANYON DEL REY BLVD / 611 Dispatched & cancelled en ro
10-0001842-000 -10/22/2010 14:35:00 431 QUAIL RUN CT /Del Rey 321 EMS call, excluding vehicle
KWlD/ZB/ZOlO 10:43:00 632 PHEASANT RIDGE RD /De 611 Dispatched & cancelled en ro
10—009}3&.‘&“—_@% 10/24/2010 14:26:00 815 CANYON DEL REY BLVD / 321 EMS call, excluding vehicle
IIKO_:_OOO,1893-000‘10/31/2010 10:36:00 1080 PALOMA RD /Del Rey O 520 Water problem, Other
Total Incident Count 11

<

——



Del Rey Oaks Police Department
Monthly Report of Activity
OCTOBER —2010
Completed By: Ron Langford, COP

ARRESTS: Prior Year
Felony Arrests 03
Misdemeanor Arrests 08
Warrant Arrests (OJ) 01
TOTAL ARRESTS 12 06
REPORTS FILED:

23 13
BURGLARIES: Prior Year
Residential
Commercial
From Locked Vehicle
Other
TOTAL BURGLARIES 00 00
GRAND & PETTY THEFTS: Prior Year
Residential
Commercial 01
Shoplifting 06
From Motor Vehicle
Other
TOTAL THEFTS 07 06
C|TAT|ONS |SSUED Prior Year
Traffic Citations Issued 30
Parking Citations Issued
Admin Citations Issued
TOTAL CITATION ISSUED 30 12

DROPD & Monterey County Sheriffs Deputies training on

High Risk Traffic Stops.

ASSAULTS:

Prior Year

Simple Assault 01

Domestic Violence

Weapon Involved

TOTAL ASSAULTS 01 00

TRAFFIC ACCIDENTS: Prior Year

Non-Injury Accidents 06

Injury Accidents 01

TOTAL ACCIDENTS 07 02

TOWED & STORED VEHICLES: Prior Year
02 01

ALARMS: Prior Year

Residential

Commercial

TOTAL ALARMS 00 00

DU| ENFORCEMENT: Prior Year
01 01




RESOLUTION NO. 2010-26
A RESOLUTION OF THE CITY COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
CANVASSING THE NOVEMBER 2, 2010,
GENERAL MUNICIPAL ELECTION
-000-

WHEREAS, A General Municipal Election was held on Tuesday, November 2, 2010,
for the election of certain officers as required by the provisions of the laws of the State of
California; and

WHEREAS, this is the time and place specified by law for the Council to meet and
proceed to canvas the votes cast at said election.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED, BY THE City Council of the City of Del Rey Oaks
that it is found and determined:

1. That the total number of votes cast at said election was 712 and that the

following persons received the number of votes for the following offices:

a) For the Office of Mayor, Two-Year Term:
Name Number of Votes
Jerry B. Edelen 394 (100%)

That the person receiving the highest number of votes cast at said election for the
Office of Mayor was Jerry B. Edelen, and is hereby declared to be elected to said office for

a two (2) year term.

b) For the Office of Council Member, two (2) Four-Year Terms:
Name Number of Votes

Jeff Cecilio 369 (51.83%)

Dennis Allion 343 (48.17%)

2010.11.16.election.canvas.reso.doc



That two persons receiving the highest number of votes cast at said election for
the four (4) year term office of City Council Members were: Jeff Cecilio and Dennis Allion
and said persons are hereby declared to be elected for a four (4) year term to said office.

PASSED AND ADOPTED by the City Council of the City of Del Rey Oaks at a regular

meeting duly held on November 16, 2010, by the following vote:

AYES: COUNCIL MEMBERS:
NOES: COUNCIL MEMBERS:
ABSENT: COUNCIL MEMBERS:
Jerry B. Edelen, Mayor
ATTEST:

Daniel Dawson, City Clerk

2010.11.16.election.canvas.reso.doc



CITY OF MONTEREY

TO: City Manager
FROM: John Kuehl, Chief of Inspection Services/Building Official
DATE: October 1, 2010

SUBJECT:  Adopting California Building and Related Codes

RECOMMENDATION

That the City Council pass to print the attached Ordinance.

POLICY IMPLICATIONS

Adoption is consistent with past Council actions.

FISCAL IMPLICATIONS

None.

ENVIRONMENTAL DETERMINATION

The Ordinance is exempt from environmental review, per the provisions of Section 15061(b)(3)
of the California Environmental Quality Act of 1970 (“CEQA”), as amended. The Ordinance
does not have the potential to cause a significant effect on the environment because the
Building Codes ensure that property improvements meet the State of California’s health and
safety requirements. New property improvements undergo their own environmental clearance
when proposed.

ALTERNATIVES CONSIDERED

Council could choose to adopt the revised 2009 Edition of the Building Standards Codes with no
changes. However, the amendments are necessary to address local conditions and to maintain
consistency with the City of Pacific Grove.

DISCUSSION

The California Building Standards, comprised of codes regulating building, fire, electrical,
plumbing, and mechanical conditions are revised on a multi-year cycle. On January 15, 2010,
the state adopted and approved the 2009 Edition of the Building Standards Codes. These
codes were published July 2010 and will become effective January 1, 2011. At that time all
local jurisdictions are mandated to begin enforcement of these new codes and standards.

The International Code Council, a collaborative effort between the International Code Council of
Building Officials and other Building Official organizations, has prepared these codes, and they
are proposed for adoption because the standards incorporated therein are not part of the
California codes.



Typically, and in accordance with state law, local jurisdictions incorporate additional regulations
that address special circumstances in the community or area provided. Such special
regulations are based on geographical, topographical, climatic, or environmental findings. City
staff has developed and have incorporated a few local amendments to the model codes.

Because the City of Monterey currently has an adopted Green Building Program that overall is
at least as restrictive as California Code of Regulations Title 24, Part 11 (AKA Cal Green), the
City of Monterey will not be adopting Cal Green, but will continue to use the current City of
Monterey Green Building Program.

In an effort to maintain regional consistency, the City of Monterey will adopt the same Building
and Fire amendments as the City of Pacific Grove. There are no real changes to the
amendments with one exception; the administrative section that regulates when a project
expires has been modified to encourage project completion in a timely manner. To be effective,
each amendment must be adopted by the City Council along with the model codes that have
been adopted by the state.

John Kuehl Approved by Chip Rerig, AICP

Chief of Inspection Services/Building Official Chief of Planning, Engineering, and
Environmental Compliance

JK:lf:ka

Attachments: 1. Draft Ordinance

c:  Builders Exchange of the Central Coast, 100 12" Street, Building 2861, Marina, CA 93933
American Institute of Architects, Monterey Bay Chapter, PO Box 310, Monterey, CA 93942

e: Sam Mazza, Fire Chief



ORDINANCE NO. 271

AN ORDINANCE OF THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
AMENDING CHAPTER 15 OF DEL REY OAKS MUNICIPAL CODE WHICH ADOPTS
THE CITY OF MONTEREY ADOPTED CHANGES TO THE
2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AND APPENDICES | AND J;
2010 CALIFORNIA HISTORIC BUILDING CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA ELECTRIC CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE;

2010 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE INCLUDING A-J; AND
2006 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

WHEREAS, The City of Del Rey Oaks is contracted with the City of Monterey to provide
building services, plan check and inspections pursuant to Sections 17922, 17958, 17958.5 and
17958.7 of the California Health and Safety Code, the City of Monterey (“City”) may adopt the
provisions of the International Building Code, the Plumbing Code, the Mechanical Code, the
Fire Code, the Housing Code, and the National Electrical Code, to protect the health, welfare,
and safety of the citizens of Del Rey Oaks because of local climatic, geological, topographical,
and environmental conditions; and

WHEREAS, the factual findings made in the past continue to be valid and relate to the
amendments made to the International Codes in this adoption; and

WHEREAS, the City of Del Rey Oaks has made an environmental finding that the
current City of Monterey green building program as compared to title 24, Part 11 also known as
Cal Green, is determined to be more restrictive; and

WHEREAS, this Ordinance was found to be categorically exempt from environmental
review, per the provisions of Section 15061(b) (3) of the California Environmental Quality Act
(“CEQA") of 1970, as amended;

NOW THEREFORE, the Monterey City Council declares as follows:

SECTION 1: Chapter 9, 8§ 9-0.1 of the Monterey City Code is hereby amended by
deleting the current Section 9-0.1 in its entirety and replacing it to read as follows:

ARTICLE 1.0
ADOPTION OF BUILDING AND RELATED CODES

Section 9-0.1. Adoption of Codes.
Except as otherwise amended by this chapter and Chapter 13 of this City Code, the
following model codes are hereby adopted and are incorporated in this chapter by reference

and made a part hereof as if fully set forth herein:

1. 2010 CALIFORNIA BUILDING CODE AND APPENDICES |, J;



2. 2010 CALIFORNIA HISTORIC BUILDING CODE;

3. 2010 CALIFORNIA EXISTING BUILDING CODE;

4. 2010 CALIFORNIA RESIDENTIAL CODE;

5. 2010 CALIFORNIA PLUMBING CODE;

6. 2010 CALIFORNIA ELECTRIC CODE;

7. 2010 CALIFORNIA MECHANICAL CODE;

8. 2010 CALIFORNIA FIRE CODE AND APPENDICES A-J

9. 2006 INTERNATIONAL PROPERTY MAINTENANCE CODE

SECTION 2: Chapter 9, § 9-0.2 of the Monterey City Code is hereby amended by deleting
the current Section 9-0.2 in its entirety and replacing it to read as follows:

Section 9-0.2. Exemption for Pending Applications.

1. The provisions of the 2010 Editions of the California Building Code, and Appendices I,
J, the California Historic Building Code, the California Mechanical Code, the California Plumbing
Code, the California Electrical Code, the California Fire Code and appendices A-J, the 2006
International Property Maintenance Code, and the 2010 Existing Building Code, as adopted and
amended herein, shall not apply to any building or structure for which application for a building
permit was made prior to January 1, 2011. Such buildings or structures shall be erected,
constructed, enlarged, altered or repaired in accordance with the provisions of this chapter in
effect at the date of said application.

2. All other applications shall be processed in accordance with the provisions of the 2010
Editions of the California Building Code, and Appendices I, J, the California Historic Building
Code, the California Mechanical Code, the California Plumbing Code, the California Electrical
Code, the California Fire Code and appendices A-J, the 2006 International Property
Maintenance Code, and the 2010 Existing Building Code, all as adopted and amended herein.

SECTION 3: Chapter 9, § 9-1 of the Monterey City Code is hereby amended by deleting
the current Section 9-1 in its entirety and replacing it to read as follows:

ARTICLE 1.5.
AMENDMENTS TO UNIFORM CODES

Section 9-1. Amendments to California Building Code.
Section 105.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:
Section 105.3.2 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is issued within
180 days following the date of the application shall expire, and plans and other data submitted

for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the building official. The
building official may extend the time for action by the applicant for a period not exceeding 180



days on written request by the applicant showing that circumstances beyond control of the
applicant have prevented action from being taken and the extension has been submitted in
writing prior to the expiration date.

If a permit has not been obtained after the first extension, additional extensions of 90 days may
be granted provided the applicant submits this request in writing AND pays a fee equal to
$500.00 of the for each requested 90- day extension and the project has not changed in scope.

Exception: If a project has been approved by the City pending an outside agency approval prior
to expiration, written extensions will not be required.

Section 105.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 105.5 Expiration of Permits. Every permit issued by the building official under the
provisions of the technical codes shall expire and become null and void, if the project authorized
by such permit has not achieved an approval for one of the required inspections identified in
Section 110.3 of the 2010 California Building Code within one year of such permit.

The building official may grant a one-time permit extension of 180 (one-hundred eighty) days
provided the applicant submits a request in writing prior to the permit expiration and the project
has not changed in scope. Additional extension requests of 90 (ninety) days may be granted by
the building official if the request is made in writing, the project has not changed in scope, the
project has obtained at least one inspection approval AND the applicant pays a fee of $1,000
for each ninety (90) day extension.

Before work can commence or recommence under an expired permit, a new permit application
must be submitted and permit obtained along with all applicable fees applied for this new
project.

All existing projects are subject to this section and will be subject to the conditions listed above.
Section 1505.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 1505.1.1 Real Coverings within ALL Fire Hazard Severity Zones. Any new roof on
a new or existing structure, and any re-roofing of an existing structure of 50% or more of the
total roof area within a one-year period shall be of a fire retardant roof or class A roof.

Section 9.1.1 is added to read as follows:
Section 9.1.1. Amendments to 2010 California Residential Code.
Section R105.3.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R105.3.2 Expiration of Plan Review. Applications for which no permit is issued within
180 days following the date of the application shall expire, and plans and other data submitted
for review may thereafter be returned to the applicant or destroyed by the building official. The
building official may extend the time for action by the applicant for a period not exceeding 180
days on written request by the applicant showing that circumstances beyond control of the
applicant have prevented action from being taken and the extension has been submitted in
writing prior to the expiration date.



If a permit has not been obtained after the first extension, additional extensions of 90 days may
be granted provided the applicant submits this request in writing AND pays a fee equal to
$500.00 of the for each requested 90- day extension and the project has not changed in scope.

Exception: If a project has been approved by the City pending an outside agency approval prior
to expiration, written extensions will not be required.

Section R105.5 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R105.5 Expiration of Permits. Every permit issued by the building official under the
provisions of the technical codes shall expire and become null and void, if the project authorized
by such permit has not achieved an approval for one of the required inspections identified in
Section 110.3 of the 2010 California Building Code within one year of such permit.

The building official may grant a one-time permit extension of 180 (one-hundred eighty) days
provided the applicant submits a request in writing prior to the permit expiration and the project
has not changed in scope. Additional extension requests of 90 (ninety) days may be granted by
the building official if the request is made in writing, the project has not changed in scope, the
project has obtained at least one inspection approval AND the applicant pays a fee of $1,000
for each ninety (90) day extension.

Before work can commence or recommence under an expired permit, a new permit application
must be submitted and permit obtained along with all applicable fees applied for this new
project.

All existing projects are subject to this section and will be subject to the conditions listed above.
Section R313.2 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R313.2 One-and Two-Family Dwellings Automatic Fire Systems. New one- and
two-family dwellings, an automatic residential fire sprinkler system shall be installed, or to which
additions, alterations, or repairs are made that involve the removal or replacement to 50 percent
or greater of the linear length of walls of the building (exterior plus interior) within a one-year
period shall meet the requirements of new construction or this code.

Exception:

(1) One-and two-family dwelling buildings with less than 1500 square feet where an addition
will not increase the total square footage to more than 1500 square feet, unless the increase
involves a second story (in this case, the 50% linear wall length rule would apply to determine if
the project would need an automatic fire sprinkler system).

Section R403.1.3 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R403.1.3 Seismic Reinforcing. Concrete footings located in Seismic Design
Categories DO, D1 and D2, as established in Table R301.2(1), shall have minimum
reinforcement of at least two continuous longitudinal reinforcing bars not smaller than No. 4
bars. Bottom reinforcement shall be located a minimum of 3 inches (76 mm) clear from the
bottom of the footing.



In Seismic Design Categories DO, D1 and D2 where a construction joint is created between a
concrete footing and a stem wall, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be installed at not more
than 4 feet (1219 mm) on center. The vertical bar shall extend to 3 inches (76 mm) clear of the
bottom of the footing, have a standard hook and extend a minimum of 14 inches (357 mm) into
the stem wall.

In Seismic Design Categories DO, D1 and D2 where a grouted masonry stem wall is supported
on a concrete footing and stem wall, a minimum of one No. 4 bar shall be installed at not more
than 4 feet (1219 mm) on center. The vertical bar shall extend to 3 inches (76 mm) clear of the
bottom of the footing and have a standard hook.

In Seismic Design Categories DO, D1 and D2 masonry stem walls without solid grout and
vertical reinforcing are not permitted.

Exception: In detached one- and two-family dwellings which are three stories or less in height
and constructed with stud bearing walls, isolated plain concrete footings supporting columns, or
pedestals are permitted.

Section R902.1.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section R902.1.1 Real Coverings within ALL Fire Hazard Severity Zones. Any new roof on
a new or existing structure, and any re-roofing of an existing structure of 50% or more of the
total roof area within a one-year period shall be of a fire retardant roof or class A roof.

SECTION 4: Chapter 9, § 9-2 of the Monterey City Code is hereby amended by deleting
said section in its entirety and replacing it with the following:

Section 9-2. Amendments to California Plumbing Code.
Section 710.1 is hereby amended to read as follows:

Section 710.1 In every case where the outlet of a trap for a plumbing fixture is installed or
located at an elevation which is less than two feet (2') above the rim of the nearest manhole
uphill from the point of connection of the building sewer to the public sewer in any new or
existing drainage system, approved types of backwater valve, relief vent and cleanout approved
shall be installed in the building sewer at the point of lowest elevation of the ground surface of
the building site outside of the building or at such other location as is permitted by the Building
Inspector, providing that at any such location, the elevation of the ground surface is not less
than two (2") below the lowest trap outlet served by the building sewer.

The installation shall consist of an approved fresh air inlet and a Y branch or combination fitting
installed in sequence in the line of flow from the building. The vent from this fresh air inlet shall
be piped to the ground surface and capped with a vent cap. Provision shall be made by
elevation above the ground or by other means for preventing the obstruction of the vent
opening or the flow of water therein. The cleanout shall be placed as close to the valve as is
practical and shall be piped to within one foot (1") of the ground surface and closed with an
approved cleanout plug. Every existing installation which includes a plumbing fixture trap outlet
which is less than two feet (2') above the rim of the nearest manhole uphill from the point of
connection of the building sewer to the public sewer is hereby declared to be dangerous,
unsanitary and a menace to life, health and property. Whenever it shall come to the attention of
the Building Inspector that such an installation exists, he or she is hereby empowered to order

5



and require that such plumbing outlet be immediately plugged or capped, or that the equipment
described in the preceding paragraph of this section be installed immediately."

SECTION 5: Chapter 13, § 13-0.1 of the Monterey City Code is hereby amended by
deleting said section in its entirety and replacing it with the following:

Section 13-0.1. Adoption of 2010 California Fire Code.

Except as otherwise amended by this chapter, the 2010 California Fire Code, including
Appendices A-J (2009 International Fire Code), is hereby adopted pursuant to Monterey City
Ordinance No. ____ (effective January 1, 2011) and is incorporated in this city code by
reference and made a part hereof as if set forth fully herein.

SECTION 6: Chapter 13, § 13-0.2 of the Monterey City Code is hereby amended by
deleting said section in its entirety and replacing it with the following:

Section 13-0.2. Amendments to 2010 California Fire Code.
Section 101.1 is amended to read as follows:

101.1 Title. These regulations shall be known as the Fire Code of The City of Monterey
hereinafter referred to as "this code."

Section 109.3 is amended to read as follows:

109.3 Violation Penalties. Persons who shall violate any provision of this code or shall fail to
comply with any of the requirements thereof or shall erect, install, alter, repair or do work in
violation of the approved construction documents or directive of the fire code official, or of a
permit or certificate used under provisions of this code, shall be guilty of an infraction,
punishable by a fine not more than five hundred dollars ($500.00). Each day that a violation
continues after due notice has been served shall be deemed a separate offense.

Section 202 is amended to add the following definitions:

ALL WEATHER SURFACE. A road surface constructed to the minimum standards adopted by
the jurisdiction.

Section 304 and 305 to read as follows:
Section 304 — Combustible Materials
Storage and Accumulation of Rubbish and Vegetation

304 Rubbish within Dumpsters. In all rooms or above outside areas, adjacent to
building or underneath roof overhangs or when located nearer than 10 feet to adjacent
property line, used for storage of combustible waste materials in other than Group R,
Division 3 occupancies shall be protected by automatic sprinkler protection. Such
sprinklers may be connected to the domestic water supply, provided sufficient coverage
of the area is provided and an approved accessible shutoff valve is provided for each
room or area.



Exception:

(1) Trash areas adjacent to solid brick or concrete walls with no openings or eaves are not
required to be protected by automatic sprinkler system(s).

Section 305 — Control of Sources of Ignition

305. General. Use of equipment, appliances and open flame devices shall be in accordance
with this section.

(a) The use of any fuel burning or consuming apparatus, electrical device or explosives on
Municipal Wharves No.1 and No.2 shall be prohibited. Such as but not limited to:

1. Generators

2. Oil Burning Equipment

3. Liquefied petroleum gas equipment

4. Lanterns

5. Stoves

6. Heaters

7. Candles

8. Barbecues

This section shall not apply to:

1. Motor vehicles

2. Devices operated or used within buildings located on Municipal Wharves No.1 and
No.2, and fish pumps

3. Any repair or construction undertaken by the City of Monterey, its agents or any public
entity

Section 307 is amended to read as follows:
Section 307 — Incinerators, Open Burning and Commercial Barbecue Pits
Open Burning

307 General. Open burning shall be prohibited including outdoor rubbish fires and bonfires,
unless (1) the fire is confined to an approved container as defined by the Uniform Mechanical
Code and authorized by the Monterey Bay Air Pollution Control District, (2) the open fire is for
the explicit purpose of preparation of food, such as in the case of a luau, barbecue, and the like,
or (3) a special condition or circumstance exists and written authorization is granted by the
Chief.



Section 503 is added as follows:
Section 503 — Fire Apparatus Access
Section 503.2.1 is added as follows:

503.2.1 Dimensions. Fire apparatus access roads shall have an unobstructed width of not less
than 20 feet (6096 mm), exclusive of shoulders, except for approved security gates in
accordance with Section 503.6, and an unobstructed vertical clearance of not less than 13 feet
6 inches (4115 mm).

BRIDGE. A structure to carry a roadway over a depression or obstacle.
Section 503.2.6.1 is added to read as follows:

503.2.6.1 Private Bridge Engineering. Every private bridge hereafter constructed shall meet
the following engineering requirements:

a. The weight shall be designed for a minimum of HS-20 loading as prescribed by the
AASHTO.

b. The unobstructed vertical clearance shall be not less than 15 feet clear.

c. The width shall be a minimum of 20 feet clear. The fire code official may require additional
width when the traffic flow may be restricted or reduce the width to a minimum of 12 feet for
Occupancy Group U or R-3 occupancies.

d. The maximum grade change of the approach to and from any private bridge shall not exceed
8% for a minimum distance of 10 feet.

Section 503.2.6.2 is added to read as follows:

503.2.6.2 Private Bridge Certification. Every private bridge hereafter constructed shall be
engineered by a licensed professional engineer knowledgeable and experienced in the
engineering and design of bridges. Certification that the bridge complies with the design
standards required by this code and the identified standards, and that the bridge was
constructed to those standards, shall be provided by the licensed engineer, in writing, to the fire
code official. Every private bridge, including existing and those constructed under this code,
shall be certified as to its maximum load limits every ten (10) years or whenever deemed
necessary hy the fire code official. Such recertification shall be by a licensed professional
engineer knowledgeable and experienced in the engineering and design of bridges. All fees
charged for the purpose of certification or recertification of private bridges shall be at the
owner's expense.

Section 503.2.7 is amended to read as follows:

503.2.7 Grade. The grade of fire apparatus access roads shall be no greater than 15%
unless specifically approved by the fire code official.

Section 503.2.7.1 is added to read as follows:
503.2.7.1 Paving. All fire apparatus access roads over eight percent (8%) shall be paved with a

minimum 0.17 feet of asphaltic concrete on 0.34 feet of aggregate base. All fire apparatus
access roads over fifteen percent (15%) where approved shall be paved with perpendicularly



grooved concrete.
Section 505 is added to read as follows:
Section 505 — Premises ldentification

505.1 Address Identification. New buildings shall have approved address numbers, building
numbers or approved building identification placed in a position that is plainly legible and visible
from the street or road fronting the property. These numbers shall be Arabic numbers or
alphabetical letters. Numbers shall be a minimum of 4 inches (101.6 mm) high with a minimum
stroke width of 0.5 inch (12.7 mm). Where access is by means of a private road and the
building cannot be viewed from the public way, a monument, pole or other sign or means shall
be used to identify the structure. Large complexes or multiple buildings shall have their address
posted so that it is visible from the street.

Section 506.1 is amended to read as follows:

506.1 Where Required. Where access to or within a structure or an area is restricted because
of secured openings or where immediate access is necessary for life-saving or fire-fighting
purposes, the fire code official is authorized to required a key box or other approved emergency
access device to be installed in an approved location. The key box or other approved
emergency access device shall be of an approved type and shall contain keys or other
information to gain necessary access as required by the fire code official.

Section 507.5.2 is amended to read as follows:

507.5.2 Inspection, Testing and Maintenance. Fire hydrant systems shall be subject to
periodic tests as required by the fire code official. Fire hydrant systems shall be maintained in
an operative condition at all times and shall be repaired where defective. Additions, repairs,
alterations and servicing shall comply with approved standards. When required by the fire code
official, hydrants shall be painted in accordance with the most current edition of NFPA 291.

Section 603.6.6 is added to read as follows:

603.6.6 Spark Arresters. An approved spark arrester shall be installed on all chimneys,
incinerators, smokestacks or similar devices for conveying smoke or hot gases to the outer
air.

Section 901.1.1 is added to read as follows:

901.1.1 Responsibility. The owner of the protected premises shall be responsible for all fire
protection systems within the protected premises, whether existing or installed under this code.

Section 901.4 is amended to read as follows:

901.4 Installation. Fire protection systems shall be maintained in accordance with the original
installation standards for that system. All systems shall be extended, altered, or augmented as
necessary to maintain and continue protection whenever the building is altered, remodeled or
added to. Alterations to the fire protection systems shall be done in accordance with applicable
standards.



Section 901.4.5 is added to read as follows:

901.4.5 Nonoperational Equipment. Any fire protection equipment that is no longer in
service shall be removed.

Section 901.7 is added to read as follows:

901.7 Systems Out of Service. Where a required fire protection system is out of service,
the fire department and the fire code official shall be notified immediately and, where
required by the fire code official, the building shall either be evacuated or an approved fire
watch shall be provided for all occupants left unprotected by the shutdown until the fire
protection system has been returned to service.

Section 903 is amended to read as follows:
Section 903 — Fire Sprinklers
Section 903.2 is amended to read as follows:

903.2 Where Required. Approved automatic sprinkler systems shall be provided in all new
buildings and structures constructed, moved into or relocated within the jurisdiction. Exceptions:
(1) Structures not classified as Group R occupancies and not more than 500 square feet in total
floor area.

The following sections are amended by changing requirements to 500 square feet for fire
sprinkler installation, as follows (the complete text of the section is not provided):

903.2.1.1 Group A-1. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet.

903.2.1.2 Group A-2. Change 5,000 square feet to 500 square feet.

903.2.1.3 Group A-3. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet.

903.2.1.4 Group A-4. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet.

903.2.1.5 Group A-5. Change 1,000 square feet to 500 square feet.

903.2.3 Group E. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet.

903.2.4 Group F-1. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet. Change 2,500 square feet
for woodworking operations to 500 square feet.

903.2.7-1 Group M. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet.

903.2.7-3 Group M. Change 24,000 square feet to 500 square feet.

903.2.9 Group S-1. Change 12,000 square feet to 500 square feet.

903.2.9.1 Repair Garages. Change 10,000 square feet (2 story buildings) and 12,000
square feet (1 story buildings) to 500 square feet.

903.2.9.2 Bulk storage of tires. Change 20,000 cubic feet to 500 square feet.

Section 903.2.8 is amended to read as follows:

903.2.8 Group R. An automatic sprinkler system installed in accordance with Section 903.3
shall be provided in all buildings with a Group R fire area, including, but not limited to, one-and
two-family dwellings, town homes, and manufactured homes and mobile homes located outside
of licensed mobile home parks hereafter constructed, moved into or relocated within the
jurisdiction, including all additions to buildings already equipped with automatic fire sprinkler

10



systems.
Section 903.3.1.1.2 is added to read as follows:

903.3.1.1.2 Elevators. Automatic fire sprinklers shall not be installed at the top of passenger
elevator hoist ways or in the associated passenger elevator mechanical rooms.

903.3.1.1.2.1 Where automatic fire sprinklers are not installed at the top of passenger elevator
hoist ways, heat detectors for the shunt trip mechanism shall not be installed, nor shall smoke
detectors for elevator recall be installed.

903.3.1.1.2.2 Where automatic fire sprinklers are not installed in associated elevator
mechanical rooms, heat detectors for the shunt trip mechanism shall not be installed. A smoke
detector shall be installed for elevator recall.

Section 903.3.1.3 is amended to read as follows:

903.3.1.3 NFPA 13D Sprinkler Systems. Where allowed, automatic sprinkler systems installed
in one-and two-family dwellings shall be installed throughout in accordance with NFPA 13D.

903.3.1 .3.1 All fire sprinkler systems installed in one-and two-family dwellings shall be
tested for leakage by undergoing a hydrostatic test made at 200 psi for two-hour duration.

903.3.1.3.2 Each water system supplying both domestic and fire protection systems shall
have a single indicating-type control valve, arranged to shut off both the domestic and
sprinkler systems. A separate shut-off valve for the domestic system only shall be permitted
to be installed. The location of the control valve shall be approved by the fire code official.

903.3.1.3.6 Local water flow alarms shall be provided on all sprinkler systems. Local water flow
alarms shall be powered from the main kitchen refrigerator circuit. The local water flow alarm
shall be clearly audible from within the master bedroom at an audibility level of not less than 75
dBa. Where no kitchen exists in the building, the water flow alarm shall be powered from the
bathroom lighting circuit.

Section 903.4.1 is amended to read as follows:

903.4.1 Monitoring. Alarm, supervisory and trouble signals shall be distinctly different and shall
be automatically transmitted to an approved central station, remote supervising station or
proprietary supervising station as defined in NFPA 72-2010, or, when approved by the fire code
official, shall sound an audible signal at a constantly attended location.

(Exceptions remain unchanged)

Section 903.4.2 is amended to read as follows:

903.4.2 Alarms. One exterior approved audible device shall be connected to every automatic
sprinkler system in an approved location. Such sprinkler water flow alarm devices shall be
activated by water flow equivalent to the flow of a single sprinkler of the smallest orifice size
installed in the system. Where a building fire alarm system is installed, actuation of the

11



automatic sprinkler system shall actuate the building fire alarm system.

Section 903.4.3 is amended to read as follows:

903.4.3 Floor Control Valves. Approved indicating control valves and water flow switches shall
be provided at the point of connection to the riser on each floor in all buildings over one story in
height, and shall be individually annunciated as approved by the fire code official.

Section 903.6 is amended to read as follows:

903.6 Repairs, Alterations, and Additions. In all buildings, except where otherwise provided
herein in this Section, where the total floor area exceeds five thousand square feet (5000sf), or
which are forty feet (40") or more in height, or which are three or more stories in height, they
shall be made to comply with the provisions of this Section.

In all buildings where the total floor area exceeds five thousand square feet (5000sf), or which
are forty feet (40" or more in height, or which are three or more stories in height, if the repairs
or alterations are made exceeding twenty-five percent of the current market value of the
building and property as shown in the records of the County Assessor within any three hundred
sixty (360) day period shall be made to comply with the provisions of this section.

Exception:

(1) Valuation may also be determined by the replacement costs of the existing structure based
upon the most recent “Building Valuation Data” contained in the “Building Standards” magazine
published by the International Conference of Building Officials. The intent of this exception is to
allow the use of a less restrictive application (if applicable) to determine if repair, alterations or
additions are twenty-five percent (25%) or more of the value of the building.

Definitions.

Repair. It is the reconstruction or renewal of any part of an existing building or structure for the
purpose of its maintenance.

Alteration. It is any change, addition, or modification in construction or occupancy.
Exception: Projects where the sole purpose is for seismic upgrade.

Existing Group R, Division 3 buildings to which additions, alterations, or repairs are made that
involve the removal or replacement to 50 percent or greater of the linear length of walls of the
building (exterior plus interior) within a one-year period shall meet the requirements of new
construction or this code.

Exception:

(1) Group R Division 3 buildings with less than 1500 square feet where an addition will not
increase the total square footage to more than 1500 square feet, unless the increase involves
a second story (in this case, the 50% linear wall length rule would apply to determine if the
project would need an automatic fire sprinkler system).

Section 904.11 is added to existing section.

12



904.11 Non-Conforming Restaurant Cooking Appliances and Fire Extinguishing Systems.
All non-conforming restaurant cooking appliances, hood and duct systems, and fire
extinguishing systems found to exist as of the effective date of this Ordinance shall be made to
conform to the requirements of this Section within ninety (90) days of notification. It shall
thereafter be unlawful for any person to maintain or suffer to be maintained any non-conforming
restaurant cooking appliance, hood and duct system or fire extinguishing system on any
property owned or controlled by said person within the City of Monterey.

Section 907.7.4 is added to read as follows:

907.7.4 Zone Transmittal. Where required by the fire code official, fire alarm signals shall be
transmitted by zone to the supervising station and retransmitted by zone to the public fire
service communications center.

Section 907.8.2 is amended to read as follows:

907.8.2 Completion Documents. The following documentation shall be provided at the time of
acceptance testing for all fire alarm system installations:

1. A record of completion in accordance with NFPA 72.

2. A contractor's statement verifying that the system has been installed in accordance with the
approved plans and specifications, and has been 100% tested in accordance with NFPA 72.

3. A contractor's affidavit of personnel qualifications, indicating that all personnel involved with
the installation of the fire alarm system meet the qualification requirements of the fire code
official.

Section 907.13 is amended to read as follows:

907.13 Access. Access shall be provided to each fire alarm system component for periodic
inspection, maintenance and testing.

Section 3404.4 is added to read as follows:

Section 3404.4 Outdoor Storage of Containers and Portable Tanks. Storage of Class | and
Class Il liquids in aboveground tanks outside of buildings is prohibited within the limits
established by law as the limits of districts in which such storage is prohibited except as
permitted by the Zoning Ordinance.

Exceptions:

1. For marine fueling operations, a maximum of 2000 gallons of diesel fuel may be

stored and dispensed from an above ground tank as approved by the Fire Chief.

2. Storage tanks of 500 gallon maximum capacity may be used only in conjunction with
emergency generators as approved by the Fire Chief.”

Add the following Appendix to read as follows:
APPENDIX M: Standard Fire Conditions for Single Family Dwellings

Section M109 — Defensible Space

13



M 109.1 Standard Defensible Space Requirements. (FIRE 019) Remove combustible
vegetation from within a minimum of 100 feet or to the property line from structures, whichever
is closer. Vegetation shall be no taller than four inches (4") high. Limb trees 6 feet up from
ground. Remove limbs within 10 feet of chimneys. Additional or alternate fire protection
approved by the fire code official may be required to provide reasonable fire safety.
Environmentally sensitive areas may require alternative fire protection, to be determined by the
fire code official and other jurisdictional authorities.

Add the following Appendix to read as follows:
APPENDIX R: Roofs
Section R101 — General

R101 .1 Scope. Applications for the construction or remodel of any buildings shall be subject to
the roofing conditions of this appendix when conditioned by the fire code official.

R101.2 Conflicting Sections. Where provisions in this appendix conflict with other sections of
this code or other appendices, the provisions of this appendix shall prevail unless otherwise
directed by the fire code official.

Section R102 — New Buildings

R102.1 General. (FIRE 026) Roofing requirements for all new buildings shall be a minimum
Class "A" roof assembly as defined by the International Building Code.

R102.2 Very High Hazard Severity Zones. (FIRE 027) Roofing requirements for all new
buildings in Very High Hazard Severity Zones shall be a minimum Class "A" roof assembly as
defined by the International Building Code.

Section R103 — Existing Buildings

R103.1 General. (FIRE 026) Roofing requirements for existing buildings when fifty percent
(50%) or more of the roof area is reroofed within a one-year period after the issuance of a
building permit shall be a minimum Class "B" roof assembly as defined by the International
Building Code. Where there is no permit issued, this section is applicable to buildings
constructed after the effective date of this code and to buildings where fifty percent (50%) or
more of the roof area is reroofed within a one-year period after commencing construction.

R103.2 Very High Hazard Severity Zone. (FIRE 027) Roofing requirements for existing
buildings within a very high hazard severity zone when fifty percent (50%) or more of the roof
area is reroofed within a one-year period after the issuance of a building permit shall be a
minimum Class "A" roof assembly as defined by the International Building Code. Where there is
no permit issued, this section is applicable to such buildings constructed after the effective date
of this code and to buildings where fifty percent 50%) or more of the roof area is reroofed within
a one-year period after commencing construction.

Add the following Appendix to read as follows:

APPENDIX AE: Alternative Energy Systems

14



AE101.1 Scope. Applications for the installation, additions or remodel of alternative energy
system, including but not limited to photovoltaic and wind generation systems, shall be subject
to this appendix when conditioned by the fire code official.

AE101.2 Conflicting Sections. Where provisions in this appendix conflict with other sections
of this code or other appendices, the provisions of this appendix shall prevail unless otherwise
directed by the fire code official.

AE102 Signing and Marking. All photovoltaic systems shall be permanently marked as
specified in this section.

AE102.1 Main Service Disconnect.

a. Main Panel Exterior Marking. A placard is required to be permanently affixed to the main
service disconnect panel. The placard shall be red in color with white capital letters at least 3/4"
in height and in a non-serif font, to read "SOLAR DISCONNECT INSIDE PANEL." The placard
shall be constructed of weather-resistant, durable plastic with engraved letters, or other
approved material.

b. Circuit Disconnecting Means Marking. A permanent label is to be affixed adjacent to the
circuit breaker controlling the inverter or other photovoltaic system electrical controller. The
label shall have contrasting color capital letters at least 3/8" in height and in a non-serif font, to
read "SOLAR DISCONNECT." The label shall be constructed of durable adhesive material or
other approved material.

AE102.2 Direct Current (DC) Conduits, Raceways, Enclosures, Cable Assemblies, and
Junction Boxes.

a. Marking is required on all interior and exterior direct current (DC) conduits, raceways,
enclosures, cable assemblies, and junction boxes.

b. Marking Locations. Marking shall be placed on all DC conduits, raceways, enclosures, and
cable assemblies every ten feet (10'), at turns and above and below penetrations. Marking shall
also be placed on all DC combiner and junction boxes.

c. Marking Content and Format. Marking for DC conduits, raceways, enclosures, cable
assemblies and junction boxes shall be red with white lettering with minimum 3/8" capital letters
in a non-serif font, to read "WARNING: SOLAR CIRCUIT". Marking shall be reflective, weather
resistant, and suitable for the environment. Materials used should be in compliance with UL
Standard 969.

AE102.3 Secondary Power Sources. Where photovoltaic systems are interconnected to
battery systems, generator backup systems, or other secondary power systems, additional
sighage acceptable to the fire code official shall be required indicating the location of the
secondary power source shutoff switch.

AE102.4 Installer Information. Signage acceptable to the fire code official indicating the name
and emergency telephone number of the installing contractor shall be required to be installed
adjacent to the man disconnect.

AE102.5 Inverters. No markings are required for inverters.

15



AE102.6 AC Photovoltaic Systems. AC Photovoltaic Systems shall be marked as specified in
this section.

a. Main Panel Exterior Marking. A placard is required to be permanently affixed to the car
service disconnect panel. The placard shall be red in color with white capital letters at least 3/4"
in height and in a non-serif font, to read "SOLAR DISCONNECT INSIDE PANEL." The placard
shall be constructed of weather resistant, durable plastic with engraved letters, or other
approved material.

b. Circuit Disconnecting Means Marking. A permanent label is to be affixed adjacent to the
circuit breaker controlling the inverter or other photovoltaic system electrical controller. The
label shall have contrasting color capital letters at least 3/8" in height and in a non-serif font, to
read "SOLAR DISCONNECT." The label shall be constructed of durable adhesive material or
other approved material.

AE103 Building Mounted Photovoltaic Systems

AE103.1 All building-or roof-mounted photovoltaic systems shall be installed as specified in this
section.

a. Access, Pathways, and Smoke Ventilation. Access and spacing requirements shall be
observed to ensure emergency access to the roof, provide pathways for specific areas of the
roof, provide for smoke ventilation opportunity areas, and to provide emergency egress from
the roof.

b. Exceptions. Exceptions to the requirements in this section shall be permitted to be granted by
the fire code official where access, pathway or ventilation requirements are reduced due to any
of the following circumstances:

(). Proximity and type of adjacent exposures.

(2). Alternative access opportunities, as from adjoining roofs.

(3). Ground level access to the roof.

(4). Adequate ventilation opportunities below solar arrays.

(5). Adequate ventilation opportunities afforded by module set back from other rooftop
equipment.

(6). Automatic ventilation devices.

(7). New technologies, methods, or other innovations that ensure adequate fire
department access, pathways, and ventilation opportunities.

c. Designation of ridge, hip, and valley does not apply to roofs with 2-in-12 or less pitch.
d. Measurement Conventions. All roof dimensions shall be measured to centerlines.

e. Roof Access Points. Roof access points shall be defined as areas where ladders are not
placed over openings (windows or doors) and are located at strong points of building
construction and in locations where they will not conflict with overhead obstructions (tree limbs,
wires, or signs).

AE103.2 Household Systems (One-and Two-Family Dwellings).
a. Access and Pathways.

(1). Hip Roof Layouts. Modules shall be located in a manner that provides one (1) three
foot (3') wide clear access pathway from the eave to the ridge of each roof slope where the

16



modules are located. The access pathway shall be located at a structurally sound location on
the building, such as a bearing wall.

Exception: Where adjoining roof planes provide a three foot (3') wide clear access
pathway.

(2). Single Ridge Layouts. Modules shall be located in a manner that provides two (2)
three-foot (3') wide access pathways from the eave to the ridge on each roof slope where the
modules are located.

(3). Hip and Valley Layouts. Modules shall be located no closer than one and one-half
feet (1-1/2") to a hip or valley if modules are to be placed on both sides of a hip or valley.
Where modules are located on only one side of a hip or valley that is of equal length, the
modules shall be permitted to be placed directly adjacent to the hip or valley.

b. Ridge Setback. The modules shall be located no higher than one and one-half feet (1-1/2")
below the ridge.

AE103.3 Commercial Systems.
a. Definition. Commercial Systems shall be defined as all photovoltaic systems installed in any
occupancy other than a one and two family dwelling.

b. Alternative Requirements. Where the fire code official determines that the roof configuration
is similar to residential (i.e., townhouses, condominiums, or single-family attached buildings) the
fire code official shall be permitted to make a determination to apply the requirements under
Section AE 1 03.2, above.

c. Access. There shall be a minimum six-foot (6') wide clear perimeter around the edges of the
roof. Exception: If either access to the building is 250" or less, there shall be a minimum four
foot (4') wide clear perimeter around the edges of the roof.

d. Pathways. Pathways shall be established as follows:

(1). Pathways shall be over structural members.

(2). Centerline axis pathways shall be provided in both axes of the roof.

(3). Centerline axis pathways shall run on structural members or Over the next closest
structural member nearest to the center lines of the roof.

(4). Pathways shall be straight line not less than four feet (4') clear to skylights,
ventilation hatches, and/or roof standpipes.

(5). Pathways shall provide not less than four feet (4') clear around roof access
hatches with at least one not less than four foot (4') clear pathway to the parapet or roof
edge.

e. Smoke Ventilation.

(1). Solar arrays shall be no greater than 150 feet by 150 feet in distance in either
axis.

(2). Ventilator options between array sections shall be (a) a pathway eight feet (8') or
greater in width; (b) a pathway four feet (4') or greater in width and bordering on existing roof
skylights or ventilation hatches; or (c) a pathway four feet (4') or greater in width and
bordering four foot by eight foot (4' X 8) "venting cutouts" every twenty feet (20") on
alternating sides of the pathway.

AE104 Location of Direct Current (DC) Conductors.
a. Exterior mounted Direct Current conduits, wiring systems and raceways for photovoltaic

17



circuits shall be located as close as possible to the ridge, hip or valley and from the hip or valley
as directly as possible to an outside wall to reduce trip hazards and maximize ventilation
opportunities.

b. Conduit runs between sub-arrays and to DC combiner boxes shall use design guidelines that
minimize the total amount of conduit by taking the shortest path from the array to the DC
combiner box.

c. DC combiner boxes shall be located so that conduit runs are minimized in the pathways
between arrays.

d. DC wiring shall be run in metallic conduit or raceways when located within enclosed spaces
in a building and shall be run as follows:

(1). When run perpendicular or parallel to load bearing members, a minimum ten-
inch (10") space below roof decking or sheathing shall be maintained.

(2). Where flexible metal conduit (FMC) or metal clad cable (MC) containing PV power
circuit conductors is installed across ceilings or floor joists, the raceway or cable shall be
protected by guard strips.

AE105 Ground Mounted Photovoltaic Systems
AE105.1 Marking. Marking shall be in accordance with Section AE102, above.

AE105.2 Setbacks. Special setback requirements do not apply to ground-mounted,
freestanding photovoltaic arrays. NOTE: The zoning regulations of the jurisdiction regulate
setbacks between buildings, accessory structures (possibly including ground-mounted
photovoltaic arrays) and property lines.

AE105.3 Clearances. A clear area of ten feet (10") around ground-mounted photovoltaic
installations shall be provided.

AE105.4 Non-Combustible Base. A gravel base or other non-combustible base acceptable to
the fire code official shall be installed and maintained under and around the installation.

AE105.6 Fire Sprinkler Protection. Fire sprinkler protection is not required for ground-
mounted photovoltaic installations.

SECTION 7: Chapter 13, § 13-4 of the Monterey City Code is hereby amended to read
as follows:

Section 13-4. Prohibition of Fireworks.

Section 3301 Explosives and Fireworks.

(@) As used herein, the term “fireworks” shall refer to and have the same meaning as that set
forth in Health and Safety Code Section 12511.

(b) The sale, offering for sale, display, possession, or discharge of fireworks by any person or
entity is hereby prohibited.

(c) Fireworks found within Monterey shall be subject to confiscation, turned over to the Fire
Department, and upon conviction, pleas of guilty of nolo contendere, or posting and forfeiting of
bail, shall be disposed of in a safe manner. Violation of this section shall constitute a

18


http://www.leginfo.ca.gov/cgi-bin/displaycode?section=hsc&group=12001-13000&file=12500-12534�

misdemeanor.

(d) The remainder of this section notwithstanding, the possession and discharge of fireworks
for public display by licensed pyrotechnic operators may be permitted if approved by the Fire
Chief. Any person denied such permission may appeal in the same manner and fashion as set
forth in Section 13-3.

SECTION 8: Chapter 13, § 13-6 of the Monterey City Code is hereby amended by
adding an additional exception to Section 13-6 to read as follows:

ARTICLE 2.
CLEAN UP OF HAZARDOUS SUBSTANCES

Section. 13-6. Definitions.

vi. Vehicle operating fluids from a motor vehicle accident less than five (5) gallons including:
gasoline, transmission fluid, motor oil, and radiator fluid.

SECTION 9: All ordinances and parts of ordinances in conflict herewith are hereby
repealed.

SECTION 10: This ordinance shall be in full force and effect on January 28, 2011.

PASSED AND ADOPTED BY THE COUNCIL OF THE CITY OF DEL REY OAKS this
16th day of November, 2010, by the following vote:

AYES: COUNCILMEMBERS:

NOES: COUNCILMEMBERS:

ABSENT: COUNCILMEMBERS:

ABSTAIN: COUNCILMEMBERS:

APPROVED:
ATTEST:
Mayor of said City

City Clerk thereof

19


http://www.codepublishing.com/ca/Monterey/html/Monterey13.html#13-3�

	2010.11.16.AGENDA
	2010.11.16.CLARK ASHTON.PROCLAMATION
	2010.11.16.MRSWMP_Presentation
	CITY OF DEL REY OAKS
	PURPOSE
	RECOMMENDATION


	2010.10.26.CC.MIN
	2010.
	doc  City Council Report  - OCTOBER 2010
	2010.11.16.Claims Report
	2010.11.16.Budget vs Actual
	Sheet1

	2010.11.16.Cash Fund Balance
	Sheet1

	2010.11.16.Capital Outlay budget vs actual
	Sheet1

	2010.11.16.Election.Canvas.Reso
	2010.11.16.Final Word Doc-Staff Report 10_1019 Building Code Ord rev
	ENVIRONMENTAL DETERMINATION
	Council could choose to adopt the revised 2009 Edition of the Building Standards Codes with no changes.  However, the amendments are necessary to address local conditions and to maintain consistency with the City of Pacific Grove.

	2010.11.16.Final Word Doc-Ordinance 10_1019 Bldg Code Ord
	Section 9-0.2. Exemption for Pending Applications.
	ARTICLE 1.5. AMENDMENTS TO UNIFORM CODES
	Section 13-0.1. Adoption of 2010 California Fire Code.

	AE105.2 Setbacks. Special setback requirements do not apply to ground-mounted, freestanding photovoltaic arrays. NOTE: The zoning regulations of the jurisdiction regulate setbacks between buildings, accessory structures (possibly including ground-mou...
	AE105.3 Clearances. A clear area of ten feet (10') around ground-mounted photovoltaic installations shall be provided.
	AE105.4 Non-Combustible Base. A gravel base or other non-combustible base acceptable to the fire code official shall be installed and maintained under and around the installation.
	AE105.6 Fire Sprinkler Protection. Fire sprinkler protection is not required for ground-mounted photovoltaic installations.
	ARTICLE 2. CLEAN UP OF HAZARDOUS SUBSTANCES
	Section. 13-6. Definitions.
	vi. Vehicle operating fluids from a motor vehicle accident less than five (5) gallons including: gasoline, transmission fluid, motor oil, and radiator fluid.




